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It was love, pure and simple, which hit Maggi straight between the eyes, 
when lawyer John Dailey stepped over her threshold-carrying two small 
bundles of joy. John himself, though, aroused feelings in her of a different 
kind. One minute he was infuriating beyond belief, the next charming and 
kind. Maggi had resolved not to give the silver tongued Irishman an inch, 
but their enforced proximity - brought about by the raising of those delicious 
twin baby girls - meant she'd be lucky if, soon, even that distance existed 
between them! 
     



CHAPTER ONE 

MRS DAUGHERTY was one of those difficult women who took to her bed the 
day after her husband died, leaving her a forty-year-old widow. The illness 
lasted forty years, spun out with detailed descriptions of every ache and 
pain, until there were no more neighbours to listen, no more friends to call. 
So she lived on her husband's government pension, spent all her days calling 
radio talk-shows, and her nights writing nasty letters to editors. 

And then she up and died. 

Town gossip in Dartmouth allowed that nobody could have been more 
surprised than Mrs Daugherty herself. Maggi Brennan went to the funeral, 
of course. Being the only in-sight neighbour on Tucker Road, she felt some 
responsibility. 

The funeral was well attended. Curiosity, more than respect, Maggi thought. 
And after the preacher was done, she heard one of a passing couple say, 'I'm 
sure they ought to inscribe on the tombstone, "Well, I told you I didn't feel 
well!"' All of which sent Maggi up Allen Street in her old Jeep Cherokee in 
a somewhat bemused mood. There was a tangle at the traffic-lights at 
Slocum Road. There were two high schools on Slocum, both letting out at 
about the same time, but Maggi was patient. Her house was empty, except 
for dear old Aunt Eduarda. There hadn't been a bed-and- breakfast customer 
in over three weeks, and the springfloods had practically washed her corn 
crop off the side of the hill. 

When the intersection was finally cleared she chuckled at the mass of 
students and their smoky gas- buggies. For there, but for the grace of God 
and twelve years, would Maggi Brennan have gone herself. Well, Maggi 
Paiva in those days. And, still chuckling, she zoomed down the other side of 
the hill to where Allen Street smashed head-on into Tucker Road, at which 
point she turned south. 

The Paiva farm was set back from the road, with only her forlorn advertising 
sign on the road itself. 'Brennan's Bed and Breakfast.' Handpainted, with a 
considerable lack of talent. But she and Robert had laughed when they hung 
it, five years ago. They had spent the month of July hoping no one would 



come, and then Robert had gone off as mate on the fishing trawler Katherine 
Mary, out of New Bedford. 

And had never come back. 

His name had been added to the plaque in the Seamen's Bethel. There 
seemed to be something so desperate about that. He held no place in the 
burial grounds where she might cry. He was just—lost at sea. Five years 
ago. 

It might have been the date that brought tears to Maggi's eyes. The date, or 
Mrs Daugherty's funeral, or the deadly dull mist that was falling, or the fact 
that her parents were in Florida and her two brothers were working in 
Chicago. So for just a moment Maggi let the motor idle while she felt sorry 
for herself, and then, mustering up her practical mind, dried her eyes and 
drove up the narrow unpaved drive and pulled up beside the old farmhouse. 
There was another day to live, in the endless succession of days, and she 
would live it as best she could. 

She climbed out of the car, brushed her burnished auburn curls off her face, 
dabbed at her wet green eyes, and started for the house. Moments later, as if 
he had been following her, an old motor-home pulled up alongside hers, 
facing the swamp, and a tall red- haired man climbed out and came over to 
where she waited, one foot up on the back porch. 

'Do I find Miss Brennan?' he asked. 'Maggi Brennan?' 

Maggi smiled for the first time that day. He had such a delightful Irish 
brogue—restrained, but still present. Robert had been a third-generation 
Irish- American, who could muster a brogue for party purposes only. This 
man sounded so natural, so—nice. 

'Mrs Brennan,' she assured him. 'Margaret. That I am.' 

'Heaven be praised,' he replied. 'I wasn't sure. The good Father pointed you 
out at the funeral. And thank the lord you and your people come from the 
Old Country.' 



'Old Country?' 

'Ireland, of course.' 

'I—think you've made a mistake,' Maggi said. 'I married a Brennan. Before 
that I was a Paiva. My family comes from Portugal.' 

'Oh.' Flatly said, as if he considered Portugal to be the end of the world. 
'Well, it can't be helped. Look, I'll bring them in.' 

'I wish I might know what the devil you're talking about.' Maggi was tired, 
and after the initial interest in his brogue, she was willing to send him about 
his business. Unless—good lord, suppose he wanted bed and breakfast? 
'Are you -looking for accommodations?' she asked tentatively. 

'Me?' He looked disdainfully past her at the house. Built in 1786, it seemed 
to be tired. Originally it had been constructed on an east-to-west line. Now it 
leaned gently southward. The weathered shingles were uniformly grey. 
Fourteen rooms, one bath, and a roof that leaked. The farm itself had long 
since stopped paying for itself; lost travellers looking for a bed for the night 
were few and far between—but necessary. But the way he looked at her 
house gave her the mad inclination to kick his ankle. Never before had she 
seen such a look of sheer disgust. 

'We do have running water,' she said stiffly. 'Duke Patterson stayed here, 
you know.' 

His face lit up. 'The Irish duke?' 

'No, the heavyweight boxer,' she snapped. 'Why don't you--?' She was about 
to tell him just what he could, when another car pulled up into the yard. 'An 
invasion of locusts,' Maggi muttered. 

'Ah, Mrs Brennan! I've finally caught you at home!' 

Maggi struggled with her face, massaging it at least into neutral. One of the 
facets of learning. Her mother was always insistent on politeness, even with 
people you couldn't like. The second man was about five feet eight, 



somewhat rotund, dressed well, and too well known to her for pleasurable 
meeting. He and she were of the same height, but her one-inch heels gave 
her the advantage. 

'You again, Mr Swanson?' Her first urge now seemed more appropriate. She 
should have turned on her heel and walked away, but it was too late. 'This 
makes the third time in two weeks. Surely you must be aware of my decision 
by this time?' 

'But times change,' he said. She hated that cheerful note in his voice. As well 
as the absurd little hairpiece he wore. And his persistence. 

'Well, they haven't yet,' she told him as she folded her arms over each other 
and stood four-square, blocking his movement in every direction but out. 
'And if you were to ask my honest opinion, I don't think they'll ever change 
in the direction you want. I have no intention of selling the farm. Not to 
you!' 

'Tax time coming up soon,' he reminded her, cheerier than ever. 'You'll have 
to have a great deal of ready cash around for that, Mrs Brennan. I'm offering 
a good price, you know.' 

'No, I don't know,' she replied. 'It seems to me when you bought the land at 
Mallow Farm you didn't exactly give Mrs Turner a fair shot, did you? 
Wasn't there some talk about an investigation? The District Attorney? 
Things like that?' 

'All gossip.' He took a backward step, bounced off the Irishman, and nearly 
fell over. 'All gossip, Mrs Brennan. Why, you never saw a happier customer 
than Mrs Turner.' 

'Damn you!' Maggi took a step in his direction, her jade eyes glaring at him. 
'I visit Mrs Turner in the nursing home every Saturday. Don't you tell me 
what a happy customer she was. Get off my land!' 

Old Mike came around the corner of the house at just that moment. One 
hundred and ten pounds of white Dalmatian with black spots, a grey muzzle 
that bespoke his age, and a stiff pair of arthritic hind legs, the dog could, on 



his best days, look fierce indeed. This was one of those days. He ambled 
around the end of the porch, came to a stiff-legged halt, and growled. 

Mr Swanson suddenly remembered a whole host of other appointments, 
which he gabbled about as he backed away from the pair of them, and then 
broke for his car. Mike sat down and began to search out an itch with his 
back paw. Maggi, cheered by the encounter, grinned and started for the 
kitchen door before she remembered her other visitor. He was still there, 
unfortunately, leaning negligently against the side of his van, a broad grin 
on his face. 

'Hounded by salesmen?' he enquired. 'My name is John Dailey, Mrs 
Brennan.' Maggi nodded and folded her arms over her chest, glaring at him. 
Anyone who doesn't like my house doesn't like me, she told herself, and her 
eyes dared him to say something more. 

'State your business, Mr Dailey. I have a million things to do.' 

'Even better, let me show you.' He walked back to the side door of the 
motor-home and lifted out a little bundle, handling it as if it was fragile. 
With the package at his shoulder he walked up on to the porch, brushed by 
her and went in through the open door. Faithful watchdog Mike got up, 
sniffed at the man's heels, and followed him in, tail wagging. 

'Hey, I—just a minute here,' Maggi started to object, but was completely 
ignored. She stood at the door, her eyes following the broad back of him. 
Maggi Brennan had had an ordinary upbringing, mixed with a reasonable 
number of men, and a brief marriage, but somehow was still a little naive for 
twenty-nine. But she possessed the most cynical conscience in 
south-eastern Massachusetts. And just at that moment she took a good look 
at John Dailey and realised just how—ugly he really was! 

'You could close the door.' All of six feet or more, Maggi thought. He wore 
a brown cardigan sweater, jeans, and work-boots. A craggy sort of face. 
Those little semicircle lines that most people sported from nose to mouth in 
his case were deep crevasses. His face might profit by a good ironing, Maggi 
thought. His dark eyes were wide-set, his nose boasted a tiny bump in its 
middle. Dark, deep eyes, and, lord love us, red hair, almost as red as my 



own, she thought. 'There's a draught,' he prompted. A deep voice that 
seemed to rumble after itself, like the fading noises of a thunderstorm. 

'Thunderstorm,' Maggi said, not yet back on an even keel. 

He looked at her quizzically, with his head cocked slightly to one side. 'The 
door,' he repeated, as if addressing some imbecile child. Maggi shook 
herself out of her trance, and managed to close the door. It was a heavy oak 
old-fashioned affair. When it closed it shut off the outside world completely, 
and left the kitchen saturated with silence. From the living-room she could 
hear the sounds of Daffy Duck. Aunt Eduarda was at her usual morning 
entertainment. Formerly an avid participant in life, Aunt Eduarda was a 
retired bilingual schoolteacher, but the loss of her husband some years 
before had divorced her from life, left her gradually withdrawing into 
herself. 

The man was standing with his back towards her. The bundle at his shoulder 
stirred and the soft pink blanket fell back. A tiny face poked out into the 
light, a toothless mouth yawned at Maggi, one large blue eye opened, 
followed immediately by the other, and the baby giggled at her. And with 
that one microsecond of contact Maggi Brennan fell in love. With the child, 
of course. 

Good lord, she thought quickly—a homely man, and a lovely baby. Watch 
out, Maggi Brennan. You always were a sucker for a cute little baby! It was 
a sore subject. She and Robert had spent a riotous honeymoon month in this 
very house, and there had been no baby. Somehow she felt as if God had 
cheated her. One little baby would have made a world of difference. Just 
one little baby. And here it was. God was being good to her, finally. But the 
man upset her, tilted her off her sound, sensible base. 

'What?' The man took a step in Maggi's direction. Self-consciously she 
backed away from him. 'Are you acquainted with children?' he asked. He 
was gently patting the baby's backside. 

'I live here,' Maggi snapped at him. Anger was always a good palliative. 
'This is my home. I don't know a darn thing about babies, and just what in 
the living hell do you think you are doing, Mr Dailey?' 



Aunt Eduarda was partially deaf. Selectively deaf. She seemed to hear 
nothing that didn't suit her, but babies were a favourite subject. She came 
puffing in from the living-room, strong and white-haired and seventy, and 
lively as the day was long. 'What a lovely child, Margaret.' 

Maggi smiled. Aunt Eduarda was a second- generation settler in the land, 
spoke English like a schoolteacher, and Portuguese like a lover, and never 
ever called her Maggi. 

'She is, Auntie, a beautiful child. She belongs to this gentleman. His name is 
Dailey.' 

'Dailey?' Aunt Eduarda's mind was turning over— slowly but inexorably 
turning over. 'No, I don't know any Daileys. I know a d'Avide. Perhaps a 
relative?' 

John Dailey seemed to change from monster to gentleman in the flick of an 
eyelash. Aunt Eduarda put out a wrinkled hand. He took it and cherished it 
in one massive paw, and the smile that lit his face was gentleness indeed. 
'Probably a relative,' he said softly, and his deep bass voice seemed to caress 
the room. 'A great many Irish families have Iberian forebears.' 

'Men have no way with babies,' Maggi heard her aunt say. 'Give me the 
child.' The exchange was made. Dailey stepped back a pace and smiled at 
them both. The baby cooed and snuggled up against the old lady's shoulder. 
But if there's anything I don't need, Maggi thought, it's an attachment to 
this—man. And his child. Something had to be done to break up the mutual 
admiration society. 

'Why don't you ask your wife to come in, Mr Dailey?' 

'I don't happen to have a wife,' he returned. 

'Everyone who has a baby has a wife,' Maggi snapped. 'That's the way it is!' 

'Is it so? Why?' 



Despite her age and her experience in life, Maggi still retained a habit that 
she hated. She blushed easily. As now. Her cheeks turned red, she stuttered, 
and her mind totally deserted her. 'Because!' she muttered. 

And the baby began to cry. With great enthusiasm, her face as red as a beet, 
she wailed for all the world to know. Maggi, who had never dealt with a 
child under six, backed off a step or two. 

'I don't have a wife,' Dailey repeated. 'Here—you hold her. She thrashes 
around a great deal. Her name is Priscilla.' Aunt Eduarda was unwilling to 
give up her prize. She held the baby out with the sort of expression on her 
face that dared Maggi to take it. But Maggi hadn't even considered such an 
act. 

'Me?' Maggi squeaked. Her anxious hands managed to cling to the kicking 
infant as its soft body pressed against her unfamiliar shoulder. The soft 
sweetness of the child was like a hypnotic charm. And don't let the child 
sway you, Maggi insisted to herself, but her caution was already too late. 
'Er—where's the child's mother?' 

'I said that she doesn't have a mother,' he repeated. 'Here, hold her up 
against your shoulder, like so. Now pat her back, gently.' 

'You weren't patting her back,'' Maggi grumbled. 'What a father you are!' 

'I'm not her father, and I wasn't whacking her.' 

'I'm afraid she'll slip off my shoulder,' Maggi said anxiously. She shifted the 
baby into the cradle of her arms, and the infant began to nuzzle at her breast. 
'She's hungry--' 

'She's not hungry, I just fed her ten minutes ago. I know what she wants. 
Stretch her out on the table there and tickle her stomach.' 

Before she could object he walked out, leaving the door open behind him. 
Mike went along, as friendly as a frisky pup. 'Watchdog,' Maggi muttered 
as she paced up and down the room rocking the baby. 'Know-it-all,' she 



grumbled as she watched his back, bent over something else in the car. 
'Nothing I hate worse than an arrogant male know-it-all!' 

But if there was one saving grace within Maggi Brennan it was honesty. 
You can try to fool yourself, she sighed inwardly, but it hardly ever works. 
The man is undoubtedly ugly, but he's all man. The size of him, the swift, 
decisive movement, the certainty of everything he does. He might not 
please Maggi Brennan, but I'll wager you could find fifty women within a 
ten-mile radius whom he would please! Even if some of them might have to 
put a plain brown paper bag over his head in the beginning! 

'Oh, stop that foolishness!' Maggi snapped at herself. The baby, who had 
stopped to catch its breath, started to roar again. 'I wasn't talking to you,' 
Maggi apologised desperately as she laid the child down in the middle of the 
table and began to unwrap the blanket from her. The tiny legs, free of 
entanglement, kicked. One hand went to her chubby baby-face, and her 
thumb went into her mouth. It seemed impossible, but with her mouth full of 
thumb the child was still complaining. Maggi shook her head, disgusted at 
herself, as her mind wandered. Babies. She could hear herself say it. 'I'd 
want four, Robert.' Those had been halcyon summer days, so long ago, 
when their days were full of laughter, and their nights with wonder. But 
when summer died, so did Robert and all her hopes. 

Maggi shuddered. The baby squealed, and managed to work up a real tear. 
Maggi dashed the one out of her own eye and tried a few soothing noises. 
Aunt Eduarda was doing a sort of dance behind her, trying to take over the 
baby's care. Behind her back she could hear John Dailey come back into the 
house. For all his size and weight he moved like some soft-footed panther, 
bypassing her and laying another identical package down beside the first. 

'And this is Prudence,' he said softly as he unwrapped the blanket. Priscilla, 
the crying baby, turned her head slightly to look at Prudence, still asleep. 
Her wandering hands flayed around, then managed to touch those of the 
other child. Her wail dropped off into a cough, and was replaced by a sigh 
and eventually a smile. Prudence opened both her eyes and the two stared 
happily at each other. 

'Like two pins,' Maggi whispered. 



'Identical twins,' John said from behind her. 'They miss each other.' 

'You mean all that crying was because she--' 

'Because Prissy woke up and found that Pru wasn't with her. That's it, Mrs 
Brennan. You don't know a great deal about babies, do you?' 

'I confess, but I could learn,' Maggi admitted as she bent over the gurgling 
pair. 'How do you know which one is which?' 

'I don't,' he said, laughing. 'But 1 hope by the time they get old enough to be 
concerned someone will have learned how to tell them apart.' 

Maggi looked up at him, full of the feeling of sharing. He had bent over with 
her, and now his face was only inches away from her own. She stared at it, 
mesmerised. He had a Roman nose, and that hump in the middle looked as if 
someone might have stepped there—hard. His dark eyes, almost black, were 
as big as limpid pools. He hadn't shaved recently. His beard was as red as his 
hair—and hers. For some reason she had to fight the urge to reach up and 
touch his cheek, but she managed to avoid the impulse. Fine thing, she 
thought. He doesn't have a wife; the children have no mother? What sort of 
biological miracle is this? And—someone will have to learn? Not him, 
someone? What's going on here? 

Prissy—or Pru—hiccupped. Dailey picked up one of them and rearranged 
her on the table, so that the two were side by side, touching, head to foot. 
The babies gurgled for another moment, then, as if on a signal, both pairs of 
blue eyes closed. 'Now, let's get down to business.' 

'Business?' 

'Business,' he repeated. 'It's a little personal. Perhaps we could get your--' 

'Aunt. Aunt Eduarda.' 

'Perhaps we could get Aunt Eduarda to watch the children for just a moment 
while we step next door. There are several things that must be explained to 
you.' 



Her aunt promptly sat down in the rocking-chair and gestured. He gathered 
up both babies and laid them in her arms, across from each other. And then, 
before Maggi could say, 'What the--?' he had her by the arm and ushered her 
into the living-room. 

Feeling besieged, Maggi sat herself down on the sofa. The springs were 
rather old. He took a quick look around the room. It needed no great brain to 
see he was less than impressed, which made her more angry than before. She 
folded her arms and glared up at him as he paced back and forth. 

'Well?' 

'Not well at all,' he said, sighing. 'It's been a difficult week.' 

If he wanted sympathy, he had come to the wrong confessional. Maggi 
leaned back against the sofa, planted her two feet flat on the floor, and 
waited. 

'The babes,' he said, and then hesitated. 'These two little ones are the 
great-grandchildren of Mrs Daugherty,' he said slowly. 'Their mother died 
at their birth. Their father was lost in the Troubles. Arrange-ments had been 
made for the girls to come to live in America with their great-grandmother. 
They have no other living relatives.' 

'You—you're not a relative?' 

'No. Just a courier. The town fathers at Turoshish knew I was coming over 
on business—you know Turoshish?' 

'Not a bit,' grated Maggi. 

'In County Roscommon,' he went on. 'A very poor place. Sending the babes 
to America was beyond their means, but, of course, children under five fly 
for free, and I volunteered--' 

'You? A man? Why couldn't they have sent a nurse?' 



That did finally bring a smile. 'They did—two of them. Most of our Irish 
nurses are already over here,' he said, chuckling. 'Working in the American 
hospitals, they are. The ladies had to go on to their new jobs when the babes 
and I were held up by Immigration.' He stopped in front of her and looked 
down. 'And there's nothing special about two little babes. Any woman could 
care for them, and what any woman can do, a man can do better.' 

Which only added more fuel to Maggi's anger. 'A lot you know,' she 
mumbled. 'But why did you bring them to me?' 

'It was the only thing I could think to do,' he went on. 'We landed in Boston 
and the two tykes were that sick, so we were held up, and, by the time we 
came south to New Bedford, Mrs Daugherty had already passed on.' 

'Which still doesn't answer my question,' Maggi insisted. 'Watch my lips. 
Why did you bring them here?' 

'Ah, and well now, that is the difficult part,' he said grimly. 'I contacted Mrs 
Daugherty's lawyer. The lady left everything to the babes, as you might 
expect. And—er—she appointed you, Mrs Brennan, to be the executor of 
her will—because of your kind heart and disposition, so the will said. So 
that's it. I was commissioned to bring the babes over the water. I've done 
that. You are their legal guardian, and so I'll leave them to you and be on my 
way.' 

'Hey!' Maggi came up out of her chair, shaking. 'Me? Executor? Why, that 
old house of hers is about to fall down any minute—and I don't know a thing 
about babies!' 

'Ah, but you always have your aunt,' he said, as if it all meant nothing more 
to him. 

'Seventy years old and—no, just a minute! Just a darn minute!' She sank 
back in her chair, totally confused. 'How—how do I know you aren't 
making this all up? How do I know that you're not just a— childnapper?' 

'Kidnapper,' he corrected her. 'Yes—bona fides. To be truthful, I'm a 
solicitor. My card.' He fumbled around in the pocket of his jacket. 



'Ah—here.' He handed her a calling card and an envelope that crinkled as 
she touched it. 'From the mayor of Turoshish.' 

Maggi managed to focus her eyes. It was an ornate letter, on high-quality 
paper, and sealed at the bottom with a red wax seal. And she couldn't make 
head nor tail of it. Dear lord, I've been driven mad, she told herself, and now 
I'm going blind! 

'I—can't seem to read this,' she muttered. He leaned over and took it back 
for just a moment. But his eye was caught by her wedding-ring. 'Maybe 
your husband can read it?' 

Maggi swallowed hard. The reminder was too painful, on this particular 
day. 'I'm a widow,' she responded hoarsely. 

'Why, of course,' he said, and that cat-and-mouse smile was back. He leaned 
over her shoulder again. 'They've written this letter all in Gaelic. It's the way 
of things in the western counties.' He patted his coat again and found another 
document. 'But here's a copy of Mrs Daugherty's will and all.' 

Maggi knew for a fact that she wouldn't be able to read that either, no matter 
what language it was in, but she was saved from admitting it. One of the 
babies in the kitchen began to whimper. 

'I can't—settle this in my mind,' she told him faintly. 'I—why—why don't 
you stay overnight, and then maybe I'll get it all straight, and—it's late, and 
you really can't get anywhere from here, and--' And I wouldn't have the 
faintest idea what to do with two little babies, she told herself. Not a darn 
idea! 

'I suppose I could do that,' he said. 'I've become attached to the little ones.' 
For the first time since he had come into the house Maggi Brennan wasn't 
quite sure that she really hated his guts at all. Not quite sure. But it didn't 
really matter. She had fallen head over heels in love—with two little babies. 

  



CHAPTER TWO 

MAGGI rolled out of bed at quarter to six, her normal time, an hour after her 
rooster began his sunrise complaint. It was a long-ingrained habit, seven 
days a week. After all, the egg harvest was presently the only paying 
concern on the farm, and she was a woman who liked to expend her efforts 
on first priorities. But it hurt. Her biorhythms never hit a peak much before 
eleven o'clock. So she fumbled with bare feet on the cold floor, scuffed into 
her slippers, and was actually at her bedroom door before she remembered 
she had guests. 

The upstairs part of the house was quiet; there were noises from downstairs. 
Faint, but noises anyway. Maggi managed to stagger along the upstairs hall 
to the babies' room, guiding her half-blind walk by dragging one hand 
against the wall; the big crib in the nursery was empty. So was John Dailey's 
bed, she noted as she hurried back in the other direction. It was a long 
corridor, and Aunt Eduarda had two rooms at the very end. The nursery was 
midway. And without giving it a thought she had assigned John to the 
bedroom just opposite her own. 

Freudian? she asked herself as she peeped around his half-open door. Of 
course she knew better, and grinned at her own stupidities. It was purely 
accidental, this room assignment. For the life of her, she could barely stand 
Mr Superiority, despite his interesting brogue. One of the difficulties of 
living in a female household for years was the habit of neglecting clothing. 
Had she not stubbed her toe on the hall table, she might well have waltzed 
down to the kitchen in her filmy knee-length silk and lace nightgown. More 
lace than silk, to be honest about it. A detour back into her own room 
secured some cover—an ancient green robe that had fitted her well when 
she was sixteen. 

John had found a use for her old playpen. It was set up in front of the hearth 
in the kitchen, and both the children were lying in it foot to foot, cooing at 
each other, stripped to their nappies. A mobile toy was stretched across the 
playpen, half a dozen plastic butterflies revolving in the heated air. A blaze 
was crackling in the fireplace, and the chimney was drawing well. The tiny 
dancing flames seemed to hypnotise the children. They spared Maggi a grin 
as she walked over to them. 



Mike, the huge Dalmatian, was baby-sitting, stretched out flat on the stone 
flags of the hearth between the flame and the children, and only 
coincidentally in the warmest part of the house. Two empty nursing bottles 
stood in the centre of the table. 'Well, at least you've eaten,' Maggi offered. 
The two children gurgled. 'Where's your dad? I mean—your uncle? I mean, 
your—whatever.' It seemed impossible to refer to him as the courier. The 
children made no translatable response. 

Maggi shivered, not from the cold, but rather because, as they said in Nev. 
England, something had just walked over her grave. She pulled her shabby 
old robe tighter and debated momentarily whether to clean up the kitchen or 
get herself a mug of coffee. Which is to laugh, she told herself. 
Clean-up-the-kitchen comes in dead last any day, and twice that far back 
today! She grumbled as she made for the kettle and burned her finger. 
Someone had left it on the stove, on 'simmer'. Some kind soul. And not Aunt 
Eduarda. She hardly ever got up before noon. 

Whatever else he was, John Dailey was a thoughtful man! It was an idea to 
gnaw on as she made herself a cup of instant decaff. There was a noise from 
outside. With her warm mug cupped between both hands she wandered over 
to the back door and peered out between the ruffles of the curtains. Who 
else? Her Irish courier, of course. 

He was stripped to the waist, glaring down at her dull axe, an ocean of split 
logs surrounding him. Working like a Trojan, she told herself in admiration. 
Cursing like a Trojan too, and wearing only a pair of ragged blue denim 
shorts to cover the essentials. There's more to him than just the average bear, 
she told herself, her mind filled with a strange excitement. 

Robert had stripped well too. But Robert had been tall and thin, built like a 
whippet. This man was solid muscle from shoulder to thighs, like a solidly 
planted fire hydrant. And wasn't it a surprise that she had thought of Robert? 
During the last two years she had seldom recalled Robert's physical 
proportions to mind. Not that she had forgotten him—the memory was too 
precious for that. Rather, he had retreated from the foreground of her mind, 
and occupied a tiny little corner, almost as if he were enshrined in a side 
chapel in the church of her life. In a sense, the thought hurt. Enshrined in an 
out-of-the-way corner! It didn't seem right, but the thought was too painful 



to pursue. She put the idea aside; there would be more time later to examine 
it. 

The crash from outside was Dailey's exclamation point. He threw the axe 
down against the chopping block, where it penetrated half the width of the 
steel head, and the handle vibrated visibly in the early sun— weak sun, 
filtering through mist, like weak tea. And now he stretched as if he meant to 
tear the branches off the apple tree in front of the house. Then he picked up 
an armload of wood and sauntered up the path. 

Maggi felt a strange feeling start at the pit of her stomach and run up her 
back. She suppressed the spasm quickly. Not since Robert died had she 
experienced such a startling feeling. It was not the sort of thing a good 
Catholic widow could consider. That he might drop all that wood just where 
he stood, and--! 'I'm not that kind of girl,' she muttered, in her most superior 
manner—and heartily wished it might be true! 

Don't get caught at the door, she told herself. He'll think the most awful 
things about you! So she backed away in the direction of the gas stove, and 
was smitten by a housekeeping idea. When he banged into the kitchen, 
gleaming with sweat, she handed him the coffee mug she had just filled. He 
took it with a welcoming grin. When she threw one of the kitchen towels 
over his shoulders and began drying him off he nodded again. 

'Nice. A man could get used to this kind of living.' 

'Good morning,' she managed to squeeze out of a partially paralysed throat. 
Somehow, in the doing, she eventually lost the towel. It was minutes before 
her tactile fingers told her she was working on bare flesh. 

'Hey, no need to stop on my account.' A bit of whimsy as he slowly turned to 
face her. 

'Yes, but you'll want a shower,' she stammered. 'Have you had breakfast?' 

'Not since I acquired those two little rascals,' he said, chuckling. 'They take 
up so much time of a morning that I hardly have the chance. Why are you 
staring at me like that?' 



'Because you're—unusual,' she told him honestly. 'You're the only man I 
know who could do for babies the way you do. And you unmarried yourself, 
with no home examples.' She blushed and stepped away from him. Distance 
was a great protector. 'At least, I--' 

'Even Irish girls ask.' He laughed. 'Yes, I'm a bachelor. We tend to marry 
later over there, you know. And besides--' 

Maggi shivered again and hugged herself, sure protection against dragons. 
He walked over to his duffle bag, which lay in the corner, among the variety 
of bags and packages and boxes that a pair of babies required. 

'And besides?' 

'And besides, I had this.' His big hand pulled a tattered old book out of his 
bag and waved it in front of her. 'The Care And Feeding of Babies, by Dr 
Leonard Appleby, Dublin, 1927.' 

'By the book?' she gasped as he advanced on her and thrust it into her arms. 
'You can't raise children by a book! An old book!' 

'Nonsense, Mrs Brennan. Women raise children every day. It's not 
knowledge they get as a prize in their breakfast cereal, you know. And 
anything a woman can do, a man can do better.' He reached overand patted 
the cover of the book. 'Read it. The best instruction you'll ever get.' 

'Some day you're going to have a massive headache,' Maggi told him 
glumly, shaking her head from side to side. 

'How so?' 

'When your skull splits under that swelled head!' 

'Why, you little imp!' At first she thought he might be angry, but the corner 
of his mouth twitched a couple of times, just before he leaned over and 
kissed her. 



Maggi Brennan hadn't been kissed by very many men; Robert had been a 
very possessive husband. But Maggi Paiva had played the game since her 
fourteenth birthday, and knew a thing or two about kissing. Or thought she 
did. 

She had expected a barrage, an assault, from such a big strong man. Instead 
his lips were warm and moist and gentle, teasing at her own. He 
tasted—nice. Her sensitive tongue moved to savour the rest of him; the 
strongly masculine odour filled her nostrils, and awakened some sleeping 
animal deep in her being. It was as if she had awakened from a dream, to 
find herself riding the roller-coaster over at Lincoln Park. 

He was holding her loosely, just enough so she could feel pressure at her 
back, but not close enough to soothe her desire. Maggi could feel a sense of 
loss closing in on her. There was too much space between them. The book in 
her hands tumbled to the floor as she arched up on the tips of her toes and 
flung her hands around his neck. His arms tightened, lifting her slightly off 
her feet, plastering her against the entire length of his body. Her tongue 
penetrated his half- opened mouth as firestorms raged up and down her 
spine. Whimpering, she pressed closer. 

One of his big hands slid down her back, cupping her buttock, lifting her 
higher. Her awakened breasts pressed into his bare chest, separated by only 
the thickness of her old robe. She wriggled herself from side to side against 
him. He groaned—and Prissy began to yell for attention. Or was it Pru? 

The adult pair froze, pinned against each other by the sound, like a pair of 
butterflies on a display board. He broke away from her mouth, still holding 
her. Maggi panted, desperately seeking air, as the fever cooled; he appeared 
calm and collected, in fact a little cold and distant, but there was a gleam in 
his eyes that hadn't been there before. The babies joined together in a duet, 
and a tiny smile formed at the corners of his mouth. Maggi, too tired, too 
bewildered for anything else, hung in his arms, her hungry eyes telling him 
everything—but he wasn't looking. Over her shoulder he was already 
assessing the twins' needs. 

When her feet touched the floor she staggered for a second. The movement 
brought his attention back. And that grin. 



'Well, Maggi,' he said, and she could hear the chuckle behind every word. 
'Lie down here. I want to talk to you.' 

He could not have chosen his words better. They fell on her head like a pan 
of ice-water. Anger replaced want; anger and perhaps a touch of 
embarrassment. 'I'll bet you do!' she snapped as she backed away from him 
and fumbled at the belt of her robe, which had come undone. 'But—but just 
because I'm a widow you needn't think I'm in need of stud service, Mr 
Dailey!' The sentence had started at a whisper and ended up as a full gale as 
her temper escaped control. The babies interrupted her. Their little 
complaints had grown massively, fed by the anger they could hear in the 
adult voice. Maggi clapped one hand across her mouth and stared at him 
through enlarged eyes. 

'No, of course you don't,' he agreed, as he stepped back. A shutter seemed to 
have closed over his face, and the smile disappeared. 'Look, Mrs Brennan,' 
he said as he picked up one of the twins and comforted the child, 'we need to 
be outspoken with each other.' 

Maggi, who had duplicated his move with the other baby, looked at him 
over the child's head cautiously. 'Outspoken?' 

'Outspoken,' he repeated. 'I don't mind staying around for a few days—to 
help you get your feet on the ground, so to speak. Just because I come from 
Ireland doesn't meant that I'm one of those peep-o'- day boys. So please to 
understand this—I'm not eager to rush to the altar myself, nor am I 
interested in operating a stud service for some American widow. So do you 
not be in such a hurry to deny me the things I've never asked for. Right?' 

Maggi was so startled that she almost dropped the baby. 'Thank you very 
much,' she muttered. Squeezing her eyes dry, she summoned up Robert, 
dear laughing, loving Robert. To her total surprise, no picture surfaced. She 
could not, no matter how hard she tried, remember what her dead husband 
looked like. 

It was that shock more than anything else that stiffened her backbone and 
allowed her to move away from him; another moment of sniffling brought 



her tears to an end. He hardly seemed to notice or care how cold she had 
become. 

She put the baby she was holding back down in the playpen. Pru—or was it 
Prissy?—immediately sent up a howl of rage. Ignoring them all, Maggi 
walked over to the back door and slipped on the boots that waited in that 
dark corner, then shrugged herself into the cape that hung behind the door. 

'And what are you up to now?' he asked. The frown had spread from his lips 
across his whole rugged face. 'The children--' 

'This is a farm,' she snapped at him. 'If the hens don't lay, we don't eat. And 
they won't lay if they're not fed.' With which she slammed the door behind 
her and marched off up the hill to the chicken coops. There were four of 
them, two hundred hens, and four roosters. She hated every inch of the 
coops, and every feather of the birds, but they were her last resort. 

'Nobody can made a living from farming around here,' her father had told 
her two years before. 'Look around you, child. All you're doing is working 
yourself to death. Houses, that's the growing thing these days. Sell off the 
land and live on the proceeds.' 

'Sell off Grandpa's farm?' 

'He wouldn't turn over in his grave, dear,' her mother had coaxed. 'Your 
grandfather was a very practical man. He knew the jig was up when his own 
son refused to farm and became a computer analyst.' 

But Maggi had grown up close to her grandpa, and treasured what he 
treasured, and although she recognised that designing computer programs 
was a highly profitable trade, her stubborn mind refused to give in. So while 
she filled the feeders with mash and gathered the eggs and cursed the smell, 
she thought about Grandpa, and resolved two things. First, if she was bound 
to handle the twins she would learn how, and second, just as soon as 
possible she would get rid of this imperious Irish lawyer. 'After all,' she told 
herself, 'lawyering isn't a very respectable trade. As Uncle Jaoa always said, 
lawyering rates just below used-car salesmen these days!' Since Uncle Jaoa 
was himself a lawyer, he should know! 



An hour later she had no further time for tears. The twelve dozen fresh 
brown eggs were packaged and waiting for the supermarket pick-up, the 
hens were all fed, the coops swept out, the barn cat fed, and her back hurt. 

She stretched mightily, then stopped just long enough to look up the hill, at 
the broad spread of eighteen acres of cornfield. Sweetcorn, the kind called 
'bread-and-butter' corn. Eighteen acres, all harrowed and planted and prayed 
over. And all the seed swept out of it and down the hill in the massive 
flooding rains of two weeks ago. A total loss, including the price of the seed. 
Shaking her head disgustedly, her mind burrowing at other solutions to her 
innumerable problems, she dragged her feet down to the kitchen door, 
kicked off her boots, and walked in. 

John Dailey looked up as if she had merely stepped out to powder her nose. 
'Breakfast,' he said, as if it were some major operation. 'Oatmeal.' And now 
each of the adults had a twin in one hand, a plastic spoon in the other, and 
were shovelling cereal mixed in warm milk as if feeding the furnace of an 
old-fashioned steam locomotive. 

'How the devil do you know when she's full?' Maggi asked plaintively. 

'She'll tell you,' John replied. 'Only allow a little more time between 
spoonfuls. She'll end up with wind pains.' 

'Yeah, sure. When I slow down she gives me that dirty look, as if I were 
stealing the stuff off her plate!' Curiously, Maggi had forgotten for the 
moment all her anger and fears and disgust. Feeding babies was a simple 
thing. Why should it be so interesting? 

'Be firm. She's only a baby. And stop to let her take a deep breath now and 
again, like I'm doing.' 

'She's—you know she just spat up all over your shoulder?' 

'That's why the nappy between my shoulder and her mouth. Lord, don't you 
know anything?' 



'I was an only child,' Maggi announced huffily. It wasn't true, but she had to 
say something to this impossible man. 

'Well, don't feed her any more. Once she starts to spit it up she's obviously 
full.' 

'They ought to put a gauge on the outside,' Maggi muttered as she watched 
him out of the corner of her eyes. There was no doubt about it, the man had 
the knack. And you have to love a man who loves kids like that, don't you? 
she thought, and then quickly answered herself. Hell, no, you don't have to! 

By nine o'clock the babies were both fed, exercised, loved. 'And now it's 
time for their bath,' he announced. 

'Bath? In the morning? In the tub?' 

'Yes, yes, and no,' he replied. 'They need a bath because they're dirty, I like 
to do it in the morning because that suits me, and no, not in the tub. You 
have a big kitchen sink there, and I thought we could use that. It's wide 
enough for the two of them.' 

'Did you know that -you're an infuriating man?' she asked, tight-lipped. 

He gave her a grin, an infuriating grin, as he tested the water in the sink with 
his elbow, and then picked up Pru—or Prissy. 'Watch carefully? Here's how 
you do it.' 

 

By eleven o'clock Maggi was exhausted. The twins were cooing at each 
other on the rug in the living- room. Which had required a complete and 
sanitary house-cleaning—the sort of thing Maggi applied often. Sometimes 
as often as twice a year. The little music box inside the teddy bear played 
'Take Me Out to the Ball Game'. Mike had taken up his watchdog role 
between the children and the fireplace. The old grates and fenders and 
fireguards had been resurrected from the attic, polished, set up. The kitchen 
had been cleared and washed and pummelled until John Dailey was 
satisfied. And Maggi, reduced to being the scrubwoman in her own house, 



went over to the big captain's chair and flopped into it like a puppet whose 
strings had been cut. And by this time John was beginning to look, in her 
imagination, like the Hunchback of Notre Dame, with none of the 
Hunchback's redeeming features. 

He stalked around the kitchen one more time. 'We have to be absolutely 
antiseptic about things,' he murmured, as he checked the container in which 
half a dozen bottles were being sterilised; weighed the kettle that was 
boiling more water for tomorrow's formulas; pulled out a dozen or more 
little bottles of baby food and stacked them on the shelf. 'We've got to go 
shopping pretty soon.' 

'Yeah, sure,' said Maggi as she finger-combed her hair and settled back 
against the chair rest. Eleven o'clock, and you're not even dressed, her 
conscience nagged. And you're falling out of that nightgown. You need to 
get into a conditioning programme! And since Dailey had just sauntered out 
the door and left 'going to take a shower' hanging on the air behind him, she 
felt justified in mumbling, 'For heaven's sake, what a slave-driver the man 
is!' 

That was the cue for the telephone to ring. It was a wall telephone, across on 
the other side of the room. The two children squirmed around at the sound, 
and for a second it looked as if Prissy was going to cry. It had to be Prissy, 
Maggi had decided. Prissy had more hair than Prudence; three or perhaps 
four long strands more. Of course, you had to look closely. Neither one had 
a lot going in the hair department; what they had was blonde, and hard to see 
in any case. And while she was considering this the telephone rang again. 
And this time it was Pru who formed a tight little mouth and swelled up 
prepared to yell. 

Maggi pulled herself to her feet, all the while making soothing noises, and 
managed to snatch the instrument up before it rang again. 'Hello,' she said 
angrily. 'You're disturbing my babies!' 

'Well, really, Mrs Brennan.' The man at the other end sounded as if he might 
have been shocked. Maggi was convinced that she didn't care a bean for him 
or his shock. 



'And just who are you?' she demanded with all the disdain of a New England 
matriarch. 

'Er—Mr Small,' he said. 'Of the firm of Small, Small, and Ditmore, Mrs 
Brennan. We were, until her death, Mrs Daugherty's lawyers.' 

'Were you really?' Maggi was almost shouting. 'You're the mob that steered 
all this trouble in my direction? What in the world did you mean by 
appointing me executor?' 

'You mustn't yell with babies in the house,' said Aunt Eduarda as she hurried 
down the stairs and cuddled the child who was yelling. Maggi waved an 
impatient hand. 

'Do I—er—take it that the babies have arrived?' the voice on the telephone 
asked. 

'You can take it any darn way you want,' Maggi snapped. 'What in the world 
did you think you were doing?' 

'It was Mrs Daugherty's idea entirely,' the lawyer defended. 'Your name was 
on her lips immediately. The only Christian woman left in Dartmouth, Mrs 
Daugherty insisted. She used to tell us how you brought her dinner one day 
when she was sick.' 

'Lovely babies.' Aunt Eduarda chortled. 'This one reminds me of you when 
you were—but, oh, dear, you always had such a temper!' 

'Spare me,' Maggi muttered to her aunt. 'Yes, they're adorable.' And then 
into the impatient telephone she said, 'Once in ten years, would you believe? 
The ambulance brought her home from the hospital. How could I help but 
do something? I made her up a tray of left-overs and--' 

'And left your name forever in her mind,' the lawyer said. He made a 
peculiar noise. It might have been laughter. 



'Not funny,' Maggi grumbled. 'Not funny at all. What the devil do I know 
about raising kids? And two of them at the same time! There ought to be a 
law!' 

'Ah—well,' the lawyer said, 'there is nothing in the will that requires you to 
be a baby-sitter, Mrs Brennan. All you are required to do is administer the 
estate. You might, for example, turn the children over to the State division 
of Child Services.' 

'I couldn't do that,' Maggi snapped. 'Turn these two little darlings over to 
some State orphanage or something? Never!' 

'A commendable attitude.' Mr Small cleared his throat. 'Perhaps you could 
hire someone to help out? Someone who might have—temporarily, of 
course— a reason to stay in the area?' 

'I couldn't afford it,' said Maggi, discouraged. 'I can barely--' Feed myself, 
was the rest of the sentence, but there was no sense in broadcasting all her 
problems to the world. 

'But—if you are considering the sale of Mrs Daugherty's house,' the lawyer 
continued, 'there would be a prospective income. With houses going the 
way they are this month, I suppose you might get a hundred thousand dollars 
for it. And we, of coarse, would be willing to advance on that prospect, Mrs 
Brennan. Would you like us to put the house on the market?' 

'On the market?' Maggi's mind had gone scrambled again. 'It's falling down! 
It's almost two hundred years old!' 

'Ah,' the lawyer said, and that dry chuckle came through the wires again. 
'Then let's say a hundred forty thousand. Antiques draw much higher prices 
these days.' 

'And the roof leaks.' 

'All the better, Mrs Brennan. It would be a challenging bargain. Shall we?' 

'Just like that? I decide?' 



'Just like that, Mrs Brennan.' 

'And—what do you get out of it?' Scattered brains or no, Maggi Brennan's 
practical streak was still there. 

'Oh, we might make a dollar or two,' the lawyer said. 'Six per cent sales 
commission from the estate, perhaps eight per cent from the buyer, an odd 
penny or two for filing and fees and little things of that nature. You needn't 
worry about us, my dear.' 

'Dear heaven, no,' mumbled Maggi. 'No—I mean yes. But all that money 
belongs to the babies. I can't just--' 

'No, you can't just,' Mr Small interrupted. 'You are limited to disbursement 
of funds entirely for the use of the children. As I said, you could hire a 
babysitter. The estate would pay for the children's food and clothing, and for 
anything required because of having the children in your home. For 
example, babies require a great deal of clothes washing. A washing- 
machine might be acceptable.' 

'And leaks in my roof?' Maggi asked wistfully. 

Another of those dry chuckles which might have been a laugh came down 
the telephone line. 'No,' Mr Small said. 'Repair a leak in their roof, yes; in 
your roof, no. After all, this is a very small estate, and there are still medical 
bills to be paid.' 

'And you would advance me something to carry me through until the sale is 
final?' 

'The estate would, of course.' Mr Small mentioned a monthly sum that 
caused Maggi almost to bite her tongue. 

'I—er—yes,' she said, sighing. 'Almost at once?' 

'Almost at once. We shall send you your first maintenance cheque by the 
first of the week. Mrs Brennan? Mrs Brennan?' 



'Yes,' Maggi said firmly, but with a queer quirk in her voice. Money. 
Income. Hire somebody. 'I'm still here. Yes, sell—if you please.' A hand 
reached over her shoulder and covered the telephone mouthpiece. A very 
large hand. 

'Trouble?' John Dailey asked softly. 

'Nothing to speak of,' she returned, looking him up and down speculatively. 
Hire a lawyer? Well, in the United States he wasn't a lawyer. He was 
unemployed, for a fact. Of course, shaved and showered and dressed, he 
looked to be some high-priced unemployed. I'll ask him, she told herself. 
But not this minute. Not falling out of my nightgown while he's dressed like 
some country lord. 

She turned her attention back to the telephone. 'Yes, Mr Small,' she said, and 
sat holding the telephone instrument for some minutes after the other end 
had been disconnected. The lord does provide, she told herself, but with 
some limitations. Consider the lilies of the field? But in peculiar ways. 

'I'd like to talk to you about something important,' she told Dailey in her 
most prim and prissy voice. 'After I dress, of course.' 

'Of course.' He smiled down at her, and she could hardly help but note that it 
wasn't her emerald eyes he was staring at. It was the soft white corner of her 
breast, almost slipping its halter. No, he's notinterested in such things', she 
told herself sarcastically as she got out of her chair and went around him, 
heading for the stairs. Aunt Eduarda sat in the rocking-chair, mindlessly 
cuddling one of the girls, while John played with the other. 

It was cool as she went up. May had come with bright sunny days, but away 
from the warmth of the fireplace one could raise goosebumps. Or were all 
those the result of this insane 'John-attack' through which she had just 
suffered? It was a question that haunted her as she went into the bathroom 
and stripped. Or perhaps it was John himself that haunted her? There was 
something more to all this than his indisputable male charisma. Of that there 
was plenty. 



'And you, girl, are just ripe for that,' she told herself as she turned on the hot 
water and stepped into the shower. 'Over-ripe.' She used her Irish Spring 
soap with enthusiasm. It left a wonderful odour behind it, and she wanted all 
the advantages she could get. If you're thinking of this as a war between the 
sexes, she told herself, forget about it and surrender. You're unarmed. It'll 
save a lot of time and bother! 

'Hah!' Mrs Robert Brennan retorted as she reached for the shampoo. Her 
wedding-ring glistened in the rain of water, but the hand that wore it moved 
to her own capacious breast and caressed it and remembered. And forgot 
what her name was. From force of habit she snatched up a towel and 
wrapped it around her waist, picked up her handful of nightclothes, and 
marched smartly out into the hall, heading for her room. Directly in front of 
her John Dailey stood with his mouth half open, a look of complete surprise 
on his face. He recovered first. 

'I came up to get clothing for the girls,' he said. It was obvious that wasn't 
what was on his mind, but Maggi was so surprised herself that she wasn't 
thinking clearly. 'I'm going to take them for a walk.' 

She arched her eyebrows, and stood there in front of him, a lovely vision of 
a great deal of adult female. Evidently he thought so too. 

'Lovely view,' he said gruffly, as if there were something caught in his 
throat. She followed the direction of his eyes, turning her head slowly 
downward, to where the rounded rise of her firm breasts were definitely his 
target. 

'Oh, help,' she muttered, and fled for her own room. As she slammed the 
door behind her she could hear that laugh, deep, strong, earth-shaking. It 
hung in her ears for a long time as she huddled herself up on her bed, totally 
ashamed of herself, and yet— perhaps a little proud! 

 

When she came back down some considerable time later she was dressed 
from neck to ankle—a loose- fitting white cotton blouse with a frill of 
ruffles down the front, a pair of navy blue trousers, which might have been 



just the slightest bit too tight, and a wide leather belt to mark off a waist that 
needed no marking. And shoes with two-inch heels, because a girl needed 
some protective camouflage when dealing with such a tall man—such a big 
man. Such a troublesome man! 

He was sitting in the living-room, having started a second fire. The twins 
were sprawled out in abandon on the rug. He put down the morning paper 
when she came in. 'I took them for a walk,' he said, like some judge 
condemning a prisoner to death. 'All by myself. 

And fed them lunch.' And where have you been, was the unexpressed 
thought. 

'I—took a little longer than usual,' she explained, and then blushed at the 
need to. What did he have to say about it? He was only a bed-and-breakfast 
guest in her house, for goodness' sake. He and his two lovely little babies! I 
could kick him out and keep the babies? she thought. 

'No matter.' He waved her half-hearted comment aside. 'We need to talk 
business.' My house, she emphasised to herself as she walked across the 
room to the over-stuffed chair furthest from his seat on the sofa. I'm in 
charge in these parts! 

'We do need to talk business,' she said pertly. She set both feet firmly and 
flat on the floor, the heels trim and on line, brushed down her blouse, and 
squared her shoulders. 'I'm not quite sure I understand all this business about 
visas,' she began. He offered a smile and nodded. 'Just where do you—and 
the children—stand?' 

'Well, the children have no problem,' he said. 'Their father was an American 
citizen, their mother held a green card, and their grandmother, of course, is a 
citizen. The INS, the Immigration and Naturalisation Service, had 
recognised the children as citizens. Oh, there may be a little paperwork here 
and there, but nothing more.' 

'And for yourself?' 



'Ah, for myself,' he said, settling back down in his chair and extending his 
long legs in front of him. 'Somewhat different. I have come over on a ninety- 
day tourist visa, to conduct some business. At the end of that time I must 
return. Unless, of course, I were to find myself some recognised 
employment--' 

'Not lawyering?' 

'As you say, not lawyering. You Yankees seem to have enough of your own 
lawyers.' 

'What other trades might bring you more security?' 

'Hard to say,' he said, chuckling. 'I'm not well trained in other lines. I can 
farm; the United States doesn't need farmers. What they want are people 
who are—oh, qualified tradesmen. Plumbers, nurses, repairmen. Or 
someone willing to work in trades Americans want but won't work at. 
Things like maids and nannies and service people—you know the sort of 
thing I mean?' 

Maggi very carefully crossed both sets of fingers on both hands. What she 
was about to propose was as stupid an idea as anyone could wish for. Only a 
woman with her back to the wall could think of offering. Only a woman who 
had come to completely love two little infants, and hadn't the training or 
money to keep them, could consider the idea. Only a woman who was 
unable to sort out her feelings for a strange Irish con-man could offer. 

'Mr Dailey,' she said softly, 'would you consider working for me as a 
nanny?' 

Instead of rising in wrath, he smiled at her and shifted his massive weight in 
his chair. 'I thought you'd never ask,' he replied. 

'Only temporarily,' she added hurriedly. 

'As you say, only temporarily,' he agreed, and sighed a tremendous sigh, as if 
he had been holding his breath for some period of time. 



CHAPTER THREE 

'I THINK I'm just too tired,' Maggi complained as he urged her out of the 
door. They were celebrating the end of their first two weeks together, she 
and John and the babies, and he had threatened mayhem if they didn't get out 
of the house for a time. 'I never realised how much trouble a pair of babies 
can be. How in the world does a natural mother survive?' 

'By mobilising all her family, her friends, and especially the grandmothers,' 
he told her. 'You've been cooped up in that house now for too long. So today 
we go touring.' 

'And make more work for me—I mean, for ourselves?' 

'It's illegal and unwise to give kids morphine,' he said, chuckling. 'But once 
this van gets moving you'll see that travel puts them right to sleep. They love 
the sound of the open road. Now hop in and buckle up, lady.' The battered 
old van had succumbed to considerable washing and polishing, and now 
looked quite attractive. 

Maggi found it hard not to obey as she climbed up into the high front seat, 
pushing the lunch basket ahead of her. He just seemed to overwhelm one, 
and that bothered her. She shifted uneasily in the bucket seat and looked 
around. The twins were already aboard, each strapped into a complicated 
child-seat behind the driver's cubicle. They seemed none the worse for wear. 
Aunt Eduarda had opted out. Much as she loved children, she loved her soap 
operas more. Riding shotgun, so to speak, was Mike. He was sprawled out 
flat in the narrow corridor leading back to the van's self-contained bathroom 
and bedroom facility. Her dog offered her a vague tail-wag before closing 
his eyes. 'Some protection you are!' she muttered as the van bounced down 
and up under John's considerable weight. She watched the man warily out of 
the corner of her eye. He had slammed the midships door behind him, and 
was coming forward, checking every detail, much as an aeroplane pilot 
might. It was a reassuring little gesture. 

It all seemed so natural as he bent over each child and checked the 
safety-belts, but when he came all the way forward and did the same for her, 
Maggi was shattered. Inadvertently or otherwise, his elbow brushed across 



her breasts as he performed the simple check. She caught her breath as 
sensation replaced reflection. He must have heard her quick hissing intake, 
because he stopped for a second and smiled at her. Not until he buckled 
himself into the driver's seat was Maggi able to draw another breath. And he 
heard that too. 

Maggi knew she had one massive problem. It had appeared at her shoulder 
every morning for the past two weeks: a bed torn and twisted from the 
violence of her dreams. A body soaked with perspiration. Muscles aching. 
All purely physical, she reminded herself firmly. The reason why good little 
virgins stayed 'good' was that they didn't know what they were missing! And 
Maggi, with one month of wedded bliss behind her, had found that 
experience too wonderful to ignore. Only the fact that she really hated this 
man kept her from—whatever one wanted to call it. 

Brazen it out, she decided. Explore his weaknesses—if any. 'You've had a 
great deal of experience driving wide-based vehicles like this?' 

'You bet.' His hand moved among the array of switches and gears, and the 
motor fired up and settled down. 'I've been driving this monster for--' he 
leaned forward to read one of the meters '—for one hundred and thirty-two 
miles!' 

It wasn't a tremendous mileage, on the American scale. 'But you've had 
plenty of experience in other big vans like this one?' she asked hesitantly. 

'No. I always liked a small car—sports cars when I could afford them. But 
you needn't worry, I can handle this little darlin'. It's only thirty-one feet 
long, anyway. As easy as catching Paddy's pig.' 

'Yes, of course,' she mumbled, not knowing a great deal about pigs, and 
nothing at all about Paddy. She pulled her seatbelt up another notch, wiped 
off the clammy palms of her hands and then locked them securely around 
the edges of her seat. 

'I wouldn't want you to have a heart attack,' he commented as he went about 
the business of turning the van around. 'If you don't mind, lean back in your 
chair. I have to use that mirror outside your window to see what's going on.' 



'I'm not the class idiot,' she told him huffily, and gave him the back of her 
head while she looked out the window. 

'Ah, a girl of spirit,' he drawled. Maggi shrugged her shoulders at him. He 
was, after all, only an employee. But after he had made his sixth attempt to 
turn around in the narrow yard outside the house, she could not suppress the 
giggle. 

'Why don't you drive up to the barn?' she suggested. 'There's a lot more 
space up there.' 

'I was just going to do that,' he grumbled. 'I've been practising down here in 
case we run into a problem on narrow streets. And there's nothing I hate 
worse than a female know-it-all.' 

'How nice for you,' she murmured, and turned back to contemplate the 
surrounding property. She could hear him chuckle behind her back as the 
van moved smoothly up the hill and turned easily in the great circle in front 
of the barn. He pulled to a stop, however, just as he had the nose of the 
vehicle pointed in the right direction. One of the babies behind them stirred 
and fretted. 

'Just as good as opium?' she asked sarcastically. 

'Well, when we hit the open road,' he returned. She had forced herself to turn 
in his direction. One could hardly carry on a conversation with one's back 
turned. That was one of the many things she knew about etiquette. Her 
mother, descended from a long line of Yankees—down-east Yankees, that 
was, not the general term used all over the world—had brought to her 
marriage a single copy of Mrs Godey's Ladies' Book, printed in 1886. It 
contained everything there was to know about manners. And then she had 
spent endless hours teaching her daughter the difference between absolute 
right and all those half-truths. 

'So how do we get there?' John added. 

'How do we get where?' 



'You mean I didn't tell you?' 

'Mr Dailey,' she snapped, 'despite the fact that I'm the employer in these 
parts, you've been issuing orders all morning. I don't take to receiving 
orders. Not once have you said anything about where you want to go!' 

Take that,' he said under his breath, and grinned. 'Would you feel better if 
you could slap my face?' 

And that, curiously, answered her .other question. The one she had been 
hiding in the back of her mind. He isn't really ugly at all, she told herself. 
Those crevasses—if they were a little shorter they could be dimples! He's 
never going to be handsome, not ever. But he certainly looks to 
be—dependable? Trustworthy? What was it that Mother always said? A girl 
must be neat and good-looking; a boy only needs to be employed! 

'Well?' he asked. 

'N-no,' she stammered. 'Why would I want to--? No, it wouldn't make me 
feel better. Where do you want to go?' 

'I want to see the fishing fleet,' he said. 'I've heard about the New Bedford 
fleet for years. Biggest in the country, I hear?' 

'Maybe not the way you mean it,' she replied. 'It may not have the largest 
number of boats, but its catches bring in the most money of any port in the 
country. You don't—you don't want to go down to the wharfs and crawl 
around among the boats and things like that? I haven't done that in years.' A 
deep sigh accompanied the statement. There were too many remembrances 
down among the wharfs. 

He gave her a quizzical look. 'I'd be satisfied just to look. It's just curiosity, I 
don't intend to go into the business. I suppose you know all about it?' 

'I did once. But after—well, I just couldn't bring myself to ' 

He slowed the van and came to a stop so he could look over at her. There 
was more sympathy in his voice than she might have expected. 'I'm sorry, 



Maggi, I made a bad choice of subjects. I keep forgetting about your 
husband. Please forgive me.' 

And so do I, Maggi thought glumly. Keep forgetting Robert, I mean. And 
John sounds so—concerned. He's much like Robert, really. Big and strong 
and not exactly handsome. Kind. 'I wouldn't want to disappoint you,' she 
said. 'There's a place out on the bridge where we could see the whole 
harbour. Would that do?' 

It would. So she furnished him directions, the van started rolling, the babies 
were lulled into sleep, and the sun seemed to shine a little brighter. Heading 
north on Tucker Road, she pointed out all the sights to be seen in the small, 
widely scattered country town of Dartmouth. Housing was springing up 
everywhere on the right-hand side of the road, while the land to the left 
swooped down to the Paskamansett River. A brook, it would probably have 
been called elsewhere; river was somewhat overdoing it. John nodded 
politely as she pointed out the post office, stared at the fire station when they 
came to busy Route Six, and made appropriately respectful noises when 
they turned east and headed for the city. 

'You didn't mention that hellacious traffic jam behind us,' he said, 
chuckling, as they climbed the hill beside the Country Club. 

'No,' she said glumly. 'That's the Dartmouth Mall. Some of us would rather 
forget its existence. That whole area was once a delightful little country 
corner, with the river, a watermill, and—they've cemented everything over. 
Of course, it adds considerably to our tax base.' 

'All in the name of progress?' 

'All in the name of progress. That building over there is where I spent my 
high school .years.' 

'A year or two ago,' he teased as they went down the hill. The idea startled 
her. She knew he was teasing, and yet—how very nicely it was done! 

'To be honest--' 



'No,' he interrupted. 'Let's not be honest today. Let's just enjoy. This is the 
city limit?' 

'Just right there.' She pointed to the marker, and the little pond that marked 
Buttonwood Park, the city's biggest recreation area. 

'We seem to be going up and down, and not very forward,' he questioned as 
they started downhill again at Kempton Street. 

'A series of ridges,' she explained. 'They run parallel to New Bedford 
harbour. I forget the exact dimensions, but the city is about twelve miles 
long and two miles wide—something like that. Founded in the 1770s, and 
became the world's biggest whaling centre. That's where we get the name, 
the Whaling City. All gone. There now, dead ahead, that's the harbour.' 

They were poised at the top of the hill at County Street, where urban 
renewal and change had opened a view to part of the tidal harbour. 

He had nothing more to say as he manoeuvred them down the final hill and 
on to the bridge that connected New Bedford with the town of Fairhaven, on 
the other side of the harbour. When, at her direction, he pulled off the road 
into tiny Marine Park, he brought the van to a stop, breathed a sigh of relief, 
and patted the steering-wheel. 

'Well, we fooled 'em again,' he told the van. 

'What?' 

'When I leased this van they bet me I'd pile it up in three months,' he said, 
chuckling. 'And we fooled 'em again. Come on, let's walk around.' 

'I—wish you had told me that an hour ago. I'm sure I could have found 
something that I just had to be doing—elsewhere!' The quaver in her voice 
was artificially manufactured. She had ridden with a hundred worse drivers 
than he. He always seemed to be on the alert, checking his mirrors, gauging 
the traffic beside and in front of him. 



He flipped the switch that turned on the air- conditioner and leaned in her 
direction. 'You know, you have the finest hair I've ever seen on a girl!' 

Maggi shifted uneasily in her seat. He had lulled her into a false sense of 
security, and the conversation upset her. Automatically her hand went to her 
hair and struggled to bring some order among the curls. All to no avail, as 
usual. 

'You didn't get it,' he commented as her hand moved aimlessly. 'Bend over 
here.' Maggi had no idea what he was talking about, but was so firmly in his 
thrall that she leaned over in his direction and trembled as his hand ran 
through the curls, seeking. 

'What is it?' 

'Nothing.' He laughed, a full-throated sound that filled the van with its 
pleasure. 'I just had the mad notion to run my hand through your hair.' 

'Well—really!' She snapped her head back so quickly that her neck hurt. She 
rubbed at it and glared at him. Neither seemed to faze him in the least. He 
unstrapped himself from the driver's immense seat and moved out into the 
corridor. Even for a man ofhis height he could move around comfortably, 
albeit with head slightly bowed. 

She watched warily as he rearranged the blankets and checked the 
air-conditioner vents. 'The noise of the machinery will keep them down for 
.quite a while,' he explained. 'Tell your dog to guard them. Come on.' 

'Tell my dog?' Maggi gasped at the thought. The dog would do as he 
pleased; he always did. At this moment he didn't seem too displeased to 
move aside and let them both pass to the midship doors. And when they 
were by Mike raised his head to look around, sniffed at the babies' feet, and 
went back to sleep again. 

'But we just can't walk off and let the dog take care of them,' she protested. 



'Modern science answers everything,' he said, chuckling. 'Our citizens' band 
radio is also an amplifier. I push this switch and—presto, every deep breath 
they take is funnelled up into the loudspeaker on the roof. Come on, girl.' 

John offered his hand as she scrambled down the three steps to the ground. 
She hesitated fractionally, and decided it wasn't worth the trouble to fuss 
about a hand. People held hands all the time, she told herself. Little people 
and big people and—besides, she thought, if you're holding his hand that's 
one thing he can't use to get you into more trouble. She stuck her head out of 
the door. True to his word, she could hear the sound of the babies breathing. 

John looked back at her as if he might have heard her thought. His big hand 
was still stretched in her direction. She dropped her own small paw into it, 
and it promptly disappeared. 

'Trouble?' he asked. 

'Nothing. Just clearing my throat.' And a quick change of subject. 'Isn't it 
wonderful, smelling the sea?' 

'And the harbour and the fish and the seaweed,' he added, grinning. 'All 
wonderful.' 

'Well, it's a working harbour,' she snapped. Marine Park was really a small 
island that served as a mid- harbour support for the long bridge. They were 
facing south, looking at the massive wall of the hurricane dyke that shut off 
the inner harbour from the outer, and from Buzzards Bay. The dyke was a 
huge wall of stone, with a massive steel gate in the middle, put up to protect 
the low-lying land inside from the ravages of another hurricane. It had been 
a big success, Maggi told him. 'Since the dyke was completed not a single 
hurricane has come by in this direction! And over there are--' She was 
waving towards the New Bedford side of the harbour, and the array of docks 
in the South Terminal. Where not a single fishing boat was tied up. 'Damn!' 
she muttered. 'I wanted to show you the fleet—and there's not a single boat 
in port. They must all be out on the fishing grounds!' 

'Not to worry.' He was standing slightly behind her. The wind, which had 
been a mild breeze out in the country, was blowing in good force, streaming 



her hair behind her, and pushing her back against him. Two warm arms 
steadied her gently. And then moved further forward and tightened around 
her. His voice was close to her ear. She shivered again, and not from the 
cold. 

'You're very proud of your part of the world, aren't you.' It was a statement, 
not a question. She pondered it, unwilling to admit to herself that it was his 
nearness, not his statement, that affected her. Cut it out, she told herself 
firmly. He's only a man. You've been held by a good many men, my girl. 
And practically all of them better-looking than this one. Maggi exerted a 
little strength, trying to move away from him, but either he was too strong, 
or she wasn't really trying—And I don't want to know which, she thought. 

'I don't see any boats.' That voice at her ear again, close enough so she could 
feel the warmth of the words. 'But there are plenty of factories. Tell me 
more.' 

She leaned her head back against his chest and tried to catch a glimpse of his 
face, with no success. 'That's part of the New Bedford renaissance,' she told 
him in her best tour-guide voice. 'The whaling industry died out after the 
Civil War. Petroleum oil was too much competition. So the city went 
downhill. Then in the 1880s cotton became king. Spinning of cotton thread 
in those days required humidity. What better place to build a factory than 
here on the banks of the river? The city became rich again on cotton—until 
the 1920s, when the mill-owners abandoned their buildings and workers and 
moved south—cheap labour. And then, after the Depression, all those 
buildings were standing empty, and hundreds of small industries moved into 
them—mainly the rag trade. And that's all.' 

'That's enough,' he said still at her ear. 

You've got to stop that, she told herself. My lord, girl, you're a sucker for 
this smooth line, the sympathetic voice. Get your show on the road before he 
overwhelms you. Before you learn to enjoy it, Maggi girl! 

'If .you would kindly turn me loose,' she snapped. 'I'm not that kind of girl.' 
His arms immediately opened and freed her. She moved away a step or two, 
and felt immediately lonely. 



'I never supposed you were, so why do you keep saying that?' he 
commented, watching her like a hawk. 

'I—I didn't mean to imply--' And the sentence just could not be completed. It 
was almost impossible to keep her face from flushing. But the wind had 
done its work. Her cheeks were already rosy. 

'I see,' he said. Obviously, he didn't, but Maggi had no intention of 
explaining. Why give this man a single bit of information to use against her? 
Why tell him that she wasn't afraid of John Dailey, the hunter, as much as 
she was afraid of Maggi Brennan, the widow? 

'I'm sorry I've spoiled your day,' she told him. 

'You haven't spoiled anything,' he replied. 'It's a grand view, I love the sight 
of a working city, and you're just about the best tour-guide in the area.' 

'That's not saying much.' She was rebuilding her weakened defences, 
restoring her own confidence. 'Since I'm the only tour-guide in sight. I feel I 
ought to do something more--' And the idea struck her. 

'Look, I brought some lunch stuff with me. Why don't we go over to 
Fairhaven and picnic at Fort Phoenix?' She pointed out to him the 
promontory stretching to their south where the old fort sat. The fort itself, 
just outside the hurricane barrier, was out of sight, but he didn't seem to 
mind. They walked slowly back to the van, struggling against the wind. It 
wasn't really all that much wind, but it was the best excuse she could offer 
herself for taking his arm.When he parked the van in the area just outside the 
state park at Fort Phoenix the place was almost empty. 'Too cold for 
swimming,' she told him as she stepped out of the van. 'That's the Atlantic 
Ocean out there. It doesn't get warm enough for bathing until some time in 
July.' 

He came around to join her. 'The kids are still asleep,' he reported. 'And the 
amplifier is on again. Whatever happened to the nice warm Gulf Stream?' 

'Oh, it's out there somewhere. Out beyond Nantucket Island. It's still too 
cold to swim.' The sun was brilliant on their heads. Maggi pulled the scarf 



out of her limitless handbag and tied it over her head. The offshore wind was 
chilled. They stood for a moment, looking out towards Ireland, some three 
thousand miles away. 'That's taking the long view, of course,' she teased. 

He came up behind her again and put an arm around her waist. 'We're going 
to stand here until the wind blows us away?' 

'Coward,' she said, laughing. 'And I thought you were very brave, driving 
the van up Fort Street.' 

'Well, I was,' he admitted modestly. 'How narrow can the streets get?' 

'Narrow? They used to drive the streetcars right up the middle of that street. 
Of course, there weren't manydrivers around who were willing to contest the 
passage with a thirty-ton streetcar.' 

He squeezed her just the tiniest bit, and she was immediately caught up in 
her panic. Do I shake because he's there, or because I don't want to be there? 
It was a question she still could not answer. 

'Do you know they have a large number of crazy drivers in this town?' he 
enquired. 

'Not really,' she replied. 'All those crazies you saw are from out of town. 
Come on, let's take a look at the fort.' Before he could answer she grabbed 
his hand and began towing him up the massive natural rock on which the old 
revolutionary war fort was established. He looked for only a minute at the 
battery of ancient muzzle-loading cannons, emplaced to command the 
entrance to the harbour, and then let her pull him further, up to the top of the 
stone parapet. 

'Now that's a view,' he agreed. And it was. The fort was located on the elbow 
of a hook-like peninsula, with the shank extending further out to sea. 

'Sconticut Neck!' she yelled at him, pointing to the land mass to their left. 
'New Bedford.' She pointed across the harbour to where a similar point 
stretched out to sea. 'There must be a dozen promontories in the area, all 



creating little bays and harbours. New Bedford and Newport are the biggest 
anchorages.' 

'And Fort Phoenix? Arisen out of the ashes?' 

'Well, how did you know that?' She looked back at him in surprise, and at 
that very moment a massive gust of wind pushed her into his arms. To keep 
from falling off the back of the parapet he dropped to the ground, taking her 
with him. They ended up nose to nose, laughing. Watching closely, she saw 
the laugh disappear as his face became solemn, intent. Oh, dear lord, she 
told herself, he's going to kiss me. 

And he did. It was not a challenging kiss. Not as wild and strong as the 
ocean wind. Instead it was warm and comforting and—highly desirable. She 
found it almost impossible to draw away from him. And he mumbled some 
words that the wind swept away. If only he didn't look as if he were carved 
in granite! 

'Let's get over to the leeward side of the fort,' she said. 'When we get out of 
the wind it'll be warm, I promise!' 

A little smile twitched at his lips, as if he knew just what was going on in her 
mind, but he was up gracefully and followed her around the perimeter to the 
far side, where the wall was barely four feet high, and jumped down outside. 
What she had promised was true. The minute the ancient stone wall cut off 
the wind they began to appreciate the heat of the sun. She gestured to a 
protruding rock and used it as a seat. He sprawled out in the grass beside her. 

'Now,' she said, unwilling to let him set the agenda, 'you said you were a 
hurler. Tell me about hurling and the professional football.' He chuckled. He 
knows what you're up to! she thought immediately. 

'Hurling,' he mused. 'Well, it's a lot like your game of field hockey, only 
much more ferocious. Nobody wears pads, there aren't so many rules and 
formalities, and—well, altogether it's a game of weaponless terrorism. One 
can accumulate a few scars here and there, but can't make any money at it. 
As for the Irish professional football, it's what you people call soccer—only 



we really know how to play it. I was on the All-Ireland team for four years. 
The money wasn't bad at all. It paid for my law degree. End of story.' 

'You mean—that's all?' 

'That's all,' he agreed. 'Our sort of soccer is relatively sedate, as long as you 
can keep the fans in the stands. If things get out of control then you have 
trench warfare. Kill or be killed. Great sport.' 

'But--' She searched his strife-marked face with concern. 

'Now you see why I became a lawyer,' he interrupted, laughing. 'I was such a 
bad player that I was lucky to get out of the league with my life!' 

'And then you went to law school.' 

'As you say,' he replied. 'Now tell me about yourself. Or Fort Phoenix?' 

Luckily he gave her a choice, and the old fort won. Babbling at high speed, 
she jumped into the story. 'New Bedford was a famous port back in those 
days— the revolution and all that. So they built this fort to keep the British 
fleet from invading.' She looked down at him to see if he was listening. 
Those big dark eyes followed her every move. Self-consciously she tugged 
at her windbreaker. 

'But they did,' she continued. 'There were a lot of boats here in the 
harbour—little fishing boats. And the British claimed that they were 
privateers, just because each one of them had a cannon to protect themselves 
with.' 

'What a stupid conclusion!' he interjected. 

'Yes, well, so they brought a whole fleet up into Clark's Cove, and landed 
forty thousand troops. Or maybe it was only four thousand. Or maybe four 
hundred.' 

'There's some discrepancy in the figures?' 



'Well, you don't have to be sarcastic! So they landed the marines over there 
in New Bedford, and they marched all the way through town and burned 
everything down. And at the same time they landed a force down there on 
Sconticut Neck, which is up behind the fort.' 

'And of course the cannon were all facing out to sea and couldn't fire behind 
them--' 

'You've heard this story before,' she accused him.'Not at all. Just my normal 
analytical mind at work. You tell a story beautifully, Maggi. Your eyes light 
up, and you have the world's best gestures, and--' 

'Stop that! If you don't want to listen, then you--' 

'I want to listen,' he assured her hurriedly. 'Where does the Phoenix arise 
from the ashes?' 

'Later,' she snapped. 'Where was I?' 

'They were coming up behind us--' 

'Yes. They came up behind the fort and--' It was getting harder and harder to 
tell the story. Somehow or another one of his hands had come around her 
waist and was resting just below the curve of her breast. She talked faster. 
'They came up behind and there was a terrible massacre, and they burned the 
fort to the ground. And then their battleships—well, at least one frigate. That 
must have been a pretty big ship. It came into the harbour and burned all the 
little fishing boats.' 

'Terrible,' he said solemnly. 'Terrible.' 

'Yes,' she hurried on. 'And then the militia from Wareham arrived, and the 
New Bedford militia, which had been over in Newport waiting for an attack 
there, came back.' 

'A lot of men?' 

'Oh, maybe two or three hundred.' 



'Against forty thousand!' He whistled in astonishment. She decided to keep 
her face pointed towards the harbour. 

'Yes. And the militia drove the British out and sent them scurrying back to 
their boats, and the town of Fairhaven voted to rebuild the fort--' 

'Up out of the ashes.' He chuckled. 

'Yes, out of the ashes. Because they knew that the British would never come 
back if they knew the fort was there to defend the harbour. And it was 
successful!' 

'Great!' He sat up and smiled at her. Or grinned, if that was a better 
classification. 

'It's all true!' she told him very firmly. 

'Of course it is. How many more times did the cowardly British attack?' 

'They never came back. The French fleet appeared off Chesapeake Bay, and 
the British admiral called all the ships south to Yorktown.' 

'Lucky for him,' he said solemnly. 'How many died in that terrible 
massacre?' 

'You mean right here at Fort Phoenix? I don't know. But in the whole 
battle—it lasted for twenty- four hours, you know—I think four men were 
killed, a dozen wounded, and the British fleet lost six men by desertion. So 
there!' 

'So there indeed.' And now he was definitely laughing. Laughing and 
squeezing her gently. 

She jumped up and glared at him. 'I'm going to report you,' she announced 
fiercely. 'There must be somebody I can report you to. Unpatriotic laughter 
in the face of the enemy!' 



'I can't allow that to happen,' he told her as he climbed to his feet. 'I'll lose 
my green card and have to give up being a nanny. The American green card, 
by the way, is actually blue.' He laughed again as he gathered her up. 'I can't 
take that chance. I'll just have to shut your mouth, acushla.' 

'Oh, no, you don't,' she stammered as she backed up a couple of steps, her 
hand covering her mouth. 'Listen—one of the babies is crying!' They 
weren't, of course, but it was the first excuse she could come to. She turned 
and ran, almost tumbling down the face of the rock in her hurry, thankful she 
had worn her trainers for the trip. The hurrying was not required. John 
sauntered after her as*if he had all the time in the world. 

As a result, by the time he arrived she had warmed the still-sleeping babies' 
bottles, set out their lunch, and deployed the large container of fried chicken 
she had brought with her. Fried chicken, mashed potatoes, coleslaw. And 
she sat herself down on the opposite side of the feast, leaving him to sit on 
the stair of the van, safely separated from her by six Southern- fried chicken 
legs. 

'I know when I'm licked,' he said, laughing. 'Did you cook this yourself?' 

'Of course I did. Those little red bits are linguiga. Portuguese sausages. 
They're a little peppery. And there's some beer in the refrigerator, and--' 

'And everything's fine,' he assured her. 'Slow down. Calm down. Like any 
sensible lad, if I can't bite the lady, I'll settle for fried chicken.' 

'How gracious of you,' she muttered, and dug into the food as if her life 
depended on it. 

The babies were awake a few minutes later. It was hard'to tend to their needs 
in the narrow van, but they managed. When the children were back in their 
seats Maggi managed to squeeze by John, out into the open air, just in time 
to see another car pull up beside them. 

'Maggi? Maggi Brennan?' 

Maggi walked over to the car and looked in. 'Stella! It's been a long time.' 



'And we're neighbours, love. I live down Tucker Road now, about a mile 
from you. How are things going?' 

'Well,' Maggi reported. 'And you?' 

'Working downtown,' Stella replied. 'In a law office. What's this I hear about 
you living with some foreigner? The whole town's gossiping!' 

'There's nothing to it,' Maggi protested. 'Nothing at all.' 

'Where there's smoke...' Stella offered archly. 'Some gorgeous hunk? Oh, 
lord, is that him?' 

Maggi flashed a look over her shoulder. John Dailey had just come around 
the front of the van and was standing there looking at them. And for some 
reason Maggi just did not want to introduce John to her old schoolfriend. 
'No, I'm not living with him, I'm employing him,' she said firmly. 'And we 
have to go right away. Maybe I'll see you again one day.' 

'Maybe I'll come over some night,' Stella suggested, chuckling. 'I'm sure I 
can find some work for him myself!' All of which convinced Maggi that the 
neighbours were already talking too much, and it was long past time to go, 
before any more female sharks came ashore. She wheeled and made for the 
van, tugging John's arm as she passed him. 

'You're not going to introduce me to your friend?' he asked as he followed 
along. 

'No, I'm not. Are the babies ready to go?' 

'Suddenly maternal,' he said as he checked the seat straps and slipped into 
the driver's seat. 'Now I wonder why?' 

'Well, you can wonder until hell freezes over,' she snapped at him.He was 
laughing as he eased them out of the car park. The two babies behind him 
gurgled, sharing the joke. Maggi tightened her seatbelt and glared out of the 
window as they headed down the tree-shrouded avenue that was Fort Street, 



heading home. It started to rain before they reached the bridge. She was glad 
for it. It matched her spirits. 

  



CHAPTER FOUR 

'WOMAN'S work is never done,' grumbled Maggi several days later. 'Well, 
hardly ever. We might as well be married, the way we're going on!' The 
statement was casually made, off the top of her head; the moment she heard 
what she had said her face turned a violent red and she clamped a hand over 
her idiotic mouth. 

She could see John's face, too, all the way across the kitchen, as the steel 
shutter fell again. He shook his head and said gently, 'I thought we'd settled 
that idea. I'd rather not discuss it again. The word "married" frightens me. At 
least the way things are now you have all your nights off.' 

'How nice for me,' she muttered as she stuffed another load of baby clothes 
into the brand-new washing-machine. 'It's hard to believe that just two little 
babies require a daily laundry service. But I want you to know that I'm not 
going to let you buy everything in the world for my house. I can't imagine 
what you're using for money! When you decide to go back to Ireland you'll 
have to take it all with you!' 

And that's another problem, she told herself. For a man who didn't have two 
pennies to rub together when he arrived, this man seemed to have more 
money than he knew what to do with. Although she was paying him well, it 
hardly added up to all the things he had purchased. 'You seem to be made 
out of money,' she accused him. 'Like Finian's Rainbow? Found a pot of 
gold outside your village?' 

She was not too far away to see the startled look that swept over his face and 
was gone. 'Not exactly,' he answered abruptly. 'Of course, we poor Irish 
have the saving habit. I talked with your lawyer. You have to have a 
clothes-washer, so I just ordered one on your account.' 

'You—you just charged it to my account?' Anger boiled over and gibberish 
ran out of her brick-red mouth. 'You just--' 

'To the executor's account,' he soothed, but Maggi was beyond soothing. 
'You wouldn't want to lose all this equipment,' he challenged. 'If the babes 



are to stay here, this stuff will be in use for a long time. And the estate can 
afford it. Anything else for the drier?' 

'No.' Deep breathing. Fifty breaths, steady and slow. Somehow she managed 
to stem the tide of anger. In a sense he was right. She needed the equipment, 
she knew, but to just charge it off to her—it boggled the mind! Ten more 
deep breaths. 'I think that's all the laundry, but I need to sterilise the bottles, 
and get another quart of boiled water.' She nibbled her lip for a moment. 
This was the time to make the announcement. 'And the babies are going to 
stay here,' she said quietly. 

Fronj out in the living-room, television and all, she could hear Aunt Eduarda 
give a muffled cheer. 

'Good,' he said. 'Although I'm not one to know much about the subject, I 
think you might make a good mother. How do you propose to do all that?' 

'Why--' Maggi had given it some thought, but the answers she had found so 
far were not too agreeable. 'I intend to adopt them, of course.' Only when I 
went to the Division of Child Services they made a great many noises about 
"stable home and family life" and "We seldom allow adoptions into 
one-parent families," and "If you were married, and your husband had a 
sufficient income, Mrs Brennan," and "You have to fill out these ten 
thousand forms." Well, perhaps not that many, but hell! 

When she lifted her head he was studying her face, as if trying to read 
behind the cover. 'Well, now,' he said, 'I think everything is under control, 
and I have to get up to Boston to see the Immigration people.' 

'About your green card?' 

'Blue, actually,' he corrected her. 

'Both of the babies are napping?' 

'Of course they are. When did you ever see one of them doing something 
that the other wasn't? I'll be back by dinnertime. What are we having? Steak 
and potatoes?' 



'Last night we had potatoes and steak,' she reminded him. 'How about a tuna 
salad and soup?' 

'Ah,' he said, shaking his head dolefully. 'You must know that the Irish 
culture begins and ends with potatoes. I'm a growing boy. Why don't we 
stick to what we know?' He was gone out of the door before she had a 
chance to rethink the problem. Steak was just too darn expensive, Aunt 
Eduarda didn't like it, and the moment the door closed behind him she had 
other ideas to worry her. 

Marriage, for example. In barely three weeks she had fallen desperately in 
love with two little girls. Desperately. If she were married she could adopt 
them without any trouble. As for income—well, she might just give up the 
struggle and sell the farm. Forty-six acres, nudging against the limited land 
of the housingestate under construction up the hill, would bring a sizeable 
income. It would last long enough for the children to grow up, graduate from 
college, and have their own families. The thought tickled her funny- bone. 
'Here I am barely making ends meet,' she muttered, 'and already I have 
grandchildren! Where in the world could I find a nice man who's interested 
in marrying me? Not John, certainly. He's said that, and I'm coming to 
believe him. Besides, who could stand a dictator like him around the house, 
twenty-four hours a day?' 

'I'd rather have kale soup,' Aunt Eduarda called from the living-room. 'With 
sausages!' 

'Yeah, growing,' growled Maggi as she moved to the door to watch John, 
starting up the van out in the front yard. The vehicle started at the touch of 
his finger. Everything he owned seemed to work—including her! She 
smiled at her own temerity. 

He doesn't own me, she reminded herself, I'm renting him by the day. Maggi 
Brennan, bottle-washer- in-chief. Assistant baby-minder. His van works 
because he tinkers with it; is he tinkering with me? A little shudder ran up 
and down her spine, having nothing to do with the temperature or the wind. 
Smiling a secret smile, Maggi started the bottles in the steriliser, and filled 
the kettle for the boiled water needed in the babies' formula. 



Quarter past one, she noted as she left the kitchen. For the first time this 
week I've actually had breakfast and lunch! Will wonders never cease? I 
wish I understood what I'm up to. That man has moved into my home and 
taken over everything! He's not the sort of man I really like to have around, 
and he makes me mad more often than he makes me happy—so why don't I 
up and send him about his business? 

She knew the reason. Despite her anger there was no denying the shivers 
that he sent up and down her spine. Shivers of—anticipation? All physical, 
of course. There was certainly no romance involved. 'And I'm not the sort of 
girl to jump into bed with him at a minute's notice,' she muttered as she 
wandered out to the living-room. 

The twins were fast asleep and smiling, under Aunt Eduarda's cheerful eye. 
Because the day was a little more chilly than previously, they were dressed 
in their wool pyjamas—the pyjamas with the feet cut out of them, so they 
could touch each other. Mike managed a single tail-wag as Maggi came in. 

'Boy, have you got it made,' she grumbled at her dog. 'Sleep all day in 
comfort, never miss a meal, no more living out in the barn—and I don't think 
I've heard you bark in a month of Sundays!' The old dog opened his mouth 
in a massive yawn and put his head down again. Maggi sat down in the 
rocking-chair. Just for a minute, of course. She was no longer affected by 
the sheer physical effort of being a substitute mother. So no one was more 
surprised than she to find she had fallen asleep. 

She slept until someone tugged at the tip of her shoe. Maggi opened one eye; 
Mike was playing watchdog, mouthing the toe of her shoe and shaking it, 
rather than barking. Even the dog knows you don't disturb two sleeping 
princesses, she thought. And then she managed to work the other eye open. 

She had been napping for an hour. The babies were still asleep, although 
both had rolled over on their stomachs, Prissy to the left, Pru to the right, so 
that their feet were still entangled. Aunt Eduarda was trying her best to 
figure out the use of the two spring- loaded baby chairs that she and John 
had bought the previous day. And someone was walking up the path leading 
to the kitchen door. 



He's back again! For some foolish reason the idea excited her. But Mike 
wasn't behaving as if the lord of the manor were returning. In fact the dog's 
teeth were showing as he padded out to the kitchen door. Maggi followed. 
One of the first things John had done was to disconnect the noisy doorbell; 
somebody pushed the button a couple of times, muttered disgustedly, and 
knocked. She whipped the door open. 

'You again, Mr Swanson? Don't you have somewhere important to go?' 
Mike was unable to restrain the soft but threatening growl. But Swanson had 
worked up his courage, and stuck a shoe in the half- opened doorway. 

'Come to make you a better offer, Mrs Brennan,' the little man said jovially. 
'Been authorised to increase our offer by ten dollars the acre. How about 
that?' 

'If you don't get your shoe out of my door you won't be able to walk for a 
month,' she said. He started to say something more, but Mike growled again. 
The agent quickly retrieved his toe. 

'But think what you can do with the money,' he said. His face still wore that 
jovial smile, but his words belied the idea that he was having a good time. 
'You don't seem to realise the problem,' he insisted. 'You must know that my 
firm is building those luxury condos behind your farm. The project won't be 
economical if we can't expand on to your land. You wouldn't want to see it 
all brought to a stop, would you? The town would suffer severely, you 
know. A lower tax-base, more unemployment, fewer homes.' 

'And all my fault?' Maggi straightened out her suede skirt, and 
finger-combed her hair while she waited. 

'Well—er—probably,' he announced. 

'And you would be one of the unemployed, Mr Swanson?' 

'Why—yes, to tell the truth.' 

'Good,' she snapped. 'The answer is no. Goodbye.' 



He stood there on the stoop, rocking back and forth on his heels, a hangdog 
look coming over his face. 'I can't take no for an answer,' he said in anguish. 
'It would ruin me!' 

'Then I suggest you start looking around for other employment,' she 
snapped. 'There's only one thing more I want to tell you, Mr Swanson, and 
that is goodbye!' 

Swanson, caught in the weight of her disapproval, took another look at 
Mike's bared teeth and decided that nothing was worth further effort. He 
turned and left. And almost knocked over the elderly grey-haired woman 
dressed in an almost masculine navy blue business suit, who was just 
climbing out of her State car. 

State car, Maggi nudged herself. Blue licence plate with white numbers, on 
an otherwise inoffensive red Ford Escort. Danger signals? From the Bureau 
of Revenue—the State income tax people? Maybe I should have filed last 
year, even though I didn't make any money to speak of? 

Or the Health Board? There had been a lot of complaints about the swamp 
on her land—something to do with odours? And in the meantime the 
woman waswalking slowly up the path, and smiling as she saw Maggi 
standing in the door. And that's the worst kind, Maggi thought. Civil 
servants who smile as they escort you to the guillotine! Maggi Brennan 
swallowed hard, and prepared to defend the pass at Thermopylae to the last 
man—or woman, as the case might be. 

'I'm not accustomed to the walk,' the woman said as she climbed up on to the 
stoop and put out a hand. 'Mildred Fagan, from the State Bureau of Child 
Services. This is the place where the Daugherty twins live? And that lovely 
Mr Dailey?' 

Child Services? Dailey? For the life of her Maggi couldn't remember the 
name Dailey at all, and then her mind cleared. 'Yes, Mr Dailey works here. 
Forgive me, but it's all been so sudden that I forget names, and ' 

'Yes, we were contacted by the Immigration people. But I came because of 
your application for adoption. Evidently our clerk was given to understand 



that you might remarry soon, and so I've been sent along to check the other 
aspects of the case,' Ms Fagan said. 'But not to worry.' She gave a 
professional glance down at the gold ring on Maggi's left hand. 'You did get 
married?' 

'I—why, of course, I did, but--' Truth is a precious commodity, Maggi told 
herself. As priceless as pearls. So it shouldn't be spread around too much, 
right? If the woman wants to think I've gotten married again, why should I 
spoil her day? 

'No need to explain. That's a lovely ring. Now if I may see the house, and the 
children?' 

'I--' Before Maggi could work up another word Ms Mildred Fagan was 
walking by her into the kitchen, her clip-board at the ready, her little bifocal 
glasses perched perkily on the end of her stubby nose. Mike gave her a 
friendly little wag of encouragement, and wandered off to stand guard over 
the children. 

'Nice,' Ms Fagan commented. 'It's a good idea to have a dog or some pet 
available when raising children. Especially a short-haired dog. Dalmatian, is 
he?' 

'More or less,' Maggi agreed. 'His mother was registered with the American 
Kennel Club.' 

'Mixed blood.' The State inspector nodded sagely. 'Always the best, as far as 
temperament and intelligence are concerned.' Maggi shot her a quick 
glance. Behind those ridiculous little glasses sparked a pair of blue eyes as 
full of intelligence as anyone could ask. And a little smile, as if the pair of 
them shared some secret. 

'Neat kitchen,' Ms Fagan went on, checking off half a dozen spaces on her 
clip-board. 'Well scrubbed.' 

'John and I do that every day,' Maggi offered. Two more checks on the other 
end of the clip-board. 'The babies are in the living-room.' 



'Mr Dailey isn't here at the moment?' 

'Well, no.' Maggi stopped for a second, trying to decide how much truth she 
should spoon out. 'We have a good working arrangement, you know. I'm 
home with the children today, and he's gone up to Boston to the INS—the 
Immigration people.' 

'Old-fashioned,' Ms Fagan mused as she slashed at three more blocks on her 
pad. 'The Commonwealth loves that. And my boss does too. Now, the 
children are ' 

'Through that door.' Maggi held the door back for her guest. Mike, who had 
gone back to guard duty, came to the open door of the living-room, then 
retreated. Aunt Eduarda had figured out what to do with the little dangling 
chairs. Each of the two babies was ensconced in a canvas seat, with their 
legs projecting from holes in the bottom. The entire affair was suspended 
from the top frame of the door by a huge spring, so that the child could 
bounce her feet off the floor, and the spring would provide a momentary free 
ride. At the moment they were bouncing themselves up and down like 
Yo-yos, squealing their delight and at the same time exercising their little 
legs. 

'Darlings!' Ms Fagan gushed. 'A guard dog. And a lovely fire.' A brief pause 
as her head came up from her inspection. 'You do have central heating?' 

'Of course. But the babies love to see the fire—the sparkle and all that, you 
know. And the fireguard is doubly safe. John has welded it in place, with a 
small door up here through which we can feed the wood.' She indicated the 
place. 'But since it's too warm for both fireplace and--' 

'Of course.' The smile was back again. 'Aren't they both darlings? Can you 
tell them apart?' 

'That's Prissy.' Maggi pointed. 'So the other must be--' 

'Prudence. Of course. How clever you are, and in such a short time.' 



Yes, Maggi told herself, I'm clever. And good- looking. And righteous. And 
old-fashioned. And I'll probably not get to finish a sentence until this lovely 
lady leaves, after which the lord will undoubtedly strike me dead for all the 
lies I'm telling! 'Yes, it's been difficult,' she murmured. 'And this is my Aunt 
Eduarda, who lives with us and helps out with the children.' 

Ms Fagan smiled and made a few more positive slashes on her report form. 
Aunt Eduarda, who hated officialdom with a passion, withdrew into non- 
comprehension, and said a few words in Portuguese. 

Maggi blushed and refused to translate. 'Is there something more you want 
to see here?' 

There wasn't time for an answer. Promptly on cue Prudence noticed their 
presence and gurgled up at the pair of them. Priscilla instantly followed suit. 
The two of them contemplated the adults peering over them, turned their 
heads at precisely the same time to check on the fire and on Mike, then 
returned to the adults. At exactly the same moment, the little pair of mouths 
opened and they began to complain. 

'Oh, dear,' Ms Fagan said and stepped back. 

Proving she's only a textbook baby-minder, Maggi's conscience noted. 
Show her how it's done, shall I? Me with all my experience? 

'It's normal,' Maggi assured her visitor. 'This is about the time they both turn 
up with wet diapers. Would you like to carry one of them out to the kitchen 
while I take the other?' 

She bent over the swing to unloosen the straps, lifted Prissy up and passed 
her over. Ms Fagan made a gingerly reception, somewhat on the order of a 
maiden aunt at her first exposure to a wet niece. With Pru in her own hands, 
Maggi led the way. With practised skill she balanced the baby on one 
shoulder while spreading a thick cotton blanket over the kitchen table. And 
demonstrated that she was a fast learner indeed. At least the inspector was 
impressed. 



'A little diaper rash there,' Maggi pointed out, just as if she knew what she 
was talking about. 'Probably from the change of water—in her formula, you 
know.' 

'Of course.' Ms Fagan was becoming just the slightest bit glassy-eyed, as if 
she were learning toomuch too soon. But she gamely reset her bifocals on 
the end of her nose and watched while Maggi spread ointment and powder 
and kisses. 

'We're still using throw-away diapers,' she commented. 'We might go to the 
all-cotton ones if that rash persists. How's that?' 

'Commendable.' Ms Fagan was over by the door, looking up high on the 
wall. 'Your wedding certificate?' 

Maggi looked over her shoulder, keeping one hand on each twin's stomach. 
They were starting to roll. In another week or two they would be squirming 
on their stomachs. Or so her book said. She could only spare a corner of her 
mind for Ms Fagan. 'Yes,' she answered. It was true. A week after Robert 
died she had, in a rage of loneliness, snatched the parchment up, framed it, 
and hung it there. And hadn't looked at it in over three years. 'Did you want 
to read it?' 

'No need,' Ms Fagan replied gently. 'You know, wearing bifocals it's 
impossible to look up and read without breaking my neck. Bifocals were 
made for looking down. No, don't bother. It's enough to know it's there.' One 
more slashing check on her pad, and she folded it up and came back to the 
table. 

'All wonderful,' she chirped cheerfully. 'Everything in perfect order. Loving 
concern, capacity to care, marriage—all wonderful. These children can look 
forward to years of concerned parenting.' A brief pause while she moved her 
glasses and stubbed at her curiously wet eyes. 'And the Commonwealth will 
save a potful of money. I'm happy to give official assent to this temporary 
guardianship, and, I hope, to the adoption. Now, if you would sign here?' 

From under the lip of the pad on her clip-board she extracted a long official 
form that had already been signed in innumerable places by half a dozen 



strangers. Ms Fagan indicated the proper line. With bold strokes, Maggi 
signed, 'Margaret Brennan'. 

'Ah, you don't use his name?' 

'His name? No, I never--' 

'Many women don't,' Ms Fagan agreed. The smile was still there. 

'Is that wrong? Did I--?' 

'No, everything is fine. I won't wait for Mr Dailey. We don't need his 
signature. We women can take care of these things, don't you think? 
Goodbye- Margaret.' 

'Maggi—everyone calls me Maggi.' 

'Then goodbye, Maggi. And may God bless this little family.' A lovely 
benediction which left Maggi stuck with two babies who needed to be 
moved, her mouth half open and her eyes glued to the door as Ms Mildred 
Fagan made herself scarce. A funny thought bothered Maggi. Somehow she 
had put her foot into a very deep hole indeed. One with a large trap at its 
bottom. 

The might and power of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts was walking 
down the path on the shoulders of Ms Mildred Fagan, having been lied to, 
either by commission or omission, on practically everything that was 
important. Just who is doing what to whom? Maggi asked herself as she 
managed to get both babies up on her shoulders, and back out to the safety of 
the living-room rug. And just what is the Commonwealth going to do when 
it finds out about all these lies? Oh, I'm so glad you've married, Maggi 
Brennan. Do they still execute people for false swearing? 

John walked into the house just after five o'clock; a quietly dangerous 
house. He could feel the atmosphere the moment he opened the kitchen 
door. 'I'm back!' he called—not too loudly. For some reason he felt caution 
might be required. 



Dinner was simmering on the stove. He detoured by and lifted the lid. Soup. 
And next to it an asparagus salad—just what a big growing boy didn't care 
for. It heightened his caution. Mike came strolling in out of the living-room. 
The dog cocked his head to one side as if censuring. 

'Look, whatever it is, I didn't do it,' muttered John as he scratched behind 
Mike's left ear. 'Of if I did I didn't mean to. Or I've forgotten about it. Where 
is she?' The dog was too intelligent not to understand. He licked at the hand 
that was being so nice, and turned and led the way back into the living-room. 
Maggi was sitting in the rocking-chair, a baby in each arm, playing with 
them both at the same time. 

'I'm back,' he said after it was plain that she intended to ignore him. 

'Do you say so?' She looked up at him for just a moment and then went back 
to the children. 

'Look;" he sighed, 'even Pontius Pilate held a hearing!' 

'Thank you for edifying me.' 

It was the coldest thank you he had ever heard. Only his indignation warmed 
him. She thinks she can twist me around her little finger, he told himself 
bitterly. As typical a female as ever there was. And maybe she can! Good 
lord, how did I ever get in this mess? 

All I thought to do was gain a week or two, to figure things out, and-- 

'Your dinner's ready,' she told him without looking up again. 'It's on the 
stove. I'll have mine later.' 

'Soup--' 

'Is there something wrong with soup?' she flared up at him, her cheeks 
turning blush-red. The sudden noise disturbed both babies. One of them 
whimpered. Maggi jiggled them both up and down for a moment, restoring 
comparative calm. 



'No,' he offered tentatively. 'There's nothing wrong with soup. I love soup!' 

'How nice.' Her voice had become deceptively soft, but the strained look still 
formed around her eyes and mouth. 'I had a visitor while you were away. A 
lady by the name of Fagan—Ms Mildred Fagan.' 

'I don't know anyone by that name,' he replied, trying to fathom what went 
on behind her busy forehead. 'At least, I don't remember anyone by that 
name.' 

'Ms Fagan was from the Department of Child Services,' she said, again with 
that deceptively cool voice. 'She inspected the place, checked on the 
children, filled out a form, and went away. You'll be happy to know that we 
passed inspection, Mr Dailey.' 

He let out his breath in a big whistling sigh. 'For a minute there you had me 
fooled,' he said. 'We? We passed inspection. I thought you were going to say 
she was repossessing the kids.' 

'Very funny, Mr Dailey. No, she gave me to believe the adoption would be 
successful. I put the papers she left up on the refrigerator.''All right, Maggi,' 
he said-firmly, 'I can see you're out to stick the needle into me. Get to the 
point. If this specious argument has some point!' 

And that, thought Maggi, is the point. This specious argument hasn't any 
point at all. I'm suffering from a guilt complex, and he hasn't a thing to do 
with it. Well, P ve talked myself into the problem, and now it's up to me to 
work my way out. To begin with, I need either to give up the children, or 
find a husband. Lord, how do you go about that these days? With Robert 
and me it was so simple. We dated from grammar school days, and married. 
All the good ones went early in the marriage game. What's left on the 
husband market these days but old maggotty stock? And here I am taking 
my frustrations out on poor John! 

She was so angry with herself that tears were flowing, and she just could not 
bring herself to stanch them. So she put the babies down in the crib, stood 
straight as a die, hands at her sides, and let the rivulet roll down her cheeks. 



'Hey—Maggi!' 

She moved back a half-step. 'Don't touch me,' she muttered. 

'I won't.' Instead he held out his arms, and like some sort of zombie she 
walked into them. He cushioned her head on his chest. And the strangest 
thing of all was that neither of the children cried. A minute passed, Maggi 
raised her head. 

'What a fool I am,' she sobbed. 'I'm getting your shirt all wet, and I only 
ironed it this morning! I've done a terrible thing, John.' 

'It can't be all that much of a problem,' he said, his lips just at her ear. 'Tell 
me about it.' 

'I—that's the problem,' she stuttered. The tears were drying up and her 
courage was coming back. 'I can't tell you. I just can't.' 

'It's a terrible problem but you can't tell me about it? I thought we were 
friends, Maggi Brennan.' He tugged her with him back to the rocking-chair 
and sat her down. She promptly stiffened her back, dashed the last remnant 
of tears away, and mustered up all the sternness she could find. He paced up 
and down in front of her while he marshalled his thoughts. 

'Do we play "what is it"?' he asked. 'Is it bigger than a breadbox?' 

'Yes, they are,' she said quietly. 

'Ah, then it's about the babies. And the Child Services person?' Maggi 
nodded. 'They wouldn't let you adopt the kids because you would be a single 
parent?' Maggi nodded again. 'But that isn't an immediate problem,' he 
mused. 'As long as you are the executor of the estate the children are yours, 
no matter what the Child Services people have to say. Unless, of course, 
they can prove that the children are being abused by being in your care. 
Which, Maggi, would never happen. You said you passed the examination; 
nothing else matters.' 



'I—had to tell the inspector a lie, John. A very tiny little lie.' Her lovely 
green eyes stared at him. He moved not a muscle. 

'I would rather think a word or two not highly important,' he said. 'You 
know that everyone in the world tells a lie now and again. Some are 
inadvertent, some not. It could hardly be important, lass. Now, can we get 
the little people fed and ready for bed? That's the important thing?' 

Maggi stared at him without saying another word. She lacked a great deal of 
education, did Maggi Brennan, but she was not one of the world's stupid 
people. It wasn't even a word-lie. It was a 'lack-of- word' lie. As she studied 
his face, stroijg-marked in the evening light, she wondered what he would 
say if she blurted it out? I let Ms Fagan believe I was married to you, John! 
What would he do? Turn and run? It wasn't something she wanted to tell 
him, not today. But some day Maggi Brennan's famous loose tongue would 
slip, and the whole game would fall apart. Poor Maggi Brennan, wishing for 
the stars. 

'Very well,' she told him coolly, 'I'll say nothing more. You'd better get your 
supper before we get to work with the children.' 

'Soup?' he said and sighed. 

'Your steak is in the oven. The girls have been fed, I'm having the soup and 
salad, and you'd better hurry up, because the kids need their playtime with 
their nanny.' 

He came over to her and leaned down. 'Don't keep putting me down, Maggi. 
I might--' 

She squirmed back an inch or two. 'You'd better watch your Ps and Qs,' she 
warned him. 'I've got two big brothers.' 

'Two of them?' he queried softly. 'OK, I'll be careful .'^Which proved to be 
an instant lie as he leaned closer and kissed her gently. 'And which one was 
that?' he asked as he looked down into her dazed face. 'A P or a Q?' 



It rained again that night, a cold, driving rain. But not cold enough to quench 
the fire within her. 

  



CHAPTER FIVE 

DISASTER struck at four o'clock the next morning. The great pouring rains 
had come to a stop. Both babies woke up long before their normal time, 
wailing. Maggi had barely closed her eyes, and now she had to force them 
open again. She snatched at the robe at the foot of her bed and staggered 
down the hall. Aunt Eduarda was coming from the opposite direction, and 
they met at the nursery door. The night-light, plugged into a wall socket, 
was brilliant enough for them to see the trouble: the plaster ceiling in the 
centre of the room was bulging ominously downward, and a steady drip of 
water fell into the crib, directly below. 

'Meu Deus!' Aunt Eduarda muttered as she made the sign of the cross, and 
then snatched one of the babies up in her arms protectively and backed away 
into a dry corner. 

'Good lord!' Maggi echoed as she picked up the other. Prudence—or 
perhaps Prissy—struggled in her arms, glared at her out of those big blue 
eyes, and then blew a bubble and laughed. And John Dailey appeared in the 
door. 

'What in the name of the seven saints is going on?' he asked, at a level just 
below hurricane force. Both children flinched, and one of them whimpered. 

'You needn't roar and curse,' Maggi responded in her most Puritan manner. 
'I think it's pretty obvious. We have a leak in the roof!''Leak? It's more like a 
river. Right over the babies' bed? How convenient!' 

She glared at him. Lack of sleep, bad dreams, sudden disturbances, his 
towering temper, all added up to a firestorm in Maggi's mind. 'Yes,' she told 
him, her voice loaded with venom. 'I arranged it just that way on purpose!' If 
she had been a little taller they would have been nose to nose, with little Pru 
squeezed in between. The baby seemed fascinated by the argument. Maggi's 
empty hand was clutched tightly into a fist. Luckily Aunt Eduarda stepped 
in. 

'Bastante!' the little lady roared at them. 'Enough! You, Margaret, you take 
the babies to your room, no? Change the clothes. Entertain.' And then, 



turning her back on Maggi and glaring fiercely at John, 'And you, eh? With 
the big noisy mouth, and all the muscles. You take the crib down to Maggi's 
room, while I am to get new sheets. And dry it off, the crib, quietly. 
Comprehend?' 

The pair of them, suitably reprimanded, set about their assignments. Maggi 
felt better about it all as she heard John cursing under his breath as he 
struggled with the massive crib. And so, by six o'clock, the two children 
were dreaming again, their bed inches away from Maggi's, and all the adults 
had fallen asleep as well. 

But the woodpeckers woke Maggi up again about eight o'clock. They were 
drilling a hole in the world, almost directly over her head! Woodpeckers or 
hammers. Disgustedly, she swung her feet out on to the floor again. The 
twins seemed able to sleep through it all. Muttering a few choice Portuguese 
phrases under her breath, Maggi searched out her robe again and staggered 
downstairs. Off the side of the porch a fragile old ladder leaned against the 
wall of the house. It seemed too ancient to be climbed, but curiosity ruled. 
She carefully sidled upward, skipping the two slats that looked too far gone 
to bear her weight, and when her head reached the level of the gutter she 
dared to look up. 

'You!' she snapped. 'I might have known!' John, dressed only in a pair of 
ragged denim shorts, was squatting on the incline of the roof, a hammer in 
his hand, and half a dozen roofing nails in his mouth. 

'Me,' he managed to say. 'Who were you expecting? James Bond?' 

'I was expecting peace and quiet!' she raged. 

'Well, you'll never find that—not with people like you around,' he returned. 
'Now get off the ladder before you break your neck!' 

'You'd like that, wouldn't you?' she snarled, and almost fell off the ladder as 
he started in her direction, anger flashing from every rugged corner of his 
face. One of his hands cupped her chin. 



'No,' he said, very distinctly, 'I wouldn't like that at all. And I don't like 
girls--' 

'Women,' she interjected. 

'Women.' He savoured the correction as if he might wish to dispute it, and 
then changed his mind. 'I don't like women who insist on putting words in 
my mouth. Now—get—back—down—that—ladder!' Maggi closed her 
eyes. Heights and violent men both upset her very easily. With her eyes still 
closed, she crabbed her way back down and fumbled for a chair on the 
porch. Catching her breath fortified her strength, and when John scrambled 
down moments later she was— almost—ready for his attack. Which didn't 
come.Instead he pulled up a porch chair beside her and looked out on the 
farm for a moment. 'It could be a lovely place,' he said softly. Maggi looked 
up in surprise. He was staring uphill to where the cornfields lay. 'I suppose 
you'd be reluctant to leave it?' 

'I—really don't know,' she replied. 'It's my home, and I've never been 
anyplace else.' A moment's pause. 'Well, I went to Washington DC with my 
high school class. Once. It was a four-day trip.' 

'Home is where the heart is,' he said, sighing. 'Look, Maggi, you and I have 
to talk. Somewhere where we aren't trapped by an aunt and two babies and 
an ancient dog. Do you suppose your aunt could watch the babies tonight 
and we two go out to supper?' 

'I—I'm sure Aunt Eduarda could look after them— when they're asleep,' she 
stammered. 'As long as the--' 

'I fixed the roof,' he interjected. 'Replacement shingles, hot tar—enough to 
hold things for a few weeks. The inside ceiling is pretty bad; I'll get to that 
this afternoon. But you need a whole new roof, you know.' 

'I know.' She stabbed at her eyes. Some sort of water seemed to be trying to 
sneak out. 'I—just can't afford it.' 

'We'lUalk about it tonight,' he said gently. 'Kids still asleep?' 



'Like a pair of logs,' Maggi answered. 'Prudence snores. Did you know that?' 

'No, I never knew that.' He sprawled out, relaxed, and his. eyes half closed. 

'You seem to be able to do almost anything in the world,' Maggi said softly, 
wistfully. But he was already asleep. And how about that? she told herself. 
You snore too! 

 

It was eight o'clock that night before they were able to get the children 
settled, Aunt Eduarda soothed, and the arrangements made. Not that 
Maggi's aunt was a terrible problem. Flaky she might be, but her knowledge 
of baby care was voluminous, and her desire to take care of the girls was 
immense. So by nine o'clock John and Maggi were seated at a small table in 
the very front of Davy's Locker, a fine seafood restaurant facing the 
harbour, out on the pier on East Rodney French Boulevard. 

Night had already fallen, and through the big glass windows they could see 
the sparkle of lights on the water. Ships came up the channel, their red and 
green running lights twinkling as they made for the entrance to the inner 
harbour. The Butler's Flat lighthouse beacon still flashed, even though no 
longer used for navigation. There were dim lights, like a tiny string of 
pearls, down the length of Sconticut Neck in the distance. And an 
occasional spotlight lit up Fort Phoenix, all the way across the harbour. 

'I'm tired.' Maggi sighed as she rested both elbows on the table and cupped 
her chin in the palms of her hands. 'I don't know why, but I'm tired.' 

'The babes will become mobile,' he said. 'That increases the work. And you 
have the chickens, and you're still trying to do something about the corn?' 

'I must,' she replied. 'I can't just let it all—well, you wouldn't understand. 
Lawyers don't--' 

'I was raised on a farm,' he interjected. 'A big farm for Ireland—fifteen 
hectares.' When she looked at him, bewildered, he translated, 'Say roughly 
two and a half acres per hectare.' 



'That is a lot,' she agreed. 'And I suppose you grow potatoes?' 

'Not likely.' That big smile played around his lips, and teased her out of her 
doldrums. 'The Daileys came up short. We have more rock than turf. We 
raise sheep, and cut peat. Now, what about mobile babies?' 

' Will be mobile?' she repeated, exasperated. 'Both of them can roll now. 
Prissy can go either way; Pru seems only to roll in one direction. And they 
get on their stomachs, struggle up on hands and knees, and rock back and 
forth. Any day now they'll be crawling.' 

He lowered his menu, and Maggi was warmed by that special smile that had 
come to mean so much to her. 'There's too much work here just for you,' he 
commented, running his eye up and down her frame. 'You've lost ten pounds 
in three weeks.' 

'Fourteen,' she corrected. 'But who's counting? Are you still having trouble 
getting your green card?' 

'That's part of what we have to talk about,' he assured her. 'Things aren't 
exactly the way you think them, Maggi.' 

'I'm not blind, John. I can see. I was hoping you might tell me, instead of 
making me dig it out.' 

'Yes, well.' The waiter interrupted them. John looked 'considerably relieved 
at the appearance. 'What's good to eat in New Bedford?' 

Maggi straightened up and shook her head in disgust. Every time she 
approached the door to his character something slammed it shut again! 
'We're a fishing port,' she answered. 'Try the New England clam chowder 
for starters. And the boiled lobster. The asparagus is nice—maybe a tossed 
salad?' 

He was easily pleased. He collected her menu and his own and returned 
them to the waiter. 'For two,' he ordered. 'And a whiskey sour for 
me—Maggi?' 



'Hmm?' It was hard to concentrate her attention on the conversation when, 
augmented by candled shadows, he looked so attractive. And wasn't that a 
surprise! It hardly seemed a breath ago that she had thought of him as ugly! 

'Drink?' 

'Yes, please. A—Martini.' 

The chowder and the drinks arrived at the same time. Thick, succulent 
chowder, heavy with milk and cream and clam juice and a few slices of 
potato. 

'It actually has clams in it,' John commented as he spooned up the last of the 
cup. 

'Why, of course.' She set her spoon aside and searched out the corners of his 
face. He was not to be allowed to escape completely. 'Now, tell me about it. 
You're not really interested in a green card, are you?' 

'I shouldn't say that. I am interested, but I don't stand much chance of getting 
one.' One of his strong brown hands came across the narrow table and took 
hers. 'No, Maggi. No green card, no permanent emigration for me. And 
that's what we have to talk about.' 

Maggi's throat was blocked. No emigration for me? Nothing to keep him in 
Dartmouth? Only the babies were the tenuous line that held him close? She 
shivered. 

'Air-conditioning?' he asked anxiously. 

'No—nothing. Nerves. Tell me about your— family—in Ireland?''All right. 
There's myself and three sisters. My father owned the farm in Roscommon, 
outside the town of Tulsk. We live in a tiny village, to be sure. And we own 
a considerable amount of land in the mountains, over the border in Mayo.' A 
bigger grin. 'I've got to go down to Connecticut tomorrow—an overnight 
trip. Think you can handle things?' 



And how's that for caring? her conscience nudged at her. You're working 
too hard, Maggi. You're losing weight. You look like a skeleton. So he's 
going to help out by running off to Connecticut. Whoever heard of a more 
ridiculous state? Only the people who live there can spell it! Probably he has 
some woman down in Hartford, just waiting for him! Maggi, who hadn't 
talked to herself for at least a year, was struck speechless—for a time. 'Try 
spelling Massachusetts,' she muttered bitterly. 

'What?' John looked at her, his head cocked to one side. 

'Nothing. I was just clearing my throat. Of course I can handle things. We 
girls are getting along fine!' 

'I don't doubt that part. Now, where were we?' 

'You have a family in Ireland,' she prompted. 

'So I do. A fine farm, and a county-wide law practice.' 

'You can make a living at law?' 

He chuckled. 'America may have the most lawyers in the world, Maggi, but 
Ireland has the most lawsuits. Per capita, that is. Yes, I make a living at it. 
Not a great living, but a living. So you see, my home is there. I have sisters 
to support—until I can marry them off, of course.' 

'Of course,' muttered Maggi, unable to define why there should be such a 
pain in her heart. 

'And my mother still lives in Ballydooley. Loves the big cities, she does.' He 
waited for her to laugh, but she didn't understand the joke. Ballydooley was 
a nice town, but hardly a metropolis. 'So that's part of the problem,' he said 
moodily. 

'I—still don't understand.' 



He reached over the table again and took her hand. 'You're a fine broth of a 
lass,' he said softly, 'but our worlds are far apart. I have obligations in 
Ireland, and you have obligations here in Dartmouth.' 

'And that means?' 

'And that means that one day soon I must go. I came to transact some 
business, Maggi. The bringing of the babes was incidental. My business 
here in the States would be more profitable and more quickly realised if I 
were an American citizen—but that seems to be out of the question. So I 
need to work at something until the deal I've started comes of age, and then I 
have to go home. A farm and a law practice just can't prosper when the man 
of the house is on the other side of the water. Nor could I abandon my hopes 
in Ireland, not with my mother and sisters so dependent on them. You do 
understand?' 

No! No, I don't understand! she wanted to shout at him, but her pride stifled 
the words. 'So this is some sort of declaration,' she challenged him. 'You've 
been blowing hot and cold for weeks now, but you don't really want me?' 

He groaned. 'I'm saying that there's no permanent relationship possible 
between us. I didn't say I don't want you. A man would be a fool to live in 
the same house with a woman like you and not want her.' 

'Then I think you'd better explain in more detail,' she snapped. 

'Explain?' His voice rose high enough to attract attention from the 
neighbouring tables. His hand locked on her wrist like a handcuff as he 
swallowed and tried again, softly. 'It's very simple,' he half whispered. 'I 
want you well enough, Maggi Brennan, but I can't have you. I'm doing my 
best not to reach out and take you, girl. There's still a little bit of honour left 
in the Dailey clan. But some days you're harder to refuse than others. And 
I'm not sure how long I can hold out. Now, how does one attack this red 
little monster on my plate?' 

So she explained, carefully, about New England lobsters, about the bib 
provided, the claw-breakers, the meat picks, and while he ate with gusto she 
moved her hands mechanically, and her mind played tricks on her. John is 



going home to Ireland—soon. And I'm going to stay in Dartmouth with the 
children, and cry a lot! And Child Services is going to take the kids away 
because I'm not married, and I'll grow into a bent little widow—and heaven 
help me, I've fallen in love with this crazy Irishman! But he's going home to 
Ireland soon, and in the meantime maybe he will or won't seduce me, and I 
don't think I have the strength to resist if he does. That last bit sprang up out 
of nowhere, and left her trembling at the strength of its passion! 

She managed a great deal of meaningless conversation to boot, told him 
about her Yankee mother and her Portuguese father, and about the decline 
of New England farming, and the dangers in being a fisherman, and—just to 
get even with the hurt he had inadvertently done her—how much she had 
loved Robert, and how happy her marriage had been. 

After the meal he led her out on to the pier and they stood for a time, looking 
out over the bay, he with his arm around her shoulders, she holding herself 
in, fighting against the pain. And so when he took her home again they were 
both disgruntled, and lied to each other about how happy a night it had been. 

'I've checked the twins,' she told him a few minutes later. 'Aunt Eduarda is 
fast asleep in my bed, and now I think I'll take Mike for a walk.' 

The dog, who understood a few words like 'Mike' and 'walk' and didn't 
enthuse about the latter, sidled out of the door and went to hide in the 
kitchen. Maggi watched enviously, and then turned to study John's face as 
he picked up the paper—and found those dark eyes of his studying her over 
the top of his page. He's going to Connecticut tomorrow, she thought. A 
woman waiting for him down in Hartford, perhaps? Nonsense. My man 
wouldn't do a thing like that! Hah! But he isn't my man! 

Mike was doing his best to blend in with the kitchen rug when Maggi came 
out looking for her jacket. 'Are you coming?' 

The massive old dog closed his eyes. I'm sleeping, the message came. 'You 
old fake,' Maggi muttered, but she left him where he lay, and went out into 
the cool of the night. 



The walk was probably the best thing that could have happened to her. She 
wandered up the hill by the barn, circled the chicken coops, and climbed 
further to the boundary of her land to look over the fence at the construction 
site, where buildings were in confusing stages of completion. 'And that's 
what I ought to do,' she told herself disgustedly. 'Sell off the land. Why end 
up as the last farmer in Dartmouth?It's like catching a space-available ticket 
on the Titanic! And so she walked the perimeter of her land, kicked at the 
lumps of earth, and came in again just after midnight, strangely refreshed. 
The babies were upstairs in their crib, fast asleep. Maggi peeped in, then 
looked in across the hall. John Dailey was hunched over the little desk in his 
room, half shadowed by the light of the lamp, resting his chin in the cup of 
one hand. There was a harried, brooding look on his face. 

Fearing that he might hear, Maggi slipped out of her shoes and stole back to 
the spare room. A shower, a brief read, and before the clock struck one she 
was fast asleep, a tossing, restless sleep. A dream bothered her—her 
grandmother's face, young and hauntingly beautiful. 'Love the man, not his 
land,' the face repeated. '/ never hesitated when my man wanted to leave the 
Old Country.' 

When the babies woke her up in the morning at five-thirty, John was gone. 
The sun immediately lost its sparkle, the house reverted to gloom, and 
suddenly Maggi felt an intense loneliness settle in on her. 

The babies noticed the new atmosphere immediately, and became fretful. 
Pru refused any of her cereal; Prissy could not be satisfied with her bottle. 
Maggi-tried walking them one at a time, with no good result. In the end she 
yelled for help, and Aunt Eduarda hurried to the rescue. They each put one 
of the babies to their shoulder, camped out in the rocking-chairs, and 
managed to subdue, if not satisfy them. The whole affair taught her a lesson. 
It was easier to be a mother to two cheerful kids than almost anything. 

The hens were not all that co-operative either. The season was fast 
approaching where calcium was in short supply, and so all the eggs were 
thin-shelled, easily cracked, and markets did not buy eggs that were already 
cracked. They might sell them, but they didn't buy them. That afternoon 
Maggi called and made an appointment with Dr Jonas, one of the 
paediatricians in the nearby Dartmouth Medical Plaza. 



The following day was worse. It rained. There was nothing more dismal 
than a dank drizzle in New England. The whole world turned dark. Things 
that had the tendency, ached. The world withdrew inside itself, except for 
the milkman, the paper-boy, and the postperson. And if one lived in a house 
with a leaky roof, well--! 

So the babies were fed and cuddled and left to play, and the adults ate kale 
soup and home-baked bread, and Aunt Eduarda was pleased by it all. 'It's 
about time we had some decent Portuguese food on the table,' the old lady 
grumbled. 

'Yes,' Maggi returned absentmindedly. 'I wonder where I could get an Irish 
cookbook.' 

'You must be doente,' her aunt muttered as she spooned another plate of 
soup. 'Sick over that man!' 

'Not me,' Maggi defended stoutly. 'I wonder if it's hard to learn Gaelic?' Her 
aunt gave her a withering look. And the next morning Maggi called the 
bank. 

 

'Mortgage?' Mr Oliviera was a dry stick of a man who examined each word, 
turned it over and upside- down, before letting it slip out of his mouth. He 
was also the senior loan officer at her bank, and an old friend of her father's 
in the local Shriners' lodge. 'Why, yes, Margaret, the-bank could certainly 
grant you a mortgage. On the house or the land?' 

'I—hadn't considered,' she said and sighed. 

'But you have to remember, caro,' he rumbled on, as if she hadn't said a 
word, 'that when you mortgage you have to pay. What sort of income do you 
have to make payments from?' 

'I—hadn't thought that far.' Glumly said. Maggi Brennan, idiot first class, 
she told herself. Pull up your socks and get down to the nitty-gritty! 



'Then I recommend that you think some more. Now would be a good time to 
sell the land. Not all of it, perhaps—say twenty acres?' 

'I—I hate to sell the land,' she repeated, 'but my taxes are due, the roof leaks, 
and if I can't fix it the babies will--' 

'Babies? Yes, I did hear something about babies. What does your father say, 
Margaret?' 

She noticed the switch to formality. Not Maggi any more, but Margaret. It 
set her back up. 'It's my farm,' she snapped. 'My father is a nice man, and he's 
in Florida, and needless long-distance calls are a waste of money, and—how 
do I go about selling the land? I don't want that man Swanson to get his 
hands on--' 

'I understand. Let me ask around, spread the word in the, right places, and--' 

'And then who can I get to come right away to fix the roof? I can't wait.' 

'Ah, that I know,' Mr Oliviera answered, chuckling. 'I have two hungry sons 
in the construction business. I should send them?' 

'You should send them,' Maggi agreed. 'Muito obrigado, Uncle Manny.' She 
stood for a moment with the instrument in her hand as he chuckled and hung 
up. And that's what friends are for, she told herself. Or relatives, no matter 
how distant. But I don't have any relatives in Ireland! 

Before the day was out the two Oliviera boys came by, as hungry for 
business as their father had indicated, and willing to perform on credit, 
having been assured by Uncle Manny that Maggi was a sound customer. So 
when John came back late the next day the yard was already strewn with 
equipment and supplies, and half the bedrooms were unusable. 

'So the babies and I will be using your room,' she summed up for him. 'It's 
only for a few days, of course.' And I'm the owner, and I'm the boss, and he's 
only a nanny, for goodness' sake, she told herself firmly. So why am I 
shaking all over? 'And you'll have to use the couch until they get through!' 
And there, she told herself, that was firm enough—wasn't it? 



'But the couch is too small for me,' he grumbled. 

'I have an old sleeping-bag,' she offered as an alternative. 'You could sleep 
in the living-room in front of the fireplace.' 

'Somehow I knew I'd be in trouble,' he said. But though his voice was 
complaining, his eyes were sparkling at her. 'Do I have to fight the. dog for 
position in the pecking order? He likes to sleep by the fire.' 

'That's entirely up to you male types,' she told him primly. 'A mere female 
like me wouldn't dare intervene.' 

 

'Would you excuse us for a moment, Aunt Eduarda?' He was out of his chair 
before the old lady could respond. Around the table, behind Maggi, hepulled 
her chair back from the table and swung her up out of her seat, with her feet 
dangling four or five inches off the floor. 

'I'm glad to see you too, mere female,' he murmured in her ear, and then he 
kissed Her. 

'That's not fair,' she complained as he set her down, still holding her against 
his muscled chest. 

'If there's anything I've learned,' he told her, grinning at her aunt over 
Maggi's shoulder, 'it's that it doesn't pay to be fair when you're arguing with 
Maggi Brennan.' 

'Show-off,' she muttered, but was not entirely displeased. 

'I'll get the dishes,' Aunt Eduarda said complacently. Notice she's not 
startled to see me kiss the help, Maggi's conscience nagged. Probably he 
does it all the time. 

'I'll go and move the furniture. Are you going to help, Maggi?' 



'Lord, no. It's my time to play with the girls, and after the dishes are done I'll 
give them a bath. No, furniture moving is for big strong men. Isn't that so, 
Auntie?' 

'I hate that title,' that worthy said, rolling up her sleeves. 'Call me Tia—a 
good Portuguese word.' 

John chuckled at the evasion. 

Maggi stalked over to stand directly in front him, intending to do him a 
serious damage, but before either of her hands could move he swept her up 
in a bear-hug. 'Put me down,' she demanded. 'I don't see a single thing to 
laugh about. I'm going to--' 

'I'm sure you are,' he interrupted. And kissed her again. 

There was nothing for it after that. Gasping for breath, Maggi leaned against 
the wall, wondering why the joints in her knees were so fluid. John winked 
one eye at her and headed up the stairs, in full possession of all his faculties. 
But if kissing doesn't bother him at all, she thought, why is he perspiring so 
much? 

'Bless you,' Maggi muttered cynically at his retreating back. 'You're really 
worth having, after all. You think!' 

'What was that?' asked Aunt Eduarda. 

'I said bless us,' Maggi repeated. 'Lucky the babies are so small!' 

'Yes, isn't it?' the aunt returned. 'And thank goodness you have a dishwasher 
machine now.' 

'I do?' Maggi looked vaguely around the room, now crowded with shining 
white appliances, and stamped her foot as the anger rose. 'When did he 
sneak that in?' 

  



CHAPTER SIX 

'LET me say one thing for you,' said Dr Jonas. 'I'm happy to see that you 
don't insist on dressing the twins in identical clothes. You can't begin too 
early emphasising that they are two separate and distinct individuals. You 
make a good mother, Mrs Brennan.' 

Maggi shook her head and glanced over at John. They had both tried to 
explain the situation to the receptionists. Four separate explanations, in fact, 
in the past half-hour. John shrugged his shoulders, as if to say, 'Let them 
have it their way.' 

Maggi, made uncomfortable by the whole idea, winced and started to 
explain yet again, only to be interrupted by the doctor. 

'Despite all their travelling, and their environmental changes, the babies are 
in excellent shape,' he rambled on. 'I don't see any major problems in either 
of them. They are both right at the proper developmental point. You should 
be giving them more liberties now. They're ready to crawl, and they need 
some range-of-motion exercises, as I illustrated to you— preferably just 
after their baths. And one more thing. Raising tVvins is sometimes harder 
on the parents than it is on the children. You should hire some help. At least 
once a week you both need to be away from the babies, off by yourself.' 

'But we don't get out much,' Maggi volunteered. John frowned down at her, 
as if she were revealing the location of the family fortune. 

'You don't have to go out,' the doctor added, chuckling. 'Go upstairs 
together, lock the door behind you, and do what comes naturally. 
Anything to get away from the kids!' 

'Well!' Maggi exclaimed. 

'Sounds good to me.' John was laughing at her. She refused to look 
up, to meet his eyes. And what she was thinking she had no intention 
of letting him know. 



'And that's all I can tell you,' the doctor said. 'Obviously you're doing 
something right. Just keep at it. Level-headed, and stuff like that.' 

'Don't worry, we're raising them by the book,' John said. 'I'm keeping 
a firm hand on Maggi's wild ideas.' Both he and the doctor laughed. 

All men must have their little foibles, Maggi told herself grimly. They 
shift on a second's notice from arrogant dictators to lovable small 
boys. And throughout it all they think we women haven't the brains to 
come in out of the rain! If I ever have a baby I'm going to insist on a 
female paediatrician. Preferably one with children of her own! 

She was still fuming as they made their way down the hall of the 
practically new medical-office building, and out into the sunshine of 
Dartmouth Medical Plaza. Prissy rode in a backpack with one tiny fist 
clutching John's thick hair, gabbling all the way. Pru was lording it 
over the world quietly in a cuddle-pack resting on Maggi's breast. 

'That was very clever of you, dressing them differently,' said John. 

Yes, clever, she told herself. I started the day late and never did catch up, so 
I dressed them in whatever ^^ came to hand. What a clever, clever woman 
am I! Butrather than admit it, she offered him a sunny smile and walked on 
into the stream of pedestrians roaming the Plaza. 

'Maggi! Maggi Paiva!' The shout came from halfway across the open Plaza. 
Maggi stopped and turned. John continued, wrapped up in his own thoughts. 
A young man was racing in her direction. He was of medium height, blond 
as a Viking, thin, dressed in a three-piece grey suit, the epitome of good 
looks and sophistication. 

'Henry? Henry Peterson!' Memories, flashbacks. Henry Peterson at her high 
school prom. He had danced with her once. He hadn't worn gloves at the 
dance. She could remember his cold hand running up and down her spine, 
unlimited by her practically backless evening gown. The son of a 
moderately wealthy family with great aspirations. The best catch in the 
whole school—until she had met Robert, of course. And not seen 



since—when? Since their fifth class reunion, years ago! And here he was, 
with a big grin on his face, sweeping her up and swinging her in a circle. 

'Maggi Paiva,' he said with a gusty sigh. 'How long has it been?' 

'Several years,' she recounted, and pushed him away. Prudence, crushed 
between the two of them, wailed: He moved back, embarrassed. 

'Oh, dear,' he apologised. 'I didn't realise you had a child, Maggi. I read in 
the paper that Robert died--' 

'Five years ago,' she reminded him. 'But I--' 

'She doesn't have one, she has two.' John was back, towering over the pair of 
them. If looks could kill they would both have been dead, Maggi thought. 

'Two of them?' Henry moved a step or two further back, a discouraged look 
on his face. 

Maggi stole a quick look up at John's face. He's playing dog-in-the-manger, 
her conscience reported. Don't let him get away with it! Henry is a very 
handsome young man! She muttered as she wheeled on him and glared. 

'They're not mine,' she told Henry over her shoulder. 'They belong to—I'm 
their--' and then stopped, because it was too hard to explain. The two men 
stared at each, like a pair of pit bulls circling. 'Mr Dailey brought them over 
from Ireland.' 

'So that's the way of it,' Henry said. 'Baby-minder.' He threw another glare at 
John, who seemed to be gritting his teeth. 'Look, Maggi, we have a million 
things to talk over. Why don't we get together over a drink?' 

'I'd like that,' Maggi agreed softly. She had no idea what Henry might want 
to talk about, but watching John steam in the background did something for 
her ego. 'Why don't you come out to the house? I'm living at my 
grandfather's farm. You know the way?' 

'Indeed I do. Remember when we had that hayride just before Christmas?' 



Lord, do I remember, Maggi thought. He didn't pay me a minute's worth of 
attention. I didn't have the build I have now. But when Gramps caught him 
in the hayloft with those two cheerleaders, boy, did we all remember that! 'I 
remember,' she murmured. 

'How about tomorrow night?' 

'That would be fine. About eight?' 

'About eight,' he agreed as he leaned forward to kiss the tip of her nose. He 
walked away jauntily, hands in pockets, whistling. 

'So what happened on. that hay ride?' John demanded. His scowl was dark 
enough to bring monsoon rains. 

'Nothing,' Maggi said. 'It's really none of your business.' 

'None of my business?' he thundered. 'What the hell do you mean, none of 
my business?' 

'Well, I'm not married to you,' she returned heatedly. 'Thank heaven for little 
favours. You've blown hot and cold for long enough. There's nothing in our 
relationship except business, Mr Dailey. And if I decide to go out with 
Henry, it has nothing to do with you. You just do your duties, and keep your 
hands to yourself, and we'll get along fine! And if that embarrasses you, all 
you have to do is stop shouting, then nobody in the Plaza will know about 
it!' 

'I wasn't shouting,' he muttered. 'I never shout. I never lose my temper! 
Come on, Pru isn't going to stop fussing if you don't walk her!' 

Which was all true, Maggi reflected. About Pru fussing as long as they stood 
still, that was. Never loses his temper? Hah! I'll twist his tail again a time or 
two! Maggi began to move slowly along at his side, close enough so that the 
twins could see and assure each other. Ideas raced through her brain. Hold it, 
her conscience insisted. Try anything like that and he'll beat up on you. 
That's like trying to soothe Stromboli with Alka-Seltzer tablets! But it had 
been a good idea, and she hated to give it up. 



'There's nothing to it, John. Henry's just an old acquaintance. We were in 
school together.' 

'An old boyfriend, was he?' 

'Not exactly,' Maggi admitted. 'And, to tell the truth, I can't understand why 
he popped up so suddenly. He never--' You don't have to tell him 
everything, her conscience interrupted. So Henry never paid you a bit of 
attention. There's no need to broadcast that to the world! 

'He never what?' 

'Nothing.' Maggi sighed. Pru had stopped crying, lulled by the movement 
and the warmth. If only John could be soothed as easily as Prudence, she 
thought. Maybe he deserves more information. 'Nothing happened at the 
hayride,' she told him. 'That is, nothing happened between him and me. He 
remembers the wrong woman.' 

'Well, that's some consolation,' the man beside her grumbled. 

Yes, Maggi thought. Some, but not much. Why is he acting like a 
sore-headed bear? Obviously we haven't heard the end of this little episode! 

 

What with one thing and another, Maggi was hardly any further ahead at 
eight o'clock the following evening, dithering as she stood in front of her 
wardrobe. The children had been moved back into their own room after the 
roof was repaired, and John was in the nursery now doing his best—or 
worst—to sing them to sleep. 

'So I'll try the blue,' Maggi decided as she consulted her watch. She really 
had little choice. Four 'nice' dresses, and a wardrobe full of jeans and 
blouses. So the blue would have to do. It was the newest of the lot, barely 
five years old. She slipped it on over her white slip. It fitted a little more 
loosely then she remembered, not clinging so closely to herwell-rounded 
hips, flowing outward in a wide skirt just at her knees, moulding her full 
breasts. The little white Peter Pan collar provided a demure match for the 



touch of lace on each sleeve. Although, it was one of those dresses that 
showed nothing—but revealed everything. She turned back and forth in 
front of her mirror and smiled. Henry Peterson truly meant nothing to her, 
but what woman didn't like to try out her weapons from time to time? The 
dress swished as she-- 'Wriggle my rear,' she muttered. 'I'll do it whenever I 
wish!' It was an item which had risen more than once, to John's anger. 

Downstairs, Aunt Eduarda was giving the kitchen a final turn-out. Since the 
arrival of the babies the old lady had thrown off her retreat from the world 
and taken an active interest in everything that went on. She came smiling to 
the living-room door as she heard Maggi come down the stairs. 

'Is this the young man who telephoned? Said he just had to know where you 
were, so I told him you were at the doctor's.' 

So how about that? Maggi thought. Our meeting wasn't all that spontaneous 
after all. Henry knew exactly where to look when he decided to accidentally 
bump into her. Oh, well, women are schemers too, and as a matter of fact I 
like men who put a lot of thought into the pursuit. 

'Oh, my,' her aunt commented as Maggi pirouetted to show off. 'My, what a 
lovely thing you are, my dear! That's what we used to call "wickedly 
demure" in my day.' 

Maggi halted in mid-stride. 'Not too overdone, is it?' 

'Not the slightest.' Aunt Eduarda grinned at her. 'It's fine enough even for 
churchgoing. You're not responsible for what men think, my dear.' There 
came a knock on the front door. 'And there he is now. I'll leave coffee on the 
stove. Now that I have my own television set up in my room I won't have to 
disturb you for a minute.' 

'I don't want to drive you away,' Maggi protested. 

'And I don't want to be the fifth wheel on this wagon,' the older woman 
remarked as she made for the stairs. Maggi watched her go, stood in front of 
the wall mirror to smooth both dress and hair, and went for the door. The 
knock sounded again. 



She stood at the door, trying to calm down. Not since before her wedding 
had she dated a man, and she was uncertain and anxious. Things did change 
over the course of the years. Anybody who told you you hadn't changed in 
years was probably trying to sell you a used car. Or a bridge. She wiped the 
palm of her hand on the handkerchief balled up in her fist, and reached for 
the doorknob. 

'Good evening,' Henry Peterson said. 'Look at you. You haven't changed a 
bit, Maggi!' 

Maggi gulped as she almost swallowed her tongue. She waved him in and 
closed the door behind him. In the soft glow of the lamps he appeared not so 
angular. He was meticulously dressed, and carried a little spray of gardenias 
which he pressed on her. 

She fumbled. Flowers had not been her thing since her brother-in-law Jake 
had smashed up her old car and tried to make amends. 'Thank you, Henry,' 
she managed to get out. 'Won't you sit down?' 

He scanned the furniture, and chose the couch. Cautiously Maggi backed 
into the kitchen and found a vase that would do. 'Sit here by me,' Henry 
invited, patting the cushions beside him. Maggi gave him a timid smile and 
chose the chair opposite. 

'I want to be able to see you,' she explained. He seemed to take that as some 
sort of compliment. She could see him swell inside his tan suit. 

'It's been a long time, Henry.' 

'Yes, a long time. But there was Robert, of course, and he and I didn't get 
along well.' 

'I didn't know that.' She squirmed to plant both feet on the floor. The chair 
had been built with a deep seat, for big men like Robert—and John Dailey, 
she thought. So with her feet flat on the floor she occupied about 
three-quarters of the chair and had nothing to lean against. 'What have you 
been doing with yourself?' 



'Oh, this and that. I went off to college, you know.' 

She didn't, but hated to admit it, so she nodded and smiled. Curious, her 
conscience interrupted. Most men would say 'I graduated from college'. 
Why this 'I went off to college'? 'How nice. And now?' 

'I'm in the real estate business,' he continued. 

'Oh? I thought you might be at the bank. Your father was something at First 
Bristol, wasn't he?' 

'I thought I might try banking.' Henry was looking very embarrassed indeed. 
'The old man wanted me to—a father-and-son team, so to speak. But then I 
discovered I wasn't—compatible. So I switched.' 

'A wise thing to do,' she acknowledged. 'Although I like First Bristol. I do 
all my banking there.' 

'I know.' He grinned across the space that separated them. 'I hear your name 
mentioned from time to time. Only this week, for a fact, Dad mentioned you 
at the dinner table. That's why I decided to get in touch with you.' 

And what do you say to something like that? Maggi did. 'Oh, really?' 

'How about that drink you promised me?' 

She was up out of her chair like a shot. 'Bourbon? Scotch?' 

'Scotch on the rocks,' he said, and got up to come over behind her. The little 
cabinet-cum-bar sat in the far corner of the room. As she stretched for the 
Scotch he leaned over past her and reached it down, his body pressing 
against her back. 'I remember, Maggi,' he breathed into her ear. 'You were 
always one hot lady.' 

She moved away, disconcerted more by the smell of his after-dinner mints 
than his words. 'Was I? I don't—quite remember it that way.' His hand 
reached in her direction. She filled it with his drink glass. At least that kept 
one of his hands occupied. 



'Don't you remember that football rally in our senior year?' he coaxed. 'We 
went up into the project booth at the gym. Remember? That was a pretty 
wild hour or so, I sure remember.' 

'You almost got expelled,' she returned in a confiding tone. 

'I knew you'd remember.' He laughed. 'We ought to take up where we left 
off.' 

'There's only one problem,' she told him, pushing him firmly away. 'That 
was Mary Anstruther, not me. She married, you know—a great big guy who 
works down on the dock. You want to be careful what you remember about 
Mary. He's a very possessive type of fellow.' 

'There must be some mistake,' he muttered, taking quick refuge in the glass 
of Scotch in his hand. 'Probably,' she said, sighing. 'I was always the shy 
one. Sometimes I wish it could have been me that had all those 
adventures—but life's like that. 

Henry took that as some sort of forgiveness. His grin returned, and he 
moved back to the sofa to regroup. 'You're not drinking?' 

'I never do,' she replied softly. 'Nor smoke.' 

'Well,' he said, fumbling to get his cigarette case out of sight, 'tell me about 
yourself.' 

'There's not much to tell. After I graduated I took a secretarial course, but 
never cared for the work. And then Robert took me away from all that—and 
then— and then I've done odds and ends of things ever since. You know, I 
was never the ambitious type. And you? You never married?' 

He shifted uneasily in his chair and finished off his drink. 'Yes, I married. 
But it didn't work out. She was a real nag, Betty was. Do this, do that, jump! 
And her father—a big faker. He lived like a millionaire, but all on borrowed 
money. They finally sent him to the slammer for embezzlement, and we 
were divorced.' He lifted his empty glass up and rolled it around in the light. 



Maggi jumped at the hint, refilled the glass, and returned to her original seat. 
But Henry had acquired a little Dutch courage and wanted none of that. 
'Over here,' he demanded, patting the couch cushion beside him. 

So why not? Maggi thought. The whole idea was to try for a little adventure, 
wasn't it? The whole idea, her conscience nagged, was to make John Dailey 
jealous. Come on, babe! She made a face and came over to Henry's side. 

The couch was old, from her grandmother's day. As soon as she sat down 
the springs sagged, throwing her against Henry's thigh. 

'What a good idea,' he muttered, and tossed down his second drink. 'So I 
hear that you're thinking of selling the farm?' And immediately Maggi 
understood why her high school hero had come to look her up. 

'Perhaps,' she said, sighing. 'I was thinking about it. Not very hard, you 
understand, but thinking.' 

'Now isn't that something?' he murmured, shifting his body in her direction 
so that his shoulder was behind hers. His empty hand fell on her knee. His 
eyes were so close that she could almost see the dollar signs in them. 

And this is where it's supposed to become interesting, Maggi told herself. 
Just hang on for a moment, and all sorts of things will happen. Just as soon 
as I get over the disgusted feeling I have! How much is rumour saying? That 
I plan to sell off the whole place? 

'It's not true,' she told him gently. 

'What's not true?' 

'It's not true that she's a hot kid.' The voice came from the middle of the 
stairs, where John Dailey was standing, half in the dark. Maggi jumped like 
some fourteen-year-old whose father had just caught her making out with 
the boy next door. Luckily Henry's glass was empty, for it clattered to the 
floor and rolled against the wall. Mike came in from the kitchen to 
investigate; John came all the way down the stairs and stood in front of the 
fireplace, gazing moodily into the embers. 



'Well, really!' Maggi gave both dog and man as dirty a look as she could 
summon up. The dog came over to the sofa and lay down in front of her, his 
muzzle resting on her shoe top. John moved over to the rocking-chair and 
sat down, picking up*the evening paper. 

'Don't let me bother you young people,' he said from behind the paper. 'I've 
been so busy I didn't have a chance to catch up on the news.' 

'I think I'd like to have another drink,' Henry said. 

'I think I'll join you,' Maggi muttered. 

'In that case, I'll have one too,' said John from behind his paper fortress. 'The 
usual, Maggi. And go easy on the Scotch for yourself. You know how sick it 
made you the last time.' 

She might have said something really nasty, but unfortunately what he said 
was true. A true believer in non-drinking, John had driven her to it with his 
tongue, with disastrous results. And now here he was doing it again! 
Grinding her teeth together to keep from answering, she went over to the bar 
and made them each a drink. 'I'm having coffee, myself,' she stated flatly. 

'Good idea,' John returned. 'Know anything about babies, Peters?' 

'Peterson,' Henry returned cautiously. 'No, I don't know anything about 
babies. Can't say that I'm interested. Do you live here?' 

From out in the kitchen Maggi strained to hear the answer, and managed to 
burn her finger on the coffeepot. By the time she returned to the living-room 
John was lecturing, Henry was leaning back on the sofa with a defeated look 
on his face, and Mike had withdrawn to his favourite place in front of the 
fireplace. Defiantly Maggi returned to the couch. 

'Don't let us tie you up, John,' she interrupted. 'I'm sure Henry isn't interested 
in babies. Not every man is.' 

'You are surely right,' John agreed. 



The agreement surprised her; his warm, slippery tone frightened her. John 
Dailey, wheeler-dealer, was up to something big! 

'That's a shame, too,' John continued. 'Knowing how much you're interested 
in children, Maggi, I doubt if any man who didn't like babies would stand a 
chance with you!' 

'Oh, I'm interested.' Henry, startled out of his confusion, made a desperate 
attempt to get back into Maggi's favour. 'Of course I'm interested. Carrying 
on the family name, and all that. Who wouldn't be?' 

'I'm glad to hear that,' John replied heartily. 'I have a couple of books and 
magazines here. You should look at them in your spare time. Anybody 
who's contemplating marriage ought to be up on this stuff.' 

He deposited the handful of books in Henry's lap with a thud. Maggi took a 
close look at her visitor. Henry Peterson looked less and less like a man 
contemplating marriage as every second ticked away. 'You need another 
drink,' she offered in comfort. 

'Not if he's driving,' John warned. 'Drunk driving is a terrible thing these 
days.' Before Maggi could think of a suitable response there was a tiny wail 
from upstairs, followed shortly by another. Both babies were complaining. 
'Your turn.' John gestured towards the stairs. 

It really wasn't her turn, according to the careful rota they had established. 
He was responsible for thebabies from six at night until two in the morning. 
But Maggi had become so conditioned that she bounded up the stairs as fast 
as she could go. The nursery was not quite dark; a tiny seven-watt 
night-lamp was plugged into the baseboard socket. 

Maggi snatched at little Pru. She had known, without knowing how, that Pru 
was the one who began the crying. More dominating Prissy had joined in for 
the fun of it. She cuddled Pru and walked the floor a few times, her eyes 
busy searching. One of the curtain rods had fallen down; the clatter had 
probably awakened the baby. A few more steps and Pru, tired from a day 
full of exercise, was fast asleep. 



As soon as her sister—her partner-in-crime, Maggi told herself—went silent 
Prissy gave up and rolled over. Another few minutes to be sure they were 
settled, and then Maggi carefully sorted out the curtain rod. It was not 
something once could fix in the dark; its replacement would be added to the 
long list of tasks already on the list for tomorrow. But at this exact moment 
Maggi had an immensely important job to do. She crept out of the room on 
her rubber-soled shoes and almost ran down the stairs. John was behind his 
newspaper again. 

'Where—where's Henry?' she snapped at him. 

The top of the paper lowered just far enough for his eyes fo show. His 
innocent, naive eyes. 'Your boyfriend? Oh, he said something about a 
previous engagement. And he said he'd call you again soon.' The paper 
snapped back up again. Maggi bounced off the last two stairs and stalked 
across the room to confront him. The dog scented the air and scampered for 
the kitchen. 

'Just what the hell do you think you're doing?' 

'Who, me?' The paper lowered about halfway. 'Reading the paper. Did you 
see where Mike Greenwald is going to hold out? That kid wants more than a 
million dollars to play for the Red Sox. Can you--?' Maggi snatched the 
paper out of his hands and very slowly began to shred it, page by page. 
'Hey!' he objected. 'I haven't finished the--' 

'Believe me, you've finished,' she told him grimly. 'Now just what the hell 
do you think you were doing?' 

'Stamp your foot,' he suggested. 

'I will,' she threatened. 'Right on your head I'll stamp. Well?' 

'This is hardly fair,' he murmured. 'I ought to have time to consult with my 
lawyer.' 

'If you don't get to it,' she spluttered, 'I'll—I'll--' But her anger was too much 
for her, and the words tumbled around and got trapped in her mouth. 



'Interesting,' he said. 'You seem to have a terrible case of distemper.' He was 
up on his feet, trapping her in those two massive arms, before she could take 
evasive action. 'Now listen, Maggi.' He gently pulled her head flat against 
his chest and held it there with one hand, while the other coursed her back. 
'The guy is a loser—a real loser. Whatever he's interested in, it's not your 
delectable little body—well, at least seduction is only his secondary interest. 
I don't know what's leading the little man on—but even if he's sincere he's 
not for you.' 

'So tell me something I don't know,' she muttered. 'Whatever gave you the 
right to come down here and poke yourself into my life like that? You had 
no right!' 

'No right? Maggi!' His hand left her cheek and his fingers walked gently 
through her hair. 'Look, Mrs Brennan, you can't expect-anything else from 
me. There I was at the head of the stairs, listening while that pea-brained 
idiot made love to my girl. No red- blooded Irishman could put up with that!' 

She managed to push herself away from him, as much as an inch or two, far 
enough away so she could watch his face. 'I'm not your girl,' she said in 
anger. 'Watch my lips. I—am—not—your—girl!' 

'What?' His hands fastened on her shoulders and stood her off at arm's length 
while he examined her face. 'You're not my girl? That's a lie, isn't it?' 

It required a little more concentration, but she managed. 'I am not your girl,' 
she announced. 

He lifted both hands up in the air in a surrender gesture, and moved three or 
four steps back. 'Can I be wrong?' He sounded amazed. 'I was wrong once 
before, but that was twenty years ago. You're not my girl?' She nodded her 
head. His hands dropped to his sides. 'You're not my girl?' he asked 
mournfully. 

'Got it in one,' she said. 'I am not your girl.' And he's playing a game, she told 
herself. He's having more trouble keeping from laughing than I am. Besides, 
when he moved away he left me feeling—cold? Lonely? Disappointed? 



'Thrown over for a mutt like Henry Peterville,' he muttered. 

'Peterson,' she corrected. 'I can't stand him.' His grin spread. So did hers. 'All 
he wants is my money, and since I don't have any—well...' 

'You're not my girl? We have to test the theory.' He extended both arms in 
her direction. She rocked back and forth on her heels for a moment. Every 
time you give in to him, you make it that much more impossible to ever 
stand on your own feet, her conscience warned. Maggi struggled with the 
thought, and then flew across the intervening space and into those warm 
protective arms. 

'See?' he said disingenuously a moment or two later. 'Your body thinks that 
you're my girl.' 

'Maybe it knows more than I do.' She sighed contentedly. 'Convince me.' 

He kissed her. Three short words, supposedly all one needed to cover the 
contact of his warm moist lips, the penetration of his tongue beyond the 
barrier of her teeth, the fire that shot up and down her spine, the roiling in 
her stomach, and that maddening scream of want from further down. She 
trembled as her arms went up around his neck, pulling herself upward 
against the steel of him until one foot was off the ground and the other 
making contact only by toe. Both his hands were around her; the one pressed 
in the middle of her back, welding her to him, crushing her firm full breasts 
against his chest muscles. The other wandered south, made circles in the 
centre of her tiny waist, dropped to caress the round fullness of her hips and 
buttocks, and circled back again, and they finally ran out of breath. 

'You're not my girl?' he whispered in her ear as his arms still held her in 
thrall. 

'Maybe I am,' she gasped. 'Maybe.' 

'Another twenty seconds of this,' he warned, 'and there won't be any 
maybes.' 



A tiny bit of sanity tugged at Maggi's brain centres. She had been raised to 
strict disciplines, strong morals; caution dictated a stop. Her sigh was 
massive as she dropped her hands. He let her settle on her own feet again, 
but she could see the disconcerted look on his face. 

'Still only maybe?' 

'Still only maybe,' she agreed, stepping away from him. 'Propinquity, that's 
all it is.' 

'I guess so,' he said regretfully. 'Propin who?' 

'You know what it means,' she lectured. 'Lawyers know everything about 
words. It means we're living too close to each other. We've become too 
involved— because of the babies, of course.' 

'Yes, of course.' He definitely sounded mournful about the whole affair, her 
ears reported. 'Propinquity. I'll think about it.' 

'Where are you going?' He had one hand on the stair-rail, and already she 
regretted that she had stopped him. 

'I'm going upstairs,' he told her. That little grin was playing with the corners 
of his mouth again. 'I'm going to get a cold shower. And if you really want to 
preserve your—propinquity—you'd damn well better get out of my way!' 

Maggi jumped at the fierceness of his statement, clapping her hand over her 
mouth to shut off any smart remarks that might surface. He was gone in a 
second; in three she heard the shower rattle. Cold water? Does that really do 
any good? she asked herself. One of her hands wandered from her flank up 
over her breast and down again as she struggled with her own internal 
devils. 

There were glasses and cups all over the room. While her mind dreamed her 
practical hands went to work, picking up. The coffee in her mug was 
lukewarm; she drank it in one swallow, and wandered out to the kitchen 
with her hands full. Mike followed after her, wagging his tail in funereal 
beat. 



'Cold showers?' she asked the dog. 'Come on, let's take a walk.' For once in a 
dozen years the big Dalmatian came without a protest. Even the dog feels 
sorry for you, she told herself. You had your chance and you blew it. One 
day that man is going to get you in his bed and you'll be-- 

'Happy?' she muttered as she closed the door behind her and stepped out into 
the cool white moonlight. 

  



CHAPTER SEVEN . 

'HIM  again?' John Dailey was standing at the kitchen sink, supporting Prissy 
in her bath. The baby was all gurgles and smiles, kicking away at the water, 
while Pru, being held in the other end of the white-tiled sink, was leaning 
against Maggi's hand, fretting a little. Maggi was using her other hand to 
hang up the telephone. John did not exactly look best pleased. 

'Four nights this past week,' he grumbled. 'Doesn't he realise that you have 
work to do?' 

'True love,' Maggi said with a sigh as she batted her curly eyelashes. 'And 
flowers again today. Do you know, the last man to send me flowers was 
Herbe LeGrande, way back there on my fourteenth birthday!' And then, to 
the baby who was almost successful in sitting up by herself, 'Kick your feet, 
love. Exercise is good for you.' Prudence didn't agree. She whimpered. 

'That's a very long time ago,' John muttered. 

'Thanks a lot,' she snapped. 'I heard that. It wasn't as long ago as your 
fourteenth! And besides, Henry sent me that lovely box of chocolates for my 
birthday!' 

'I brought you a birthday present too,' he protested glumly. 'Doesn't that 
count?' 

'Of course it counts,' she said, feeling ready to chop him up into little pieces. 
It had been a difficult day, and she might well have tried to murder her 
mother, never mind John Dailey. 'But it's not a contest, you know.' The 
babies both splashed at the same time, catching him as he leaned over. He 
spluttered, wiped his eyes, and looked daggers at her. 

'If it is a contest, Peterson isn't within miles of the starting line.' 

Maggi, who had a considerable amount of water dripping down her face too, 
glared back at him. 'I was trying to be nice, but that doesn't pay, does it? 
Once you get into your black bear act there's no pleasing you. He sent me 



chocolates; you gave me a pair of scrubbing brushes for the bath tub. Now 
what kind of a gift was that?' 

'Why are you screaming at me like a fishwife?' 

'Because that's what I am!' she shouted. 'Robert was a fisherman and I was 
his wife! Why do you treat me as if you and I have been married for ten 
years?' 

'Twenty,' he grumbled. 'What does Peterson want?' 

'What else?' She picked Pru up and folded her into the warm towel. 'He 
wants me to go out with him Saturday night.' 

'You can't do that!' Prissy was giving him a hard time. Slippery as a little eel, 
the tiny creature was giggling and twisting and kicking. 'You can't do that,' 
he repeated as he finally captured the little rascal and bundled her up. 

'That's funny,' Maggi replied. 'I thought we'd settled that before now.' 

'Settled what?' 

'Use more powder,' she instructed. 'She's beginning another rash. I thought 
we'd settled that you don't tell me what to do.' 

'Well, somebody has to tell you,' he snapped. 'You know darn well what he 
wants.' 

'I'm not so sure.' She looked up at him as she stretched Pru out on the kitchen 
table. 'I thought at first he wanted my money, but I don't have any. Maybe 
it's my pure white body—or the farm? I keep forgetting that he's in real 
estate. Maybe I will  go out with him on Saturday.' 

'Lord, if he wants the farm give it to him,' grumbled John. 'Don't fool 
around. But watch that other bit. I want your pure white body for myself!' 



'Sure you do,' she said disgustedly. 'You want me at your own time and at 
your own convenience. You don't fool me a bit with that come-on of yours. 
You've got a good thing going for you here in my house--' 

'I don't know about that convenience business. And you're not exactly 
paying me a princely sum for looking after the children,' he reminded her. 

'Princely? Even at the going rate I'm not sure I'm getting my money's worth, 
so knock off the come- on!' 

'Come-on? Lady, you haven't seen come-on yet. You still can't go out with 
him on Saturday. That's the night we're taking off.' 

'What are you mumbling about now?' She was using only half her mind on 
the interchange. The other half was busy leading Prudence through her 
battery of little exercises. Ordinarily the little monkey would be all smiles. 
Tonight she was bothered by something. 

'Saturday night,' he repeated. 'Dr Jonas. Take a night off once a week. Go 
lock yourselves in your bedroom and see what happens. That night off.' 

She looked up at him, using one hand on Pru's stomach to hold her in place. 
There was caution in her eyes. 'I'm not too bright,' she said, 'but I didn't 
exactly come down in yesterday's rainstorm. Lock myself in a bedroom 
with you? What is this, feeding time at the zoo?' 

John shook his head in disgust. 'You can't really be Portuguese—I've heard 
that they're kindly people. How many bodies have you left by the roadside, 
killed with that rapier tongue of yours?' 

'I never keep track.' She looked up at him again. He had finished with 
Prissy, and was supporting the baby against his shoulder with one capable 
hand. He had never before said anything about her brittle wit. How could he 
know that she used it to protect herself, to cover up the marshmallow centre 
at the core of her being? 'John?' 

'Yes?' 



'I—don't mean to be—it's just the way I am. I'm sorry if—did you have 
something planned for Saturday night?' 

'In a manner of speaking. I've hired an LPN nurse to come in and watch the 
kids from six o'clock on. The American Ballet company is in town. They're 
performing Swan Lake at the Zeiterion this weekend. I thought we might go 
along and see the ballet, and then pop over to the Twin Piers for a late 
supper.' 

'Oh, my, that does sound attractive.' She was wavering. 'But I did promise 
Henry.' 

'And what was Henry Liverpool offering?' 

'Peterson.' she corrected automatically. 'I'm not sure. He mentioned 
something about lifting a few down at Bunratty's. I get the suspicion that he 
intended a few rounds of wrestling in his apartment afterwards.' 

'Well?' 

'I just don't know.' I've got to hold to my principles, she told herself. This 
business of giving in to him whenever he turns on the charm has got to stop! 
She flashed him another quick look. 'I'm sorry you've gone to all the trouble 
of hiring a nurse. I always thought I'd like to be a nurse. I think it had 
something to do with those cute caps they wear, rather than the work. But 
then again I heard that Bunratty's is a swinging place, and I haven't been out 
on the town in a dog's age. Come on, let's get these darlings into bed.' 

'That's all this relationship means to you—the children?' 

'That's all I can take care of at one time,' she returned. 'I don't think I'm in the 
market for a quick affair, which is all you've been offering.' He mumbled 
something under his breath and headed for the stairs. 

Maggi went along behind him to help put the children to bed. Her 
conscience bothered her. After all, these two little mites who had grabbed at 
her heart deserved her complete attention, and all her squabbling with John 
Dailey was taking the edge off their need. It took more than a little doing 



this time, getting them down. Pru fussed and grumbled. Prissy watched her 
twin with wide blue eyes, not knowing whether to join in or not. In the end 
Maggi sang to them, something of a relief from John's cracked baritone. 
When they both came downstairs Aunt Eduarda had just finished in the 
kitchen. The three adults sat for a while, meditatively, in the silence of the 
living-room. A sort of truce hung over the former battlefield. 

Maggi was not much of a woman for meditation. Silence bothered her, and 
olive branches were really her thing. 'How's your American business 
venture going on, John?' 

He lowered the paper and shook his head. 'You wouldn't believe. I've had 
three bids already, and it's only been three weeks since I made the first 
contact. If things go on the way they appear right now I might be forced to 
re-examine all my future plans.' 

'So it's something you have that you want to sell?' 

He ducked his head behind his paper. 'More or less. Lease if I can, sell if I 
must. It depends on the offer.' 

A rattle of pages seemed to put a full stop to that line of conversation. I don't 
know why I keep trying, she thought bitterly. He doesn't want me to know, 
and that's the end of that. She snapped on the television and clicked her way 
through all the channels without finding anything she liked. 

'Something wrong, Maggi?' 

'No, nothing. Just a little twinge,' she told him. 'I shouldn't have put raw 
onions in that seafood salad.' 

'It wasn't the onions, it was the salad,' he said. 'Poisonous stuff, salad. 
Anything green is poisonous.' 

'And with that sage advice, I think I'll go out on the porch and get a little air. 
It's a lovely balmy night.' Aunt Eduarda gave them both a twinkling grin, 
and marched slowly out into the kitchen to get her shawl. 



'She's not getting any younger,' Maggi said as the old lady disappeared out 
into the moonlit darkness. 'Ever since she retired from the school system 
she's been at a loose end.' 

'No, none of us are getting any younger.' John folded his paper and dropped 
it in his lap. 'I didn't know she was a teacher.' Which was more conversation 
than she had heard in the past two hours. And then he threw her a curve. 
'How does it feel to be thirty?' He ducked just in time. Her pillow landed 
squarely in the place where his face would have been. 

She struggled up out of the sofa. 'I'm going for a walk.' 

'I'll come with you.' He laid the carefully folded paper down on the end 
table. 

'No, thank you. I need to think.' 

'I'll help. I'm a great thinker-helper.' 

'I'm sure you are, but tonight I feel the need to fly solo. Besides you're on 
baby-watch until two in the morning.' 

'Spoilsport!' 

'You'll never really know,' she said, sighing, and went out on to the porch. 
Although it was a warm night for early June, there was still a chill in the air, 
and she was wearing only a sleeveless dress. She walked over to the rail and 
looked out, wrapping herself up in her own arms. 

'You two seem to be forever bickering.' The chains on the porch swing 
squeaked as Aunt Eduarda got up and came over to join her. There was no 
sting in the words; it was not an accusation. 

'He's a hard man to understand,' Maggi admitted softly. 

'The babies?' 



'Wonderful little creatures. I always wanted babies of my own. I'd love to be 
mother to these two, but--' 

'But you can't stand Mr Dailey?' 

'I can't even say that.' Maggi laughed at herself. 'Can you imagine that? I'm 
thirty years old and can't make up my mind!' 

'Happens to us all at some age,' her aunt replied. 'Twenty—thirty—forty. 
Sooner or later. It has something to do with God's design to populate the 
earth.' 

'You don't mean I'm smitten by the maternal yearning? Surely not every 
woman goes through that?' 

'Perhaps not, dear. But most do. You just can't see John as the man for you?' 

'I don't know, do I?' Maggi said bitterly. 'He's explained to me very carefully 
that he's here on a temporary kick. As soon as he finds out about this hush- 
hush business deal of his he expects to load up and go back to Ireland. And 
in the meantime here's slow- witted Maggi Brennan to entertain 
him—locally, that is.' 

'It's not exactly a one-night stand,' her aunt admonished. Maggi's head 
snapped around and she stared. Her Portuguese aunt was so much out of 
character that it puzzled her. 

'No,' Maggi returned, still bitter. 'It's more like a one-month lease. I don't see 
myself as his mistress, but more like his concubine-in-waiting.' 

'Maggi!' 

'Yes,' Maggi snapped. 'And even that's a lie. No, he hasn't had me in his 
bed—yet, but it's a subject close to the top of his list. Goodnight, 77a, I'm 
going to walk up the hill a way and see if I can't puzzle this whole thing out.' 

She stamped down off the porch, rattling a loose board on the steps as she 
went. Just one more thing that needs fixing around here, she told herself as 



she followed the silver moon-path up towards the fence that separated her 
farm from the apartments building site. 

The Jones boy had re-ploughed her lower ten acres on the same day the men 
had come to repair the leaky roof, leaving the twenty-acre tract that lay next 
to the building site for possible sale. But not to Swanson andhis gang of 
pirates, she assured herself. And shortly after the ploughing a pair of 
schoolboys had come to seed the area. Five acres in sweet corn, the kind 
called salt-and-pepper, guaranteed a good local market and a money crop. 
The other five were s£t in hilled potatoes, for her own family's consumption. 
She had been lucky to get the school kids. With unemployment in the 
Greater New Bedford area standing at 3.3 per cent, she had been lucky to 
find anybody to do stoop labour. 

With one foot in a furrow she found herself repeating her grandfather's 
age-old custom: she reached down for a handful of soil and tasted it. But her 
mind was on John Dailey, and she could hardly remember whether the 
ploughed land was sweet or sour. John Dailey, itinerant heartbreaker. The 
wandering lawyer, bon vivant, and all-round womaniser. And I'm the 
woman, she thought. How now, brown cow? 

She puzzled at it from all angles, accepting, rejecting, changing—all to no 
avail. It was a no-win situation. A good, well-raised Portuguese girl had 
only one relationship with a man. Marriage was the name of the game. He 
certainly didn't have that subject in mind, but Maggi was wavering, and 
could actually think of herself as accepting second-best. 

If he would offer even that, she reminded herself. So far this week he had 
acted like a self-centred spoilsport, not wanting her for himself, but 
unwilling to see her go to any other man! How exasperating could a man be? 
If he would only proposition her, at least she'd have the reward of a good 
strong turndown! So now, Maggi Brennan, she thought, how do you entice a 
man into making a proposition, just so you can turn him down to boost your 
ego? 

It was a subject beyond her ken. So be proud, she told herself. Suffer a little. 
Eat a little dirt and cry up a storm! Which sounded like good advice, so she 
did. 



The wind was in the right direction to bring her the sound from the 
bell-tower of St Lawrence's Church, down in the city, striking twelve. 
Having solved nothing, but feeling much relieved, Maggi snatched up a 
twist of long grass to chew on, and went back down the hill. 

 

The house was quiet when she came in. Closing the door shut out the vague 
meandering of the breeze and damped the hoarse song of the frogs in the 
swamp. Instead she heard the murmuring as her electric kitchen muttered 
and cycled and hummed to itself in the darkness. 

She felt her way to the stairwell, slipping off her hard-heeled shoes to mask 
her passage. At the top of the stairs she paused from force of habit, and stole 
down the hall to the nursery. The night-light plugged into the baseboard 
socket cast an eerie pink glow over everything. 

The two babies were fast asleep in their massive crib. But while Prissy had 
turned over on her stomach with her knees bunched up under her, content, 
Prudence was lying flat on her back, arms outstretched, stirring restlessly. 
With infinite care Maggi readjusted the blankets, fingered a kiss on both 
foreheads, and went back out into the hall. 

A slight glow of light from the half-open door of the last room down 
indicated that Aunt Eduarda had fallen asleep with her TV set on. A few 
steps up the hall the door of John's bedroom had swung half open, due, 
Maggi remembered, to a slant in the two-century- old flooring. There was 
no night-light in his room, but a splinter of moonglow had evaded his 
curtains. She stopped to watch. 

John Dailey was asleep as well, and there was evidence of difficulty in 
settling down. All his blankets had fallen off the far side of his bed, and the 
sheets had twisted up under his feet. One of his arms lay at his side; the other 
was wrapped around his head. He slept without pyjamas, all the male 
magnificence of him displayed by moonlight. 

Startled, Maggi drew a deep breath. It whistled around her windpipe as she 
tried vainly to suppress the noise. The sleeper moved an inch or two, and 



then settled again on his side. Maggi held her breath, unable to tear her eyes 
away from the spectacle. It had been a long time, a very long time, since she 
had seen such a sight. It awoke yearnings, needs, that pounded at her and 
shook her, body and mind together. Memories? 

No, her conscience dictated cruelly. Not memories. There was a time and a 
place, but those aren't the reasons why you react now. This man isn't a 
shadow, a recall of your dead husband. This man is real, distinct, calling 
you. And you want him, Maggi Brennan! The bitterness of the accusation 
hurt. She crammed her fist over her mouth to stifle the scream of pain, and 
ran for her own bed. 

Safe behind her own closed door she sank into the chair by her window and 
wrestled with her ghosts. The clock downstairs chimed twice before she 
donned her shortie nightgown and climbed into bed. It chimed again before 
her eyes closed in troubled sleep. 

It was probably those troubled dreams that allowed Maggi to hear that first 
protest from the nursery. It started out as a tiny whimper. By the time it was 
repeated Maggi's feet were on the cold floor, and she was moving towards 
the door. She had, from studying the book, expected some floor-walking in 
the middle of the night, but in all the weeks the twins had been in the house 
they had slept gloriously through the night. If one presumed, of course, that 
night ended by five-thirty in the morning. 

So when the baby transferred her complaints to a higher register Maggi was 
already in the nursery, bending over the crib. And by that time both of the 
twins were bellowing. 'Easy, baby,' Maggi crooned as she lifted Prudence 
up, blanket and all, and rested the child on her shoulder. A few casual pats 
on the back, a little pacing up and down, certainly that would be all that was 
required. If the original complaint came from Prudence. 

Left in the bed by herself, Prissy squirmed towards the head of the crib on 
her stomach, yelling. Handling two at a time was too much. Maggi was 
about to sound the general alarm when John padded into the room, barefoot, 
wearing a pair of pyjama bottoms that just seemed to hang on his hips, 
defying the laws of gravity. He snatched Prissy up, and tried a little of his 
male magic. 



'I don't know what's wrong,' Maggi whispered. She laid Pru down on the 
bathinette table, one of the late additions to the nursery, and began to strip 
the baby of her shirt and nappy. The ceiling light came on as John flipped the 
switch. Prudence was kicking her feet awkwardly, chewing madly on her 
thumb, and yelling loudly enough to alert the town's volunteer fire 
department. Priscilla, still in his arms, ran into a coughing fit, choked, and 
started yelling in earnest.'I can't find anything wrong,' Maggi whispered. 

'Hell, with all this yelling there's no sense whispering. Which one started the 
trouble?' 

'I don't know. I thought it was Pru. Maybe it's both of them. One of them 
doesn't necessarily have to be imitating the other, you know.' 

'Then move over,' he grumbled, 'and let me see if it's this one.' 

Maggi hurriedly shoved Pru into a Pamper and was brushed aside as he 
moved up to the table and stripped Prissy. Several minutes of serious study, 
and he sighed. 'I can't see anything wrong. Try walking them again?' 

'Diaper her and give her to me,' Maggi directed. 'I'll walk both of them while 
you check that book. There has to be something. Did you read the whole 
thing?' 

With both babies in her arms, fourteen pounds apiece, she began to pace 
again, humming what she hoped was a restful song. 

'No,' he confessed as he fumbled on the top shelf in the corner. 'I only got to 
chapter seven. You?' 

'Six,' she mumbled. 'Chapter six. It's not a book written for high-speed 
reading. Hurry up. You don't suppose they're hungry? You did give them a 
bottle after dinner?' 

'Don't nag,' he grumbled. 'Nothing I hate worse than a nagging woman. I 
gave them a bottle. Here's that damn book.' 



'Each?' I don't intend to nag, she told herself, but he's only a man. You have 
to be sure! It tore at her heart to see the two little ones in pain. 

'Yes, each. Dammit, do you want me to run downstairs and get another?' He 
hardly sounded best pleased about the whole idea, but Maggi was not about 
to let him shirk his responsibilities. 

'Better you than me,' she told him. 'And stop cursing. Who knows what the 
pair of them might remember as they grow up?' 

'All right, all right.' He made a dash for the door, and evidently stubbed his 
bare toe on the little occasional table that stood in the hall just outside the 
nursery door, for several short Gaelic words floated in the air behind him as 
he limped along the hall. Maggi had the insane urge to clamp her hands over 
the babies' ears, but all her hands were in play. She tried to cover the sounds 
by singing a little louder. The babies gave her no good reaction as she 
zoomed through the two lullabies she remembered; when she shifted to 
'Yellow Submarine' one of the children stopped crying, almost in disbelief. 
But it was only a temporary cessation. 

From downstairs there came noises. Doors slammed, things crashed on the 
kitchen floor, various words were almost shouted. 'That'll teach you to be a 
father,' Maggi whispered. 'Er—whatever.' She thought a great deal more. He 
would make a fine father, once he learned to control his language! And I'm 
not sure, she told herself, how many other fathers would be up in the middle 
of the night, helping out with the children. Probably the whole difficulty 
would be left to their wives! I'm lucky to—and then her spirit dropped 
through the floor—to be a prospective parent. Which reminded her that Ms 
Fagan was coming—a thought she didn't care to entertain! 

There was just no time to be sorry for herself. John was back, moving at the 
speed of a world-class father, with a half-filled bottle in each hand. 

'Sorry about that,' he-said. 'There was only one full bottle in the 
refrigerator.' 

'You warmed it?' 



'Dammit,' he growled, 'why do all women think men are idiots where babies 
are concerned? Of course I warmed it. Give me this one.' He relieved her of 
the baby on her right shoulder, and passed her one of the bottles. She tilted 
the baby down across her breast and tempted the little lips with the bottle. 
Prudence automatically opened her mouth, took a quick gulp, and rejected 
it. The other baby, in John's arms, accepted the feast and began sleepily to 
feed. 

'So it's Pru,' he guessed. 'She's been fussing all night.' 

'But I don't know what's the matter!' Maggi wailed. 'Check the book again.' 

'I'm checking, I'm checking.' He stretched Prissy out on the bathinette, 
supporting her bottle with one hand while he leafed through the manual 
with the other. Prudence was wailing like a banshee, and Prissy gave up her 
quiet feed and joined the chorus. Maggi paced the floor madly, rubbing the 
child's back, trying to sing. He held Prissy down with one gentle hand on 
her stomach as he madly searched through the book. 

'What in the loving world is going on here?' Aunt Eduarda was at the door. 
Her grey hair was braided over her shoulder. The lace collar of her 
nightgown projected up out of her green robe. Her glasses were perched on 
the end of her nose. 

'I don't know what's the matter,' Maggi said wearily. 'It seems that 
something's bothering Pru, and Prissy is crying in sympathy. I suppose we'd 
better call the doctor—or head for the emergency-room? John?' 

'Maybe you're right. Hold this one, Aunt Eduarda, while I go find some 
pants.' 

'Don't be in such a hurry,' the old lady chided. 'Babes in the woods, the pair 
of you! You've done fine as long as everything was working well, but at the 
first sign of trouble you blow your stack. Which is the one that started the 
problem?' 

'This one,' Maggi replied. 'Pru.' 



Aunt Eduarda came over in front of them and looked the baby over casually. 
Then, to Maggi's surprise, she stuck her index finger in the child's mouth. 
The child yelled all the louder, but the aunt was grinning as she retrieved her 
finger. 

'There's nothing really wrong with this child,' she reported. 'Wait right here, 
the both of you. I'll be back in a moment.' 

'Don't ask me,' John said, catching Maggi's glance over the old lady's head. 
'Pace a little faster.' 

'I'm beat,' Maggi replied. ' You pace a time or two.' 

'I don't dare to,' he reported solemnly. 'My pyjama bottoms are about to fall 
off.' 

'At this hour of the day who would care?' she snapped. 'Or are you one of 
those super-equipped models?' 

'Hey, don't knock it,' he told her. 'Just pace. Sing a little, and--' 

And Aunt Eduarda was back, humming a little Portuguese tune, a tiny bottle 
in her hand. 'Now then, if you two would stop glaring at each other?' She 
unscrewed the cap, collected a couple of drops of the liquid on her finger, 
and stuck the finger into the baby's mouth. One precious minute passed, and 
almost as if on cue baby Prudence stopped crying, gurgled at them, and fell 
asleep. Prissy kept up herserenade for an additional moment, grumbled to 
herself, and fell off to sleep. The quiet that descended on the room was 
startling. 

'Dear heaven,' Maggi whispered. 

'Teeth,' Aunt Eduarda said quietly, and gave them both a big smile. 

'What is that?' John demanded, pointing to the bottle. 

'A form of benzocaine,' the aunt said. 'In my day we used paregoric, but 
that's a derivative of morphine, and it's gone out of style. The pair of them 



will be cutting teeth for the next few months, so you might as well get used 
to it. I'll leave this bottle on the shelf here, shall I?' 

'Why not?' Maggi moaned. 'Teeth! Why couldn't I think of that?' 

'Because you're not their mother, and he's not their father,' Eduarda 
commented. 'Now do you suppose we could get back to bed? It's well past 
the shank of the night.' 

'Now how stupid can I get?' Maggi asked the empty night as they watched 
the aunt disappear down the hall. 

'No more stupid than me.' John stood close to her, one arm around her waist. 
The babies were sleeping soundly. Maggi moved away from him nervously 
and straightened out the crib and the blankets. He recaptured her again as 
she completed the task and gathered up the two baby bottles. 

'Come on,' he added as he snapped off the nursery lights and ushered her out 
into the dark corridor. It was in that second, as they stepped across the 
threshold, that Maggi became alarmingly aware of him. With the crisis 
passed she was almost overwhelmed by the knowledge of him, pressing 
hard against her flank, his bare upper torso touching her, warming her 
through the thin cotton nightgown she was wearing. A strange excitement 
ran up and down her spine, originating in that little swell of her hip where 
his hand rested. 

The night was filled with a huge electrical charge. He was as much aware of 
her as she was of him. She could actually breathe in the excitement that 
crowded down on her. She shivered. He held her closer. 

'Cold?' 

'N-no,' she stuttered. 'Not really. I forgot my robe.' 

'Yes, I noticed.' His hand drifted further, until it rested on her flat, trembling 
stomach. Alarms were ringing in her mind; she purposefully ignored them. 
At her door they stopped. 'We've hardly two hours before the twins will be 
up and about for the day,' he said. 'We have a lot to talk about. Shall we?' 



'I—don't mind,' she stammered. Without being able to search his face in the 
dim light she was momentarily doubtful But of course, she thought, he's a 
typical virile male. It isn't words he wants. Not with his hand inching 
upward, reaching across the soft wisp of cotton that was her gown. It isn't 
words he wants, and—dear heaven—it isn't words I want, either! Still, I 
can't just—surrender. That isn't the way I was raised. Perhaps a rearguard 
action will show some alternative? 'But—the bottles—they have to go back 
to the refrigerator or they'll spoil.' 

'Damn! I should have ordered another refrigerator for upstairs!' 

'No,' she spat at him. 'That would be a terrible waste of money, and 
besides—take the bottles downstairs and then--' 

'Come back?' he interrupted. Maggi took a deep breath to steady her nerves. 
When push came to shove there had to be some sort of commitment. He had 
finally thrown down the gauntlet, and she was faced with the demon choice. 
And I love him, she told herself in the hush that followed. 

'And come back,' she agreed, suppressing the note of desperation in her 
voice. 

  



CHAPTER EIGHT 

INSIDE her room, Maggi paced. There was a lock on her door. There was still 
time to change her mind. She could easily get dressed and run away. It 
wasn't too late to join a nunnery. Her mother would never approve of this. 
Neither would her father. Her dog wouldn't approve. Heavens, what am I 
doing? she thought. 

It was a question that had no answer. She was already committed. Now all 
she needed was to get back her nerve and go through with it. It's just like 
swimming, she lectured herself. You never really forgot. And once you get 
in, the water will feel fine. 'Sure it will,' she muttered sarcastically. 'But what 
about once he gets in?' Stop the double entendres, babe. All over the world 
there are thousands of women, right this minute, who are doing the same 
thing and enjoying it! 'Planning to do it,' she corrected. 'And some of them 
are great bloody fools!' 

A girl was in desperate straits when even her conscience gave up on her. The 
alternatives flashed in front of her; she brushed them off. Vai diminuir, she 
told herself in her fast-fading Portuguese. 'Take it easy.' There was a cool 
wind blowing in through her half-opened window. She shivered as she 
pulled her nightgown over her head and folded it neatly at the foot of her big 
comfortable bed. It had been her signal, she remembered, for Robert. In this 
very room. In this very room. She walked slowly around the room, touching 
bed and bureau and chair, saying goodbye to her memories before she 
locked them firmly away. Her hands cupped her breasts for a moment. Her 
flesh was as cold as the night. It had all been so long ago; she was a mental 
virgin, with a virgin's fears, and a widow's anticipations. There was a noise 
on the steps. She flipped off the lights and slid under the covers, pulling the 
sheets up to her chin. 

He did not come. 

She shivered, reached out desperately for an extra blanket, and huddled 
herself up in a ball. Make believe you're asleep, she told herself. Her eyelids 
slammed down like jail bars, but her mind still ran on and on. A woman can't 
just do something like this, she half sobbed. There has to be a reason! So you 
like sex, her conscience suggested. But not that much! So tell yourself that 



you're in love with him! I don't have to tell myself. I am in love with him, but 
I dare not let him know that. I suppose I could lie about it if he asks, couldn't 
I? I didn't have any compunction about lying to the State inspector. And, 
besides, it's only a little lie. A little lie now and then can't hurt! And 
maybe—you know damn well it could be a lot of fun and games. 

And on the other hand, she assured herself, I'm really doing it for the babies, 
aren't I? Isn't that a great line? But the inexorable facing of the truth could 
not be denied. I don't care why I'm doing it, I'm just doing it! Where the hell 
is he? 

Night sounds seemed to have slowed almost to a stop. In the distance she 
could hear the mournful wail of the siren at the Dartmouth fire station, the 
call for volunteer firefighters to report in. In the other direction the foghorn 
on the New Bedford hurricane dyke sounded. And still John Dailey didn't 
come. 

The clock downstairs struck the half-hour. A fire truck rumbled south on 
Tucker Road, its beeper sounding softly. He's not coming, Maggi thought 
ruefully. After all that, he's not coming! An owl coughed in the old oak tree 
outside her window. He's not coming! She shook with spasmatic pain. 
Something—some strength, some excitement—flew out of her body. She 
felt bereft. The clock struck the next quarter-hour. 

Damn him! Maggi snarled to herself. Damn all men! There's not a one of 
them to be trusted! And at that moment the latch on her door clicked, and he 
came in. 

You're asleep, Maggi commanded herself. You're asleep. You can't be 
responsible for anything that happens while you're asleep! Her eyes were 
glued shut; she struggled to slow her breathing as his footsteps padded 
across the room. There was a new smell in the air—soap and aftershave. 
He'd stopped to shave! Maggi swallowed hard. 

The other side of her mattress sank, there was a movement of the blankets 
that now almost covered her head, and a wave of warmth enveloped her. It 
was almost impossible for her to lie still, but she struggled to do just that. He 
shifted his weight in her direction, and the entire bed shook. The bed 



stopped shaking, but Maggi's tense body did not. His warm hand had just 
landed in that little niche at her waist where her hip blossomed out. A warm, 
confident hand. 

'Maggi?' 

She struggled to keep from answering. He moved nearer. She could feel the 
contact as his hip touched hers. The hand coursed upward, hesitated a 
moment to draw circles around her navel, and then climbed upward, a finger 
at a time. When it arrived at the curve of her breast she could no longer stand 
the suspense. Her nerves were shattered; her body remembered what her 
mind was trying to forget. She half turned in his direction, only to be pushed 
back flat on her back as he inched himself closer and brooded over her. 
Somebody moaned in the darkness. His fingers had conquered the satin 
mountain, and the bronze sentry at the top had sprung to mindless attention. 

'Oh, lord,' somebody muttered. 

Lips. Cool, wonderful lips. They kissed the pulse- point on her neck, shifted 
to the lobe of her ear, and then coasted effortlessly to and over her mouth 
and were gone. 

Fire flashed up and down her spine. The hand on her breast came slowly 
down the declivity and attacked the other mountain, producing the same 
result. Despite her determination to remain still, her hips quivered, jerked, 
and her head spun. 

'Fast asleep, Maggi?' His lips were at her ear. She could hear the overtone of 
laughter as his sharp teeth nipped at the lobe nearest him. Once again his 
head moved. Those warm lips marched down the side of her face, down her 
neck, into the valley between her breasts. A moment of withdrawal. She 
gasped and twitched uncontrollably. Teeth were nipping at the bronze peak 
of her breast. Nipping, and then sliding deeper as his lips savoured the honey 
of her. 

'Nothing to say, Maggi?' His tongue plagued one nipple, while his hand 
trapped the other between thumb and forefinger and gently massaged it. The 
sensations were playing in colour behind her eyelids. Brilliant splashes of 



red and orange. Vaulting silver rockets against the backdrop of green and 
blue. Somebody moaned; Maggi reached to the depths of her self-control 
and found just enough power to freeze her body in position. It was a fruitless 
victory. 

He inched himself a little closer. She could feel the weight of his chest on 
her. His head was below her chin as his mouth tasted and teased. The hand 
that once had conquered her breast slid off the pulsing mound of softness, 
making for the flat plane of her stomach. She gasped involuntarily. He 
stopped all actions. 

Don't stop! she wanted to yell. Don't—what are you doing to me? But her 
mind still held tentative rule. What am I doing? I'm asleep, aren't I? It can 
hardly be my fault if he-- 

He did. The hand returned to her stomach, twirled in circles for a moment, 
then dived lower. Without consulting Maggi, her legs spread, opening to the 
new invasion. One finger flicked against that most responsive point in her 
entire body. He chuckled when she jumped. 

His mouth caught up to hers in a deep, moist kiss that only added to the fire, 
and locked her head in position as he gradually shifted his weight on top of 
her. Her legs granted him room. 

Maggi found herself alone in her head, faced with a thousand impulses of 
pleasure and warning, unable to stifle any one of them, not wanting to. What 
do I do now? she thought, and the voice of her conscience gave her the 
answer. When seduction is inevitable, lie back and enjoy! 

'Still sleeping, Maggi?' He was up on his knees, hands resting gently on her 
breasts, laughing. Her body was beyond control. She writhed and twisted, 
her hips urging him on. Don't stop! she screamed to herself. Her teeth were 
clenched so tightly that her gums hurt, but the reflex was lost in the merging 
pleasure signals as he leaned forward and entered her. 

It had been a long time between for Maggi Brennan. And he was warm and 
moist and experienced. She welcomed him as he filled her to overflowing, 
welcomed him and urged him on with both wild hands. 



He plunged deeply, strongly, rhythmically. Her legs came up around him 
and she fluttered her hips against him, unable to match his rhythm. His 
hands swept under her buttocks and steadied her to the pace. What seemed 
like hours of enjoyment were really only seconds. Together they smashed 
themselves on the peak of the little death, and as with a symphony orchestra 
where the cymbals had sounded the last note, they collapsed in 
perspiration-laden silence. 

Three or four minutes passed. Minutes while his weight came down on her, 
his head by hers, his hands gentle in her hair. 'Good lord,' somebody said. 
Maggi was still having trouble with her breathing. She panted as if she had 
run a dozen miles. He moved slightly, fumbling for something on her 
bedside table. After a moment or two he lifted himself up on his elbows, and 
wiped her forehead with a tissue. 

And then, with a little laugh, he rolled himself off, and she heard him say, 
'What kind of a stud am I, if the girl doesn't even wake up?' 

The passion was gone in an instant, replaced by rage. 'Stud.' The word 
echoed through the empty corridors of her mind. Just because I'm a widow 
you needn't think I'm in need of stud service! She remembered saying that to 
him when he first arrived. And he hadn't believed her. Instead he had waited 
for his chance, and proved what a stupid fool she was. Her blood boiled. No, 
I didn't need stud service, but I got it, didn't I? she told herself. And that's all 
it was to him. Stud service! Any woman would have satisfied him; I was the 
only one at hand! Rage rode high on the crest of her guilt. The feeling 
swamped her. This one act was the height of sin. She had been unfaithful to 
Robert's memory in the worst possible way. And John Dailey was laughing 
at her. 

Don't get mad, get even. Wasn't that the right saying? How? What single 
thing could she do to stab him in his ego? Out of the maze of all her 
readings, all the little giggling conversations with her friends, popped the 
perfect answer. 

She rolled over on her side, laid her tiny hand across the hard muscles of his 
stomach, and giggled drowsily. 'Thank you, Robert.' 



There was a moment of silent disbelief. She could feel his muscles stiffen in 
surprise. And then he vaulted up out of the bed like a just-released 
jack-in-the-box. There were perhaps half a dozen well-chosen short 
Anglo-Saxon words said, a couple of which Maggi had never heard 
before—but which needed no explanation. She could see his dark shadow 
against the darker background of the room. He picked up what clothes he 
had worn and turned in her direction to repeat some of the words she didn't 
want to hear. In self-protection she ducked under the blankets and blocked 
her ears. He slammed the door behind him. 

Maggi's moment of triumph passed quickly. She tossed and turned in her 
bed, but could find no comfort. What she had done was indefensible, and yet 
so wonderful. And he hadn't been altogether proper either. She argued with 
herself for half an hour, and finally convinced herself that it was all his fault. 
After which she got up to remake the bed. She climbed back in, but was still 
unable to sleep. Eventually, because she was so physically tired and yet so 
thirsty, she got up again, stole across the hall to the bathroom for a glass of 
water, and returned to the chair beside her bed. Dawn was stippling the hills 
with grey light. 

One of the twins stirred, and began to fret. Thank the lord for that, Maggi 
sighed to herself as she fumbled for her nightgown and robe and padded 
down the hall to the rescue. 

 

The day turned sour just after sunrise. A cool northeast wind heralded the 
arrival of more rain. The house was dark. Aunt Eduarda came downstairs at 
seven o'clock, to find Maggi and the two girls already in occupation. 

'They've been fed,' Maggi said. Hiding the gloom in her voice was a 
sometime thing; Maggi Brennan had acquired a full-blow guilt-complex. 
Her aunt looked more closely at her as she continued, 'By the way, don't 
make up any more fires in the living-room. I'm going to put the little rascals 
out on the rug from now on.' 

'Then I'd better clean the fireplace out,' Eduarda replied. 'Did you have any 
more trouble after I went to bed?' 



'Not with the children,' Maggi said glumly. She noticed the stare. 'Oh, I 
meant—I just couldn't get back to sleep again.' 

'No, of course not.' Aunt Eduarda had lived a full life. It wasn't hard to 
deduce what the trouble might be. 'And I'll go look for something to block 
the living- room door so our two little pigeons can't escape.' 

'That can wait until you've had breakfast.' 

'No, it really can't,' the old lady said. 'I'll have to eat on the run today. We 
need a considerable amount of groceries. I planned to take the jeep and go 
over to Almacs. They're open by eight o'clock in the morning. I take it that 
the mister is sleeping in?' 

'I don't give a darn what he's doing!' Fire replaced despondency in a second, 
flashing out from Maggi's eyes and from her lips. 

'No, I can see that.' Her guess confirmed, Aunt Eduarda made herself a quick 
mug of coffee and went out into the living-room. Deprived of her audience, 
Maggi mumbled to herself, and then set about bathing the two little girls. By 
nine o'clock Eduarda had gone and the two children were exploring the 
confines of their new world. 

The entire living-room rug was a wide plain to be explored. Between the 
two of them a soft rubber ball made a good toy. John had installed a stainless 
steel mirror on the side of their playpen, and, once spotted, it turned two 
lovely little girls into Narcissi. With both of them enjoying life, Maggi stole 
a moment to go up to dress. Nothing special, just her looking-after- babies 
uniform—a light turtleneck sweater, black trousers, her rather elderly 
plimsolls, and her hair brushed and caught back in a ponytail. And now she 
was hunched up in the rocking-chair in the living- room, feeling sorry for 
herself. 

A knock at the front door. 

That was the oddity of it all. In typical country style, practically every visitor 
came to the side door, the kitchen door. To have visitors at the front door 
was strange. Maggi got up slowly and moved in that direction. Both babies 



rolled over on their stomachs and seemed to be watching her. Maggi's smile 
brought two in return. 

It required two hands to wrestle with the old and seldom-used latch. 'Henry! 
What in the world are you doing here? Come in, come in.'Henry Peterson 
came in, grinning. 'Oh, I thought I'd mix business with pleasure,' he said. 
'Oops!' 

'I forgot to tell you. Watch out for the girls, they're mobile.' 

'A couple of entries in the snail race?' He walked around the children in an 
exaggerated half-circle and took the best chair in the room. 'I don't have 
much experience with kids. I sort of like to keep them at a distance. I didn't 
think you had either, Maggi.' 

'No, but I'm learning fast,' she replied. 'Double tuition, so to speak, doubly 
precious. Coffee?' 

'Don't mind if I do. I was out a little early today. A big transaction.' He was 
rubbing the palms of his hands together as if savouring the profit. Maggi 
managed to hide her smile, and went out into the kitchen to fetch his drink. 

'Black, two sugars?' she asked when she came in. Aunt Eduarda had 
stretched a fire-screen across the doorway, which made the trip hazardous, 
but the trip was made without spilling a drop. 

'You remembered!' 

'Well, it was only three nights ago, for goodness' sakes. That's not long to 
remember.' She dropped on to the sofa beside his chair and coiled her legs 
up beneath her. For some reason she was feeling very— kindly—towards 
Henry Peterson. In comparison to some other men she knew, Henry was a 
pet. He was at his best dressed, but looked as if he could use a little 
ego-boosting. Which she was ready to provide. 'Now, tell me about your 
great sale?' 

'It's the condos up above your house,' he told her. 'My, you make good 
coffee.' 



'Instant,' she said, shrugging. 

'And you look a sight for sore eyes,' he continued. 'So early in the morning!' 

I know I don't, Maggi told herself, but I deserve to look nice. And to have 
some man tell me so! 'Thank you, Henry. What about the condominiums?' 

'Three of them are finished,' he said cheerily, 'and my firm has been 
awarded the sale and lease rights. Would you believe, in one hour this 
morning I've sold four apartments?' 

'Well, good for you. I suppose there's a handsome commission.' 

'I'll say there is.' His grin expanded. 'Sets me up for a couple of months, 
Maggi. Too bad there isn't more space up there on the hill—I could clean up 
a fortune.' He sipped at his coffee, watching her over the rim of the mug 
with those slate-coloured eyes of his. 'And so could you, Maggi.' 

'Me?' 

'You. You've got almost twenty acres of land just sitting around doing 
nothing. Just sitting there going to waste.' 

'Lying fallow is what we farmers say,' she told him, and offered a small 
smile to cheer him on. She had heard his tale before, but then it had been 
known as Swanson's song. Do you suppose Henry--? No, he wouldn't join 
up with that pirate! 

'I know you don't need money these days,' he rambled on, 'but here's an 
opportunity you shouldn't bypass, Mag.' She hated that name. Nobody but 
her brothers used it, and then only when teasing. And only when prepared to 
run. All her good spirits evaporated, but Henry failed to notice. 'You know,' 
he continued, 'for just ten acres you could--' and he named a sum of money 
that caused Maggi's eyes to boggle. She had no idea what land might bring, 
and might not want to sell, but'just as a figure to dream about—well! 

'Do you really think so, Henry?' He nodded agreement, his smile so big that 
it was about to swallow him up. 



'Positive. Maybe even more.' 

She tendered him a sweet smile. Henry Peterson lit up like a Christmas tree. 
'I don't think I can really commit myself to a sale like that. I'd have to talk to 
my lawyer and his accountants, you know. Uncle Jaoa is out of town at the 
moment.' 

'Ah, of course. He's still representing the family?' 

'As you say. More coffee?' 

'No.' Henry consulted his ornate wristwatch. 'I really have to be going. 
There's a great deal of paperwork involved in all this. But—Maggi? You'll 
keep me in mind if you ever do decide to sell?' 

'I'll keep you in mind.' You and Mr Swanson, Henry. You two could be 
blood brothers under the skin. I wonder if you're Siamese twins? The 
thought was father to the question. Henry looked at her in surprise, and 
whipped a handkerchief out of his pocket to wipe his forehead. 

'Swanson? Yes, I know of him, of course. We might have met a time or two 
in the past, perhaps.' He rose from his chair. Maggi was standing with her 
back to the staircase, and heard the steps that came halfway down and 
stopped. He had finally condescended to get up! He obviously had too much 
exercise last night. Perhaps he wasn't as young as he thought—or she 
thought! With all those thoughts squirrelling around in her mind, she missed 
what Henry had just said. 

'What? I—was thinking about something else, Henry.' 

The agent shifted from one foot to the other. 'I said, I thought we might 
celebrate tonight, Maggi. I've two tickets to the ballet at the Zeiterion. How 
about it? You were always a dance fan. We could have a night of it. Dinner, 
perhaps.' 

Maggi heard the soft growl from up on the stairs, and was urged to higher 
levels of drama. 'Sounds good. Maybe we could eat at the Twin Piers?' 



The growl from up on the stairs was repeated, with even more venom 
behind it. Henry, who was missing all this byplay, produced a crocodile 
smile. 'The Twin Piers? Why not. I haven't eaten there since Hector was a 
pup. Of course. I'll pick you up—say around seven o'clock?' 

'And dinner afterwards? I'd love that! Can you get a reservation that 
quickly?' 

'No trouble,' Henry assured her as he made for the front door. 'I'll use my 
father's name.' 

'I'll use my father's name,' John jeered as he came down the stairs, but Henry 
was long gone by then. And then, mournfully, 'How can you do that to me, 
Maggi? That was our plan.' 

Maggi folded her arms across her breasts and glared up at him. He looked as 
if the wrath of the lord had finally caught up to him. He was wearing yellow 
pyjama bottoms and a tired T-shirt. If possible, the shirt looked stronger 
than he did. His hair was a mess, he needed a shave, and his eyes had 
shadows under them. Maggi sneered. Both the babies saw him as he stepped 
off the bottom stair, and gurgled a welcome. So what do they know? she 
asked herself. 

He went to them immediately, kneeling down on the floor to offer a kiss. 
And then he creaked back up to his feet. 'I need a cup of coffee,' he 
announced.'Good for you.' Maggi was doing her best to stab him dead with 
words. 

'Oh, my gawd!' he groaned as he collapsed on to the sofa. 'You're not 
pleased with me?' 

'You could definitely say that. Definitely.' 

'And you don't intend to bring me any coffee?' 

'I'm thinking,' she returned. 'I can't decide whether I ought to let you die as 
you are, or get you a mug of coffee and pour it all over you.' 



'And you don't plan to go out with me tonight?' 

'I wouldn't go around the corner with you,' she swore. 

'Nice girls don't talk like that, Maggi.' 

'I'm not a nice girl!' she shouted at him. 'I'm a thirty-year-old shrew, and I 
don't like people who creep into my--' 

'But you were asleep, Maggi.' She had the grace to blush, to turn wine-red at 
his soft comment. 'So therefore no matter what bad things I might have 
done, you wouldn't know, would you, Maggi?' 

'Why, you--' 

'And let me tell you something else,' he continued in that same soft drawl. 
'I've had a lot of experience, and you were magnificent, Maggi Brennan. 
Absolutely magnificent! The next time--' 

'Don't hold your breath, Mr Dailey,' she hissed. 'There won't be a next time. 
What kind of a woman do you take me for?' 

'You're the kind of woman I would take for any price,' he announced 
grandly. It was the last straw; Maggi was the camel. She raged, pouring out 
gibberish as she searched the room for some weapon. Henry's coffee-mug, 
not quite empty, stood on the occasional table. She ran for it, screaming. 
The babies heard, and began to scream for themselves. John, being a wiser 
man than she had thought, made for the stairs at speed. 

Which was perhaps unfortunate. Maggi was aiming at him where he stood, 
just by the bottom step. With her usual skill the mug headed for the fourth 
step up, just as his foot landed there. The mug bounced off his skull with a 
satisfying thud, and broke into a dozen pieces. 

He stopped for a second, staggering. Both hands went up to the side of his 
head, just above his ear. He glared down at her and said two very bad words 
having to do with her parentage, and then staggered up the stairs and out of 
sight. 



Maggi, standing with both hands over her mouth in the middle of the room, 
was moaning. Prudence and Prissy were screaming. Her frantic mind was 
completely at sea. She had never really meant to hit him; for twenty years 
she had been throwing things at her brothers, and had never yet hit either of 
them. And now this. Go upstairs and comfort him, her conscience nagged. 
You owe it to him. But her common sense intervened. One does not go into 
the cage with the bear after sticking a thorn in his foot! And besides, 
somebody has to stay with the babies. Instead of a little romance you can 
change a couple of diapers! 

Which she did. And then walked them both until she discovered that Prissy 
was also cutting a tooth, which required a long search for the benzocaine, 
because Aunt Eduarda didn't get back until eleven, and only she 
remembered where the bottle of painkiller was located. 

 

Henry arrived promptly. It was still raining outside. He was driving a smart 
little convertible, with the roof up, and wearing—for some reason Maggi 
couldn't understand—a white dinner jacket with dark trousers. And a 
cummerbund. That last was a mistake. Henry was losing his schoolboy 
athletic shape, and the crimson cummerbund, wrapped too tightly around 
his waist, protruded just a tiny bit. None of which swayed Maggi from her 
plans to achieve vengeance. 

She dressed up to the limit. Her hair was up, her dress was a beautiful satin 
calf-length sheath split high on one thigh, and it sparkled by lamplight. Her 
three- inch heels gave her a definite advantage over Henry, and she carried 
her nose so far up in the air that even Mike, the dog, was impressed. 

'Have a good time!' Aunt Eduarda called. John grunted as Maggi went past 
him, and buried his nose in his paper. Maggi took Henry's arm with a 
flourish, and was laughing gaily at his second-hand joke as they went out to 
the car. Behind her, John crumpled up his newspaper and threw it at the 
fireplace. Aunt Eduarda covered her mouth to hide the smile. Evidently the 
man knew very well how much of a good time Maggi meant to have—and 
didn't appreciate it! 



 

Not all American cities had the advantage that Washington DC obtained. 
Nationwide contributions and government support built the National 
Theatre, so that all who lived inside the Beltway could seek culture. 
Washington residents never did understand that the boundary of their fairy 
kingdom, the Beltway, was to the rest of the nation, merely Route 95 South. 
But little America wanted culture too. 

The Zeiterion was one of those classic movie theatres built in the 1920s, 
where baroque design, small stages, magnificent lobbies with huge 
chandeliers, were all the thing. The theatre had fallen on hard times, and was 
barely rescued from the wrecker's ball by a subscription drive throughout 
Greater New Bedford. Rebuilt, reconditioned, self-supporting, it now 
attracted touring performer groups from the big city. And local residents 
went to see and be seen. 

Which was fine with Maggi. Except that, during the drive into the city, she 
had discovered that Henry's folding roof leaked right above her seat. But 
when a girl was hugely determined to have a good time, she could put up 
with many minor annoyances. The ballet was astoundingly good; the dinner 
at the Twin Piers was excellent, but the rain blanked out the windows, 
leaving no view of the working harbour, and leaving her to stumble along 
with Henry's limited conversation. 

It was midnight before they started back. To get out from under the leak she 
shifted over on the front bench seat, only to discover that Henry considered 
the move an invitation to—whatever a man could do while driving 
one-handed. When they came up in front of the house he made a massive 
attempt, she slapped his face, and was thoroughly soaked as she ran for the 
house. The light was still on in the living-room. She stopped outside on the 
porch to rearrange herself as best she could, while Henry drove off with an 
angry spurt of tyres. And Maggi went in at the front door. 

'Well, it's about time you got home.' John was in one of his more friendly 
moods. 



'I don't see what it has to do with you,' she offered over her right shoulder as 
she made for the kitchen. He followed along behind. The kettle was full and 
whistling. . 

'I'll make you some coffee,' he offered. She plumped herself down at the 
table and nodded, too tired to consider much more fighting. The hot coffee 
cheered her just a little. Caffeine, she told herself, just what I need. 

'Did you have a good time?' He was sitting directly across the table from 
her, nursing his own cup.'Wonderful,' she said, but-was too tired to put any 
emphasis on the right syllables. 

'You look like a drowned rat!' 

'Thank you.' Was that a cold enough tone? 'Your friends speak well of you 
too.' 

'You didn't have any sleep last night,'' he added. 'And now you're up late, 
after dashing around all evening—did you fall into the harbour?' 

'If I did I'd be dead,' she muttered. 'There are so many PCBs in that water 
that--' 

'You would have been better off here at home with me.' 

'Hey, let's get this straight! This is my home, not yours. And you 
demonstrated very successfully to me last night that I'm not safe in my own 
home. Not at all. Heavens, what will my mother say!' 

'Does she have to know?' 

'That woman can squeeze information like she was peeling an artichoke. I 
couldn't keep a secret from her if I wanted to.' 

His index finger was busy tapping the top of the table. It was beginning to 
get on Maggi's nerves. 



'Look,' he said, still using that soft deep voice, 'we have a lot to talk about.' 

'I don't see it that way,' she muttered, ducking behind her coffee-mug. 'You 
said you wanted to talk to me last night, and look what happened!' 

'That's what we have to talk about.' 

'I don'4 believe this.' Water was still dripping down Maggi's neck. She got 
up and located a dry kitchen towel as she fished around for the pins in her 
hair. 

'Here, let me help.' He had the right pin immediately. When he pulled it out 
gently her hair cascaded down like a float of logs after a jam was cleared. 
And then he took the towel from her and guided her back into her chair. 

He was a gentle massager. 'You've had a lot of experience at this?' she 
asked. 

'Moderately. Look, Maggi--' A brief pause as if he was searching for some 
special words. A lawyer, looking for words? she asked herself. 

'Maggi—last night was a terrible mistake on my part.' 

'You can say that again!' The towel was half over her face, hiding her 
expression, for which she thanked heaven. 

'Yes, I know that I broke all the rules of hospitality. And I don't suppose you 
had any protection?' 

Good lord, Maggi told herself. It never crossed my mind. I never—good 
heavens! 

'I thought not,' he said. His hands were gently rubbing down to her scalp just 
over her right ear. 'There could be consequences, Maggi.' 

Her heart thumped down into her left shoe. There could be. Just because she 
had never been pregnant before, it didn't mean that—oh, lord. 



'I know you get along well with the twins,' he added. 'You love them, and 
they love you.' 

'Yes.' Barely a whisper. 

'And now I have an added responsibility.' She stole a quick look at his face. 
He didn't seem exactly happy about the whole situation, whatever it was. 
'Despite all our differences, Maggi, I think that you and I will have to--' He 
had stopped rubbing, and moved around in front of her. She used both hands 
to push her hair back and out of her eyes. He looked so determined, so 
sincere, and yes, almost handsome! 

'Have to what?' she asked in a very small voice. 

'Have to get married,' he concluded. Maggi could not provide an answer. 
She was too busy trying not to swallow her tongue. 

  



CHAPTER NINE 

Two days later Maggi and John were still walking around each other like a 
pair of nervous cats. They went through their morning devotions with the 
twins, he dashed off to the city to 'tend to business', he said, while she did 
the laundry and a thousand and one other things which babies required. And 
thought. 

Marry him? The thought frightened and teased and charged her. He was a 
wonderfully handsome man— she had come to acknowledge that. A man of 
fidelity and hard work and enthusiasm, who had burdens in Ireland—and 
considered her to be just one more burden. Maggi hated the thought. To 
marry a man just because one night they had—she had—become another of 
his responsibilities? No word about 'love' and 'happy ever after'? The idea 
chilled her. 

And so did the idea that Ms Fagan would be appearing soon, specifically to 
meet her husband. And if Maggi failed to have one the State would 
undoubtedly foreclose on the children—or whatever lawyers called it—and 
take them away. And that, Maggi knew, she could not allow. So perhaps it 
was enough that she loved the babies, and loved John Dailey too. Perhaps it 
didn't matter if he couldn't return the favour. 

She should do it for the babies. That sounded just right to her New England 
conscience. Marry him for the babies' sake. Discount the fact that you love 
him, and he's one hellion between the sheets! Put all that aside. Make the 
sacrifice just for the babies. And soon. Ms Fagan had called again, and 
would be in Dartmouth, for sure, by Friday next! 

'And every time you look at each other,' Aunt Eduarda said as she slid her 
cake pans into the oven, 'it's as if you expected each other to say something 
you didn't want to hear. What gives with you two?' 

'He—asked me something,' Maggi replied. 'And I—just don't know the 
answer. The right answer, that is. I'm still thinking.' 

'Big secret,' her aunt said sarcastically. 'I can read the question on his face, 
and the answer on yours. He asked you to marry him, didn't he?' 



'Dammit,' Maggi snapped, 'he had no right to tell anybody! I hate a 
blabbermouth!' 

'He didn't tell me a thing, dear. Not a single word. He's not that sort of man.' 

'So you just guessed?' 

'An educated guess,' Aunt Eduarda returned. 'I have three daughters of my 
own, Margaret. All married.' 

'And you just read minds?' 

'Faces.' 

'If you know all that much, what's the answer on my face?' 

'No, you don't catch me in that trap. Figure it out for yourself. In years to 
come I don't want you to go around saying that your aunt talked you into 
marrying him! Or out of marrying him. Shoo—buzz out of my kitchen. Go 
watch the children. I don't want my cake to fall!' 

'My kitchen,' Maggi grumbled under her breath, but she went anyway. 
Prissy did much to improve her temper. The little girl had finally achieved a 
pinnacle. For several days she had been rolling over on her stomach, 
bunching her knees under her, and rockingback and forth. This morning she 
pushed and rocked and fell forward—and repeated the exercise half a dozen 
times. As a result she had managed to move a good three feet, all in one 
direction. The baby accepted it nonchalantly; Maggi crowed lik.e a 
demented mother. Prudence, the quieter of the two, merely watched. 

When John came back that day Maggi had made up her mind. She cornered 
him in the living-room after lunch. 'Any luck today?' Maggi, firmly 
committed now, still needed some casual conversation to edge into the piece 
de resistance. 

'Plenty of luck,' he returned. 'All bad!' But he wasn't able to maintain that 
poker face of his. A little wisp of a smile teased at the corner of his mouth, 
and his eyes lit up. 'That's a lie, Maggi. I've stumbled on to something. A 



contact in New York relayed my offering to a man in Sacramento, and I 
think I might have an answer to all our problems.' 

'I'm glad,' she returned simply, and moved over to sit beside him on the sofa. 
Not closely. He was crowded into one end, she took the other, her nose 
pointed straight ahead at the fireplace. 'I've been thinking,' she began. He let 
the words hang in the air. 

'About—us. Getting married, you know.' 

'I know.' 

And you're not about to help me a single bit, are you? she thought. 'It—just 
doesn't seem to me to be a very romantic thing, this courtship of ours.' 

'Ah.' Only one word, but he did move across the sofa until his thigh touched 
hers, and his arm draped itself casually around her shoulders. It took some of 
the sting out of her thoughts. 

'I've only ever had one other proposal,' she said. The words came out 
painfully. 'There was— excitement in the air. Flowers, sweet words—I don't 
know how to take this idea of yours.' 

'There was plenty of fire,' he told her. 'In your bed, Maggi. It can be that way 
every night—well, almost every night, you know.' 

'But you—you think that's enough?' 

'Some things can't be changed. That other time was long ago. You were very 
young then.' 

'And that's it? I'm not young any more, so it can't be—sweet?' 

'What would you like me to do? Get down on one knee? Bring flowers? 
Write love poems?' 



'Well—no, but you needn't be sarcastic about it! Dammit, it's all 
so—businesslike.' 

'And I'd be doing you a favour,' he retorted. 'Two favours. You know you 
want to stay with the twins, and by marrying me you'd be guaranteed that. 
And then, admit it, Maggi, I'd be providing you with a considerable 
service—in bed and out.' 

'There you go again,' she spluttered. 'Sex! Is that all you men think about?' 

'No, it isn't,' he said. His arm tightened around her shoulders. Her head 
seemed to fall naturally on his shoulder. 'No, it isn't, Maggi.' His voice was 
at her ear; the words were but whispers. 'But it'll do to start on. Thousands of 
couples marry without knowing if they're sexually compatible. We already 
know we are. Think what might develop from that?' 

'Oh, lord,' she muttered, wringing her hands. 'I— wish my mother were here. 
I wish I--' A tear formed at the corner of one eye. She brushed it angrily 
aside. 'All right,' Maggi Brennan said through a mist of tears, 'I'll marry you.' 

She expected that he might be joyful about the whole affair. Not so. He 
squeezed her gently. 'I thought it was going to dfag on for weeks,' he said, 
sounding very self-satisfied. 

'Well, don't put it down to your great charm!' she yelled back at him. 'You've 
got about as much charm as a dead mackerel!' 

'And a face to match,' he interrupted. Her head snapped around in his 
direction. He was smiling, and she felt terrible. 

'No, that's not true. Not a bit.' She shifted to face him, and one of her hands 
went up to stroke his craggy face. 'Not a bit true,' she insisted. 'Beauty is in 
the eyes of the beholder. You are truly a beautiful man.' And of course 
you're going to let him get away with all this? You've only known him for 
six weeks. I can see mountains of diapers in your future, Maggi, and rivers 
of tears and sweat, and--' 



'Oh, shut up,' she interrupted, and then settled herself with her back to the 
sofa and her hands folded primly in her lap. 

'But of course I realise that you're only doing this because of the twins.' A 
quick look out of the corner of her eye, and he was still smiling. 

'If it weren't for the girls,' she stumbled on, 'I wouldn't dream of—well, I 
wouldn't. I don't even know where we would live. Or if you expect—more 
children—or anything!' 

'I understand.' There it was again, that touch of cynicism. 'I expect we would 
live somewhere other than hrere, but that's something we could talk over. As 
for children, of course I would want children. And you needn't worry; I don't 
think twins are the normal thing.' 

'And I'd have to sell the farm?' 

'You wouldn't have to do anything you don't want to do,' he assured her. 'We 
could hang on to the farm. Fix it up, put in some modern 
equipment—whatever you want. It's your farm. But I do insist on one thing. 
I'm the provider in the family. I may perhaps not be the best provider you've 
ever met, but those are the rules of the game.' 

'Well, that's all settled, then,' she said in a very small, very subdued voice. 
'All right, I'll marry you.' 

She had intended to ask him to kiss her, but the asking wasn't necessary. He 
pulled her over in front of him, lifted her up, and totally destroyed her 
fragile equilibrium with a kiss that lifted her up off his lap and glued her to 
him, vibrating and shaking with the passions that overwhelmed her. She 
was breathless when he had finished with her. His arms released their hold 
and she fell from want of muscles of her own. 

'Now do I suppose we've reached the end of all the shilly-shallying?' Aunt 
Eduarda, a broad smile on her face, stood at the door. Maggi snapped up, 
managed to hit John's chin with the top of her head, and swung her feet to 
the floor. Somehow the buttons on her blouse had become undone, and she 



could not for the life of her remember when that had happened. After 
fumbling with the buttons her hand wandered to her hair. 

'Yes, I believe we've agreed to a marriage,' John said. Maggi hated that 
laughter behind his words. Hated it, and ground her teeth. 'Haven't we, 
Maggi?' A finger pinched at the fold of flesh just below her ribs to 
encourage an answer. 

'Yes,' she responded weakly, 'I believe we have. Is there a contract to be 
signed, or something?' 

'Maggi, what a thing to say!' Her aunt was really upset. Maggi was 
immediately contrite. But all John did was to lean back on the sofa and 
laugh until tears came to his eyes. 

*  * *That night, however, attitudes changed. John had gone out again in the 
afternoon, something he rarely did. After supper, after the babies were 
rocked away into the Land of Nod, he came downstairs and cornered Maggi 
as she sat in the livingjroom with her embroidery. 

'That's the first time I've seen that,' he said. She looked up from her work. He 
seemed bigger than ever, a tall square threat that loomed over her forever. 

'Something I took up years ago,' she explained. 'When I found out that I 
couldn't knit worth a darn. It tends to soothe the spirit.' 

'The nervous spirit?' 

'You could say that.' 

'There's something we need to talk about. I know it won't be easy for you, 
but—well, it's a matter of principle with me.' 

She set her work aside and patted the place next to her on the sofa. That 
troubled expression she had seen on his face several times before was in full 
spate again. Maggi took a good look, then settled back, her hands folded in 
her lap. 



'I know,' he said slowly, 'that this marriage of ours troubles you.' 

She nodded agreement. What troubled her was the complete lack of those 
little words, like 'love you'. The words a woman loved to hear, especially 
before a marriage. But those were just the words he never had offered. He 
was apparently tied up in those big words, like compatibility, 
propinquity—things like that. Which, she admitted, had a place in life, but 
not first place. So she waited for what he had to say. It almost knocked her 
off her seat. 

'I realise, Maggi, that even after all these years you are still very much in 
love with Robert. I see it all around me. Robert's marriage lines on the 
kitchen wall, Robert's furniture, Robert's wife. That's a pretty terrible 
handicap for a man to work against, and I have no intention of breaking up 
your chain of memories, but—there's one thing that has to change!' 

And I never even guessed, Maggi told herself, horrified. Is it really that 
way? Haven't I gradually put away all those memories? Not forgotten them, 
no. Robert was too much a part of the springtime of my life for me to forget 
him. Is it true? Am I comparing John to Robert? Am I holding on to the past 
too strongly? 

'I'm sorry you feel that way,' she sighed. 'What is it that I must change?' 

'You're willing to make a change?' 

'Of course I am. What is it?' 

'This,' he said, reaching over for her left hand. 'I can't feel right about 
coming up on our wedding while you're still wearing Robert's 
wedding-ring.' 

Maggi looked down at her finger in surprise. She had worn that ring for so 
long that she had forgotten it was there. And now it glittered in the 
lamplight like a tremendous roadblock to the rest of her life. 'I'm sorry—I 
don't wear it as a badge or a token. It meant so much to me years ago, and 
I—I just forgot to take it off. I'll—you have every right to say what you did. 
I'll—oh, lord, it's stuck!' 



'Oh, brother,' he muttered. 'The dead hand out of the past?' 

'No. Stop talking like that,' she ordered. 'It's just that—well, my finger is 
swollen. Soap!' 

He trailed her out to the kitchen. Mike was curled up on the throw rug in 
front of the sink. He moved reluctantly. With great care Maggi laved her 
hand in soap, poured it on until the bubbles concealed everything. After a 
little judicious wiggling back and forth the gold ring finally slid over her 
knuckle and broke free. 

'You scraped your knuckle,' he said. There was a suspicious sense of 
apology in his voice. 

'It's nothing important. Nothing at all.' She rinsed her finger and used the 
small hand towel to dry things off. The gold ring rested in the palm of her 
hand as she looked it over. And then, with the feeling that she was severing 
her last connection with Robert, she slipped it into pocket of her apron. 
'Satisfied?' 

'I'd feel better if you gave it to me,' he said savagely. 'I'd like to throw it off 
that stone wall over in Fort Phoenix.' 

'Not that.' She pulled the ring out and turned it over in the light. 'This is a 
family heirloom now. We'll put it away for our oldest son. It will mean 
something more to him, to give his mother's ring to his bride.' 

He picked the ring up out of her hand. 'Lord, I can't keep up with you, 
Maggi. But when you're right you're right. Only—Maggi—if you don't 
object, I'd like to keep it.' 

'You have no reason to be jealous of Robert.' She handed him the ring, 
which he pocketed. To emphasise her point she stretched up as far as she 
could on the tips of her toes, put her arms around his neck, and kissed him. 
There was no way she could match the enthusiasm of his kisses, but she did 
her best. After a moment of stunned surprise he joined in the effort, and 
from that moment on neither of them had a complaint about the quantity or 
quality. 



It was more than a few minutes before he led her back out to the 
living-room. 'I forgot something,' he told her as he swung her back down on 
to the sofa. Maggi watched as he fished in his pockets and finally came out 
with a small square box. 'I was just passing by a jewellery store downtown 
when I happened to notice this thing they had on sale in the window, and so 
I thought ' 

'John Dailey,' she interrupted, laughing, 'you are the biggest con artist in 
Dartmouth! Just happened to be passing—on sale in the window--Did you 
think I would believe a cockamaimy story like— ooooh!' 

He slipped the little platinum band out of the box. A brilliant baguette 
diamond cast miniature rainbows around the room. The centre diamond was 
circled by diamond chips. It was not large; it was brilliant. It said a great 
many things. Of all the options available, Maggi chose to belive it said love\ 
He deserved another kiss. He accepted what she offered, and then stole a 
few more on his own. There might have been further developments, but one 
of the babies upstairs whimpered. They both jumped to their feet, and, 
holding hands, dashed up the stairs to the rescue. 

'We're getting very practised with teething,' he whispered as he escorted her 
down the hall a few minutes later. 'Now they both have a tooth.' 

'All the better to bite you with,' she said, giggling. They stopped by her door, 
and that excitement seemed to build up in her body again. She shivered. His 
arm tightened around her. 

'Would you want to...?' she suggested, gesturing towards the door. 

'I want to like mad,' he murmured, 'but I've been on a guilt trip since the last 
time, and I don't think I could carry that load until our wedding-day.' 

'Which will be?' 

'How about the day after tomorrow?' he suggested, grinning down at her. 

'You think you can wait, that long?' 



'You think you can?' 

'Hey, I asked you first!' 

'You don't realise what a highly self-controlled man you're talking to. I 
could spend the whole night in your bed and never lay a finger on you, 
woman. That might be nice.' 

'Spending the night or not laying a finger on me?' 

'That does it,' he said, administering a tiny chastisement on her bottom. 'Get 
to bed, lady. I'll be along in a minute, and you'll see just how self-controlled 
I can be.' 

Which I am not, Maggi told herself. If he dares to come, I'm going to jump 
on him! She watched wistfully as he turned back to his own room, and then 
she went in, turned on her bedside lamp, slipped into her long flannel 
nightgown, and climbed into bed. The gown was one of her winter specials, 
something she would never think to wear in the summer. But it covered her 
from neck to ankle, with only a pair of tiny buttons at the bodice. If he wants 
to play platonic love, she thought, I'll give him a run for his money. And I 
won't jump on him! 

So she plumped up her pillow and lay back, waiting. There was no long 
delay. See? the voice of her conscience said as he came in at the door. It's 
become old hat with him. No shave and shampoo this time, babe. What you 
see is what you get! 

Maggi had no rebuttal. What she saw astonished her. Their last meeting in 
the buff had also been in the dark. This time her bedlamp was enough to 
penetrate every corner. He came in wearing a big smile and a robe, walked 
over to the side of the bed as haughtily as Julius Caesar, and let his robe slip 
to the floor. Maggi gasped. 

Never had she seen a man in such superb shape. His upper torso would have 
made Conan the Barbarian envious. His legs and thighs were carved in steel. 
And when her eyes managed to focus on what came in between, she was 



hard put to keep from giggling. His eyes, following the line of hers, looked 
down with a very self-satisfied expression. 

'It is often said,' he pontificated, 'that when God makes a man with a really 
ugly face, he provides him with certain utilitarian improvements in other 
areas.' 

'Dear lord, stop boasting and come to bed,' she commanded. The uneasy 
excitement was building, sending successive waves of anticipation up from 
her stomach to her mind. 

'I didn't say a boastful word!' 

'Just standing there like that, you're boasting,' she insisted. She reached for 
the lamp and snapped it off. He slid into the bed on the opposite side. Maggi 
was still fighting off the giggles as she stretched out, flat on her back. The 
bed was fairly large, but with him there beside her, also flat on his back, 
their thighs touched. A tingle shot up and down her spine. And one of his 
feet ran down her leg from knee to ankle. 

'What in the world are you wearing?' he demanded. 'It feels like a burlap 
bag!' 

'You wouldn't know if you weren't touching me.' 

'I said I'd not lay a finger on you. That's my toe.' 

'Typical lawyer talk!' Maggi squirmed a bit further away. Not that there was 
much room for manoeuvre. His toe followed, worrying at the hem of her 
nightgown She clamped down hard with her other foot, just as he managed 
to push the gown up to her knees. Silence, overwhelming silence filled the 
room for a matter of minutes. 

'Oh, hell,' he grumbled as he rolled over on one side. His big left hand 
seemed to fall naturally across her waist, and then climb up over her 
engorged breasts to her neck. 'What the devil are these buttons for? So damn 
small. I can't hardly get my fingers on them.' 



'That's what they're for,' she told him, suppressing another giggle. 'To keep 
marauders out.' 

'I'll rip the things off,' he threatened. 

'You and whose army?' 

She could feel the bed shake as he made a concerted effort, but the seams of 
her nightgown were precisely doubled and sewn, and without some little 
nick or break to offer the start of a tear he was going nowhere. 'All right,' he 
groaned, 'I give up. Have mercy!' 

'What happened to the entirely self-controlled man? The one who wasn't 
going to lay a finger on me?' 

'I lied, Maggi. Come on now, give me a break!' 

She might have extended his torture, but on this night she was no passive 
participant in the exercises, and could wait no longer herself. Already 
panting, she slid out of bed, shed her nightgown, and climbed back in again. 
Her return was heralded by a grunt of satisfaction. For another moment they 
lay side by side, his hand on her breast, hers at his waist. And then the lull 
was broken. Not in some slow, symphonic way, but with a mighty crash as 
they turned on each other in mad attack, melding themselves each to the 
other in frantic frenzy. 

Like two titans meeting on a barren plain they smashed at each other, she on 
top, he below. Her hand guided him; he entered her deeply and 
compellingly. She rode him as if he were a wild mustang, leaning forward to 
drag her heavy breasts across his chest as his hands at her hips balanced her 
and urged her on. 

So quickly passion flared, and as quickly peaked in rapture. She dropped on 
to his perspiring body, completely exhausted, completely satisfied. She tried 
momentarily to roll off, but his huge hands prevented it. His massive heart 
beat just under her ear. 'Oh, my,' Maggi whispered. 

'Oh, my, indeed. Maybe we should get married tomorrow,' he suggested. 



'I think it takes several days for the marriage licence,' she told him. 'Besides, 
why would we want to spoil such a good thing? Let's not talk about 
tomorrow. Can we do it again?' 

'That cheeky tongue of yours is going to get you in trouble one day,' he said 
with a chuckle. And then he carefully explained what she might do to help 
him do it again. She was a good student. They both fell asleep just before 
dawn, and the babies might have cried for hours if Aunt Eduarda hadn't been 
in the house. 

 

'What is so rare as a day in June,' Maggi carolled as she came down the 
stairs, dressed in white shorts and a pink short-sleeved blouse. It was ten 
o'clock in the morning of June the fifteenth. 

'Well, I'm glad one of you is happy,' Aunt Eduarda called out from the 
kitchen. 'The mister got the babies fed and changed, and then he bugged out 
for the city.' 

'He wasn't happy?' The idea gave Maggi a little shock. Everyone should be 
happy on this fine day. Never before had she seen as fine a day! 

'Oh, he was happy all right, but complained about losing his strength. What 
in the world did you do to him?' 

'Me do something to him?' Little Mrs Innocence giggled as she danced 
around the kitchen table and stopped long enough to give. Aunt Eduarda a 
kiss. The elderly lady grinned back at her. 

'You must remember that men like to think that they're in control.' 

'Oh, he's in control,' Maggi sang. 'He is, he is, he is. Oops! Where are the 
kids?' 

'Outside on the porch. He moved their playpen out there and set your mangy 
old hound--' 



'My honest and sincere old dog,' Maggi interrupted. 'Let's give every dog his 
due—or his day? Is that how it goes?' 

'Scoot out of here,' her aunt ordered. 'I'll bring you your breakfast outside, 
and you can commune with nature.' 

'I've never had a better offer,' Maggi said solemnly. 'You've been a blessing 
to me—to us, Tia.' 

'Go on with you now,' that worthy remarked as Maggi waltzed out of the 
kitchen door. 'You and the children have given me something to live for! 
Scoot!' 

Maggi did. The babies were glad to see her. Both were kicking and gurgling 
contentedly. She picked them up one at a time, offering a hug and a squeeze, 
and a few love-words for each. Mike, stalking over to check up on his 
charges, received a neck-scratch for reward. Maggi looked out across her 
farm, smelled the air, hugged herself gently, and sat down in the rocker to 
savour life. 

It had .been a wild night, a night such as she had never seen before. Her 
breasts were still a little tender; her pelvic bones ached. And not for a 
moment would she make complaint! There was so much more that she knew 
about John Dailey now. The ugly face had disappeared; he might never be 
outwardly handsome, but he was good and kind and exciting. Sex was a 
game he played, and played well, but it was not all of him. He was a man of 
deep compassion, selfless love, hard work. The twins would grow up in his 
care and be the better for it. And me, she thought, I'll grow up in his care, 
and I'll be the better for it too. 

Blissfully she leaned back in the rocker and set it going with her toe. Up the 
hill, where her corn was planted, there was a tiny fringe of green. High in the 
eaves of the barn swallows played. This loving place might not be her home 
for life, but home was where John was, and who could ask for more? When 
he comes home, she promised herself, I must tell him all these things, and 
then I've got to call Mom and Dad and tell them the news! She held her left 
hand up to the sun. The diamond trapped rays of light within itself, and sent 
them back out as scattered rainbows. 



Her dog came over to the rocker and stretched himself out on top of the foot 
that was propelling everything. Maggi offered him a smile. The twins 
squealed in excitement. One of the sparrows had landed on the rail of their 
playpen, and was preening himself in the soft shadows of the porch. Priscilla 
shook her rattle at the bird and laughed again. If there was traffic over on 
Tucker Road, Maggi could hear not a murmur of it. 

Aunt Eduarda came out with a tray, loaded with eggs and toast and bacon, 
and a mug of coffee. Maggi polished it off with enthusiasm, and set the 
dishes aside. Everything was quiet again. She leaned back and closed her 
eyes. 

The car woke her up gently. It buzzed up in front of the house. Thinking it 
was John, she forced her eyes open. The little red sports car looked nothing 
like the battered van. Maggi shook her head and smiled. Henry Peterson. 
Someone else shared the front seat, but she couldn't make out who it was. 
Henry opened the car door, hesitated with both feet on the ground, perhaps 
talking to his companion, and then shut the door behind him. 

Aunt Eduarda came to the door to look, holding her hand up over her eyes to 
screen away the sun. 'Mr Peterson?' she asked. Maggi nodded. Eduarda 
picked up the empty tray and took it back into the kitchen. 

Henry was taking his time, shuffling along like a condemned felon. When 
he reached the porch steps he stopped, and looked up hesitantly. 

'Maggi? Can we talk?' He looked nothing like the neat, suave man he had 
formerly been. He wore a jacket and tie, but the tie was askew. The top two 
buttons of his shirt were unfastened. His camelhair jacket looked as if the 
camel was still in it with him. His handsome head of hair was betrayed by 
the light wind blowing up out of the swamp. The neat blond triangle just 
over his forehead was actually a hairpiece. Maggi, feeling as happy as 
anyone could get, left a little tingle of compassion for him. 

'Come up, Henry. Of course we can talk.' 



He stumbled up the stairs, stopped for a moment at the top, then moved up 
beside her on one of the wicker chairs. 'Maggi, I'm in a tight spot. The worst 
ever.' 

'You know I'll help you if I can,' she said softly. 'For old times' sake, Henry.' 

'Thank you, I needed that,' he said, sighing. 

Her aunt interrupted, as she came out bringing a tray. 'Iced tea,' she 
announced. 'Mr Peterson looks as if he could use a drink.' 

'I could.' Henry grabbed at one of the glasses. 'Oh. Tea.' But he took the 
drink anyway, and sipped at its ice-polished rim. Aunt Eduarda stopped for 
a moment to chatter at the babies, and went back into the kitchen. 

'So tell me?' 

'I thought--' he stammered. 'I thought I could make a killing with the big 
boys. He guaranteed I could get my hands on a lot of bread; instead I find 
that I'm the sheep to be sheared.' 

'He who, Henry?' 

'Mr Swanson. He's over there in the car.' 

'I see. So tell me what happened.' Maggi glared in the general direction of 
the car, then turned her attention back to the young man. 

'He offered me a share in the condos up on the hill. I—er—borrowed a lot of 
money and bought into the development. A lot of money.' 

'Borrowed, Henry?' 

He shrugged his shoulders and refused to answer. 

'And then?' 



'And then I found out the whole thing was like a pack of cards. The original 
backers had ducked out. Swanson dumped a big part of it on me--' 

'But I thought the apartments were selling like crazy, wasn't that what you 
said?' 

'It's complicated, Maggi. What apartments there are sold quickly. But there 
aren't enough of them to carry the expenses for the whole development.' 

Maggi stared at him as she ran her hand through her unruly hair. The picture 
was becoming more clear than she cared to admit. 'And what you're saying 
is that if you don't get a large part of my land, you go into bankruptcy?' 

Henry got up and paced nervously, wringing his hands together in 
understated anguish. 'No. What I'm saying is that if we don't get a large part 
of your land I'm going to jail!''So you didn't borrow the money. Oh, Henry, 
what a stupid thing to do.' Over at the car Maggi could see the other door 
open. Swanson was coming towards them, walking rapidly over the rough 
ground. 'You what, Henry—embezzled the money?' . 

'Not exactly, but close enough. Two hundred and fifty thousand dollars,' he 
admitted abjectly, his head down, unwilling to meet her eyes. 'Out of my 
father's accounts!' 

'Good lord! Does Swanson know?' 

'About the money? Yes, he knows.' And by that time Swanson was at the 
porch. Smiling as always, a bon vivant to the end. He climbed the stairs. 
Mike growled at him, but the man was driven by something stronger than 
his fears. 

'So, Mrs Brennan.' He pulled a handkerchief from his pocket and wiped his 
florid brow. 'We are certainly in a pickle.' 

The word jarred on Maggi's ears. ' We are?' she asked. 



'Yes, the three of us. You would hardly want your young man to go to jail, 
would you?' 

'I'm not sure--' she started to say, and just at that moment the old van 
appeared, chugging away on five cylinders as John brought it up in front of 
the house. It was hard to believe that such a large man could vault out of the 
car, but that was exactly what he did. He waved to Maggi. She could see the 
ear- splitting grin on his face as he waved a paper in his hand and ran for the 
porch. John was just at the foot of the steps when Swanson made his last 
pitch. 

'But surely, Mrs Brennan, you wouldn't stand idly by and see Henry go to 
jail?' 

'I have a suspicion that it's you that ought to go to jail,' she told him bitterly. 
'And I know a good lawyer, Mr Swanson.' 

John heard the last part of the conversation and pulled to a stop. 'I'm sorry, 
love,' he said, 'I didn't realise you were holding a conference.' And then, too 
eager with his news to wait any longer, he waved the paper at all of them, 
vaulted up the porch, and snatched Maggi out of her rocker and into his 
arms. 'I've got it!' he roared. 'I've finally found the right man! Our problems 
are over! Aren't you glad?' 

'I'm ecstatic,' she said, and meant it. 'But we seem to have this problem.' 

'Mrs Brennan is going to sell us some of her land,' Swanson said. 

'Mr Swanson thinks I'm going to sell him some of my land,' Maggi snapped. 
'I'd sooner dig it all up and make an alligator swamp out of it! Mr Swanson 
ought to be in jail—but I think he's fixed it up so that Henry is the fall guy!' 
Her eyes flashed anger at the pair of them. 

'Ah, Henry.' A condescending greeting from the winner to the loser. Maggi 
heard that edge in the words and smiled. John put his arm around her waist 
and, with his other hand, lifted her left hand again so that the other two men 
could see her engagement ring. 



Henry Peterson ducked his head again. He was on the verge of crying. The 
high school hero had fallen very far indeed. Mr Swanson, on the other hand, 
seemed to swell up with anger. 'I thought you said you had the woman sewn 
up?' he roared. Henry ducked even further. 'And you, lady. You don't even 
know what your loving man is looking for, do you?' It really wasn't a 
question. 

John went suddenly silent. His hand around Maggi's waist tightened. 'You 
know what I was looking for?' His voice was silky-soft, dangerously soft. 

'Everybody downtown knows what you're looking for,' the little man replied 
hoarsely. 'Hell, they're taking bets down at the court-house on what's going 
to happen when she finds out the truth about your little game.' 

Maggi felt a sudden chill. John's arm was gone. There seemed to be clouds 
screening the sun. John moved a step closer to the agent. 'What about my 
Mrs Brennan?' The ice was still in his voice, but Swanson was too excited, 
too enraged, to hear more than the words. 

'Ask him, Mrs Brennan. Go ahead and ask him!' he shouted, almost dancing 
with excitement. 'Go ahead, ask sweet-talking Mr Dailey!' 

'I—don't know what you're talking about,' Maggi stammered. 

'I think, Mr Swanson, you'd better leave,' John said as he took one more step 
forward. 'I can read the future, you know. I can see you falling down those 
steps and breaking your arm. Maybe both your arms. It would be a shame--' 

'All right, I'm going!' Swanson yelled. 'I'm going. But tell the little bitch all 
about it, why don't you? Tell her-what happens the moment you marry her! 
Go ahead!' It was his last defiance. He turned and ran as fast as a portly 
middle-aged man might. Henry, tears in his eyes, was right behind him. 
Maggi, stunned, fell back into the rocker and took a deep breath. 

John stood at the top of the stairs, looking steadily after Henry's car until it 
disappeared down the drive. 

When he turned around his face was a stern mask. 'Well, Mrs Brennan?' 



'Well, what?' Maggi shivered and wrapped her arms around herself. There 
was a foreboding that hung over her head. Even the babies were quiet. 

'You don't know what he's talking about?' John asked. 

'No—I—what?' His face was rock-like, ugly, stern. 

'I told you how difficult it was,' he said in a monotone. 'I needed desperately 
to become an American citizen. The moment we marry, Mrs Brennan, I no 
longer need a visa. Married to an American citizen I can become one myself. 
It's as simple as that.' 

'Simple?' Maggi staggered up from her chair, trembling. 'Is that what it's all 
about?' she muttered. 'The whole thing—the babies, the proposal, the 
ring—and the bedding just to be sure?' Her voice was rising, cracking, as 
she fought back the tears. 'That's it? It's true? You want to marry me just 
to--Damn you,' she muttered, struggling with the ring on her finger. 'I gave 
you everything last night. Everything! Can't you--?' 

'We shared each other,' he said softly. 'Shared each other. It was a mutual 
thing. I don't owe you anything for a night in bed. We shared equally in the 
pleasure.' 

'For a night in bed!' she yelled. 'Is that what it was? A one-night stand?' 

'Two-night stand,' he interrupted. She could see that his fists were clenched 
in anger, but he spoke softly. 'Let's not denigrate things. But, Maggi, you 
knew--' 

'I didn't know a thing. Not a thing. You've never ever met a woman as stupid 
as I am! We can't marry, Mr Dailey. To be married requires the involvement 
of two hearts, and you haven't one to involve, have you? Take your ring and 
get out of here!' 

'If you really believe all that, it's just probably the smartest thing I could do 
this year,' he said bitterly. She dropped the ring into the palm of his hand. He 
flipped it over a couple of times, then wound up like a baseball pitcher and 
threw it out into the trees. 



Maggi watched it fly through the air. There were tears in her eyes, tears she 
could not stanch. Behind her, John took one step in her direction. She 
whirled round, hatred flaming at him. 'Not gone yet?' she screamed. She 
turned away from him and ran off the porch, headed for her refuge in the 
barn. 

  



CHAPTER TEN 

MAGGI sat on the porch swing, one foot caught up beneath her, the other 
gently rocking her back and forth. The twins, one on either side of her, had 
finally fallen over into her lap and were fast asleep. 

Aunt Eduarda came out of the house, wiping her hands on her apron. 
'Asleep?' 

'For an hour or more,' Maggi replied softly. 'We had a hard morning playing 
ball. They play too hard, I think.' 

'No,' her aunt said, 'you work too hard, caro. Look at you—all skin and 
bones. He's not worth it. Forget him.' 

'No, he's not worth it,' Maggi agreed. Of course he's not worth it, she 
thought. He's been gone six weeks. Forty-two days. One thousand and eight 
hours. And I've counted them all. How's that for forgetting? Sixty thousand 
four hundred and eighty minutes, but who's counting? 

'Not worth it,' her aunt murmured. Prissy was stirring, and they both hushed. 
It was easy to tell the two girls apart now. Prissy had four teeth to Pru's 
three, and was definitely the leader. 

'It isn't him,' Maggi continued. 'There's just been lots to do. Maybe we can 
settle down now. Mr Small called to say that Mrs Daugherty's house has 
been sold—for a fantastic amount, Tia. I put it in a trust fund at the First 
Bristol. There's enough to keep the girls through to college. And I finally did 
sell that top twenty acres to the development people.' 

'To Mr Swanson? I wouldn't believe that, Margaret.' 

'No, not to Mr Swanson. His company went belly- up and--' 

'His company did what?' 

'Went bankrupt, Aunt Eduarda. A new corporation bought up the 
assets—and my land.' 



'And that poor young man—Henry something?' 

'The new outfit kept him on, love. He's at the bottom of the ladder, but if he 
keeps his nose to the grindstone he'll prosper.' 

'Crazy language.' Her aunt sniffed. 'Belly-up—nose to grindstones. Better 
you should study your Portuguese, Maggi.' 

Feeling a little guilty, Maggi managed to slip the book she had been 
studying under her thigh, out of her aunt's sight. Basic Gaelic. It didn't make 
a lot of sense to study Gaelic. He would never return. But after all, it had 
been her fault that he had left. She had lied to the State inspectors; what 
difference did it make if he was shooting for American citizenship by 
marrying her? Six weeks. It seemed like forever. 

They could have been married by now. Happily ever after. Carefully she 
fingered the gold necklace that she wore under her blouse. For three days 
after he left she had spent all the daylight hours that God sent, on hands and 
knees, searching the scrub brush into which he had thrown her ring. And 
now she cherished it, suspended on the same chain that held her little gold 
cross. It was all she had to remember him by. All the treasured memories. 
Not until he had gone did she understand how much alike John and Robert 
had been. Oh, not physically, but all the other ways— tender, sensitive, 
compelling. How else could she have loved John had she not loved Robert 
first? The thought came easier now. Love. The tender trap. 

Aunt Eduarda, who had been studying her niece's face as she half dreamed, 
coughed. Maggi snapped back to the present, and her slight movement 
wakened the babies. Their blue eyes popped open at almost the same 
second. Rosebud mouths formed a little gurgling bubble, then they laughed 
joyously, displaying their dagger-teeth. 

'Healthy children,' Aunt Eduarda commented. 'They wake with a smile. 
Now you, Margaret, always you woke with cries.' 

'Don't bet your bottom dollar on smiles,' Maggi returned, and at that moment 
both the children screwed up their faces and began to complain. Wet 
nappies—always at this hour. Maggi wriggled her way out from between 



them. They had grown like weeds. And never, Maggi thought, did I ever 
conceive that I would have to race my aunt to see which one of us could 
change those wet diapers! 

As it happened the race was a tie, each woman managing one child. And 
after a change, a wash, came considerable cuddling, until Tia Eduarda's age 
caught up with her and she stood up, rubbing her back. 'I need my own nap,' 
she told her niece ruefully. 

'You need your soaps,' Maggi teased. 'The girls and I are going up the hill to 
watch the goings-on across the fence. They're a lot like me—they love to see 
other people working.' 

They made the trip in the two-seater stroller, a recent acquisition. Priscilla 
insisted on riding in front, queen of all she surveyed. Prudence accepted the 
back seat gladly, spending half her time leaning backward far enough so she 
could see Maggi, loaded down with all the accessories needed for travelling 
with babies.  

The oak tree stood on the west side of the new fence. Maggi spread out the 
two blankets and set the pair down in the middle. They would soon enough 
be moving. Across the fence two carpenters working on the roof of the 
nearest apartment called and waved to them. A nearby bulldozer operator 
tooted his horn. Pru jumped at the sound; Prissy giggled and waved until a 
pair of black-capped chickadees nesting in a hollow of the tree came out to 
greet them. Maggi was having difficulty keeping her own eyes open. The 
heat of New England summer lay heavy on the land, and the light breeze 
that stirred the oak leaves brought hardly a penny's worth of coolness. But 
the babies wanted watching. They were both mobile, both crawling, both 
adventurous, and both cooler than she, wearing only a nappy. 

And the more she stared at them, watching, the sleepier she got. So when 
someone called her name from just down the hill she assessed it as part of 
her daydream. But the call was repeated, and the babies were responding 
excitedly. Maggi sprang to her feet, still not quite in control. Looking 
westward, into the sun, she could see only a blob, a shadow, but her heart 
told her what her eyes could not see. 



She stood, trembling, unable to move or flee. 

'Maggi?' called a voice. 

And now she was held back by guilt. John had come back. Angry? 
Vengeful? The other figure stopped. She raised her hand to shade her eyes. 
John Dailey, dressed casually, standing, waiting for her to make a move, as 
she waited for him. No further words. For a moment they stared at each 
other, and then he raised his open arms. After that there was no need for 
words. Forgetting the babies, the audience over the fence, the chattering 
birds, she hurled herself down the hill at him, slammed into his precious 
body, and felt those arms close around her, sealing her off from all her 
worries and troubles, in safe haven again. 

Not until Prissy squealed did they come back to reality. The baby, having 
crawled off the blanket in their direction and rubbed her soft knee on a rock, 
meant the world to hear her complaint. Pru, the more cautious one, was still 
sitting in the middle of the blanket. 

'Hi, girls,' John called softly. He gave Maggi an extra squeeze, and led her 
back up to the blanket, his arm wrapped securely around her. 'All my girls!' 
Suddenly they were all down on the blanket, a giggling mass of people, all 
trying their best to be first in his arms—or any other part of him they might 
grab. A gentle wrestling match ensued, until he pulled Maggi close to him 
again. 'I've been a fool,' he said. 

'Me too,' she echoed. 

'I lost my bloody Irish temper.' 

'We Portuguese have a temper too,' she admitted. 'John? There's something I 
have to tell you.' 

'Confession time?' 

'Yes.' 

'Well, I have a few things to tell you too.' 



'Me first—ladies are always first. You remember Ms Fagan, the inspector 
from the Child Services?' 

'Ah. The one who was coming to take the children away?' 

'I—told her we were married. A long time ago, when she first came. It 
seemed like such a little lie at the time. I loved you very much.' 

'Ah.' 

'Well, aren't you going to yell and scream?' 

'Not me. Did she come as scheduled?' 

'No. Somehow or another she caught chickenpox from one of her nephews, 
and they had to take her off all the children's cases. But she's better now. 
They called to say she'll be here tomorrow.' 

'Doesn't leave us much time, does it?' 

'For what?' 

'Oh, for this and that,' he said, chuckling. 'Now it's my turn.' 

'OK.' She sat up and leaned back against him, nuzzling his chin with her 
curls, making believe it was the wind that gave her the shivers. 

'I finished that little business I told you about. It took me long enough, and I 
didn't dare write to ask you to wait. I was afraid you'd say no. I'd not be an 
easy man to live with, Maggi.' 

She nodded and kept her mouth shut. 

'You're not going to ask me what business it was?' 

'I'm—reformed,' she murmured. 'Aunt Eduarda told me that men don't care 
to divulge all their secrets. That women shouldn't pry.' 



'Men don't care to get splinters when they hug their girls either,' he 
announced. His hand was wandering across the sharp bone of her hip, and 
up under the curve of her breast, where there was still adequate soft flesh to 
attract the male. 

'So I'll eat a little,' she said. 'Now, about that business--?' 

'So much for reform,' he said, chuckling. 'Well, I thought you'd found me 
out that day you asked if I were playing at Finian's Rainbow, finding a pot of 
gold and all.' 

'I don't understand.' 

'Gold,' he said. 'I told you I owned a few hectares of rock up on the mountain 
in Mayo—on Nephin Beg. What's that American phrase? There's gold in--' 

'Them thar hills,' she said, excited. 'Real—real gold?' 

'Real gold,' he confirmed. 'The Germans have been taking it out by the 
sackful. I don't know if there's any gold in my particular plot of land, but the 
Pacific Mining and Metal Company is willing to pay good money to find 
out. So I sold them a ninety-year lease—and we have enough money to 
settle all our problems.' 

'That much?' 

'Well, it depends on who's saying.' He laughed. 'Enough to buy my mother 
an annuity, and to provide each of my sisters with a dowry. So I spent the 
last of it over the boards in Dalgenin's Pub, buying a pint for all the lads in 
Ballydooley. And here I am, with a strong back and a weak mind, ready to 
claim my woman, acushlah. Is my job still available?' 

'I—you're too good a man to be somebody's nanny,' she said hesitantly. 
'Why don't you—marry some American girl and get to be a citizen?' 

'Not a bad idea,' he agreed. 'Anybody in mind?' 

'Well, except for the babies, I'm not doing anything this afternoon.' 



'What a lucky afternoon this is,' he said solemnly. 'There's visitors down at 
the house.' 

'Then I want to stay here,' she said, nestling up against him. 

'Maggi, there's a question.' 

She sat up in spritely fashion and paid strict attention. A woman needs to 
concentrate at important times like this, she told herself. But it wasn't the 
question she expected. 

'Would you come and live with me?' he asked. 'Even if it means going back 
to Ireland?'Come, live with me and be-my love. The old poem rolled 
through her empty head and sent echoes flying in all directions. 

'I know how you feel about your home,' he added apologetically. 

'Don't be silly, John.' She tried to pull his head down to her level, and did 
manage to kiss his chin. 'I love you,' she told him. 'My home is in your heart. 
Nothing else matters.' While he stared she pulled her gold chain out and 
displayed it. 

'You—found it?' 

'It took me forever,' she told him. 'May I wear it again?' 

'I'd like that,' he assured her, and helped to slide it on her finger after she 
unclipped it. And then he grinned down at her and pulled her to her feet. 
Both the babies immediately complained. He chuckled as he picked them 
up, and handed one to her. 'We have the cart before the horse, lady. And 
there are people at the house you have to meet.' 

'No, I don't,' she insisted. 'If we wait long enough they'll go away. They 
always do.' 

'Not this crowd,' he told her. 'One of them claims to be your mother. She 
looks like you.' 



'Oh, gawd!' 

'The other one says he's your father. He's making threatening noises. And 
the other--' 

'There's another one?' 

'A Mr Small, he says his name is. A lawyer. He also informs me that he's a 
justice of the peace, licenced to perform marriages.' 

'Oh, my!' 

'That's what I said. Going to back out now?' 

'We need a licence.' 

'I've got one in my pocket.'  

'You're sure this is right, John?' 

'Of course it is,' he insisted. 'How else can I get to stay in the country with 
my family?' 

'Yes, I can see that.' There were tears in her eyes. Tears of happiness. 

'Of course it's silly, us getting married when we already have two children!' 

'Oh, lord,' she exclaimed. 'Ms Fagan will be here tomorrow.' 

'Late, I hope,' he commented. 'We're going to get married, shoo all these 
people out of the house, get Aunt Eduarda to watch the girls, and you and 
I...' 

'Yes? You and I?' 

'Are going upstairs and get a good night's sleep!' 



'I'll bet we are,' she said, laughing. 'And you'll never lay a finger on me?' Her 
laughter set the babies off, and finally he joined in as the four of them 
hugged and kissed and burbled, and finally made their way down the hill in 
the direction of happily ever after. 

 


